Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 18 January 2019 10:57 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'; SUR
Cc: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF SJM5540M

Dear Gerald,

The post-repair inspection was conducted on 14 March 2018.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 11:53 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ilkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF SIM5540M

Dear Mr Gerald,
Thank you for your email.
Dear Denise,

FYNA. Our Ref: CS/LPC18001724/Ntd3s2

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January, 2019 11:38 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: adrianling@lkkauto.com; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF SIM5540M

Dear Catherine,

Kindly let us have your reply as soon as possible.
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Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
50 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all ©Hew" lonpac.com.sg

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Sent: Thursday, 6 December, 2018 3:28 PM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'mt_claim@lonpac.com'; 'adrianling@Ilkkauto.com'
Subject: FW: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF SIM5540M

Dear Catherine,

Please check with the attending surveyor if there was any post-repair inspection
conducted and if so when was it conducted.

For your information, the third party is claiming for rental of vehicle for 52 days.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Sent: Monday, 26 November, 2018 9:09 AM
To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'mt_claim@lonpac.com'

Subject: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF SJM5540M

Our Ref : 17/18/18/VP05/020349
Dear Catherine,
We are in receipt of the final bill from the third party (copy attached).

We understand that Mohamad Taufikh had earlier conducted the pre-
repair survey.

Please advise if the cost of repair was agreed and finalized with the workshop.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh



Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



