Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 April 2018 1:04 PM

To: ‘David Ang'

Cc: Admin A; assignments; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/CT118001702/Uus3, ACCIDENT ON : 25/01/18, INVOLVING

CLIENT'S (SKS 9626 E) & THIRD PARTY (GBA 7383 U) INSURED BY CHINA TAIPING,
ALONG LORONG 2 TOA PAYOH TOWARDS P.I.E. *** LKK REF - CC6/CTI18001702/Uus3
Attachments: 2018-02-22-PHOTO-00000101.jpg

"Without Prejudice"

Dear David,

Enclosed herewith accident scene photo provided by our insured driver.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: David Ang [mailto:hupmotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 April 2018 12:24 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)
<MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/CT118001702/Uus3, ACCIDENT ON : 25/01/18, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKS 9626 E) &
THIRD PARTY (GBA 7383 U) INSURED BY CHINA TAIPING, ALONG LORONG 2 TOA PAYOH TOWARDS P.I.E. *** LKK REF -
CC6/CT118001702/Uus3

Please forwards us your insured driver scene photo, as you agree to send me,

On 12 April 2018 at 12:07, David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Thin Thin,

Noted with Thanks, Please take note client's only give (7) days to us,

Virus-free. www.avg.com

On 12 April 2018 at 12:04, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

"Without Prejudice"



Dear David,

We acknowledge your email below.

Please be inform that we have convey your message to our Principal and we are still pending for further instruction.

We will follow up with our Principal and will revert back to you in due course.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: David Ang [mailto:hupmotor@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 11 April 2018 5:38 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@l|kkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/CT118001702/Uus3, ACCIDENT ON : 25/01/18, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKS 9626 E) &
THIRD PARTY (GBA 7383 U) INSURED BY CHINA TAIPING, ALONG LORONG 2 TOA PAYOH TOWARDS P.I.E. *** LKK REF -
CC6/CTI118001702/Uus3

Dear Thin Thin,



We had waited some time, as yours don't come back & reply to us, for your info, if we did not hear from yours by the
next (7) days, client's will hand over her claims to her solicitors to assist & proceed the necessary action,

On 7 March 2018 at 14:05, David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Thin Thin,

Thank for your reply, we are unable to accept your reply, after consult with our solicitors, as both
party had no video footage, but our client's still can provide few copy clear photos to show that
your insured van was in our client's lane, base on this, kindly reconsider our client's claims in 50 to
50, base on our subject,

On 6 March 2018 at 18:55, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

"Without Prejudice"

Dear David,

ACCIDENT ON 25/01/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GBA 7383U AND SKS 9626E

We refer to the below matter.

Our insured has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the negligence of your client.

Our insured vehicle was travelling along the main road and your client vehicle turning out from minor road and
collided onto our insured vehicle.

Attached herewith our insured’s sketch plan for your perusal.

Under such a circumstances, we are denying liability and unable to look into your client’s claim, unless you have
concrete evidence to prove otherwise.



Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 9:10 AM

To: 'David Ang' <hupmotor@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@l|kkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/CTI118001702/Uus3, ACCIDENT ON : 25/01/18, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKS 9626 E) &
THIRD PARTY (GBA 7383 U) INSURED BY CHINA TAIPING, ALONG LORONG 2 TOA PAYOH TOWARDS P.I.E. *** LKK
REF - CC6/CTI118001702/Uus3

"Without Prejudice”

Dear Mr David,

We refer to the below matter.

Please be inform that we are still pending for our Principal instruction.

We will follow up with our Principal and will revert back to you.



Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: David Ang [mailto:hupmotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Saturday, 3 March 2018 5:20 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine @lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/CT118001702/Uus3, ACCIDENT ON : 25/01/18, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKS 9626 E) &
THIRD PARTY (GBA 7383 U) INSURED BY CHINA TAIPING, ALONG LORONG 2 TOA PAYOH TOWARDS P.I.E. *** LKK
REF - CC6/CT118001702/Uus3

Dear Thin Thin,

Any reply & outcome for us ? Please revert,

Virus-free. www.avg.com

On 2 February 2018 at 15:59, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

"Without Prejudice"

Dear David,



We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is unclear for the
above mentioned case. There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith is
a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we
will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until
you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV footage / accident scean photos / evidence in order to seek further
instruction from our principal.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 February 2018 11:53 AM

To: 'David Ang' <hupmotor@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine @lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/CTI118001702/Uus3, ACCIDENT ON : 25/01/18, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKS 9626 E)




& THIRD PARTY (GBA 7383 U) INSURED BY CHINA TAIPING, ALONG LORONG 2 TOA PAYOH TOWARDS P.L.E. *** LKK
REF - CC6/CTI118001702/Uus3

Dear David,

We acknowledge your email below.

We will look into the matter and will revert back to you in due course.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: David Ang [mailto:hupmotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 February 2018 11:47 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine @lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@l|kkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/CT118001702/Uus3, ACCIDENT ON : 25/01/18, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKS 9626 E) &
THIRD PARTY (GBA 7383 U) INSURED BY CHINA TAIPING, ALONG LORONG 2 TOA PAYOH TOWARDS P.I.E. *** LKK
REF - CC6/CT118001702/Uus3

Dear Thin Thin,

Attach our letter of demand, final bill, GIA third party insurer search fee & owner authorisation
letter for your reference & attention, Please let us have your settlement soonest, we will forwards
the original documents to you by mail. Kindly acknowledge receipt,



On 29 January 2018 at 15:14, Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear David,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s GIA report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Thin Thin at 6841 2360.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: David Ang [mailto:hupmotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 26 January 2018 6:30 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin-B <admin-b@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine @lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Marcus Chua
(LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 25/01/18, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKS 9626 E) & THIRD PARTY (GBA 7383 U) INSURED
BY CHINA TAIPING, ALONG LORONG 2 TOA PAYOH TOWARDS P.I.E.

Dear Sirs,



Attach our estimate bill, GIA third party insurer search fee, owner GIA report & log card for your
reference & attention,

Kindly revert & confirm client's third party claims liability, reference & OIC, as we are looking for
direct settlement,

For your info, We had assign your in-house surveyor (Mr Marcus Chua) to survey client's
damage vehicle on : 29/01/18

Best Regards
David Ang

Tel : 6784 0039, Fax : 6784 0076
HP : 9815 4655

Hup Motor Trading & Service

Blk 9004 Tampines St 93
#01-120

Singapore 528838

Best Regards
David Ang

Tel : 6784 0039, Fax : 6784 0076
HP : 9815 4655

Hup Motor Trading & Service

Blk 9004 Tampines St 93
#01-120

Singapore 528838

Virus-free. www.avg.com



Best Regards
David Ang

Tel : 6784 0039, Fax : 6784 0076
HP : 9815 4655

Hup Motor Trading & Service
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93
#01-120

Singapore 528838

Best Regards
David Ang

Tel : 6784 0039, Fax : 6784 0076
HP : 9815 4655

Hup Motor Trading & Service
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93
#01-120

Singapore 528838

Best Regards
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David Ang

Tel : 6784 0039, Fax : 6784 0076
HP : 9815 4655

Hup Motor Trading & Service
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93
#01-120

Singapore 528838

Best Regards
David Ang

Tel : 6784 0039, Fax : 6784 0076
HP : 9815 4655

Hup Motor Trading & Service
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93
#01-120

Singapore 528838

Best Regards
David Ang

Tel : 6784 0039, Fax : 6784 0076
HP : 9815 4655

Hup Motor Trading & Service
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93
#01-120

Singapore 528838
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