1/26/2018 Mail - Naz@lkkauto.com

AIG Claim No: 1801164929SG ; SLB 9121Y D.O.A. 1/1/2018 (OD Engine

Damage Claim Case)

Naz (LKKAuto)

Thu 18/1/2018 12:34 PM

Sent Items

To: Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>;

Cc:Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>;

Dear Ms Priscilla,

| have received the assignment and will proceed with the investigation.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Naz| Technical Investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 7:13 PM

To: Naz (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: SLB9121Y OD / 1801164929SG - Engine Damage not payable

Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Sim, Priscilla-LK" <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Date: 16 January 2018 at 14:28:02 GMT+8

To: "Bryan Ang (bryanang@lkkauto.com)" <bryanang@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SLB9121Y OD / 1801164929SG - Engine Damage not payable

Hi Bryan

We need LKK’s involvement i.e. obtained detailed accident report and engine damage
consequential losses

https://outlook.office.com/owa/?realm=Ilkkauto.com&exsvurl=1&ll-cc=18441&modurl=0&path=/mail/search
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