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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Love Blanc <loverueblanc@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 February, 2018 11:37 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: My Vehicle no: SKA8887U

Hi Vic, 

Thank you for your response. 

Please let me know the outcome before you proceed to allow any claims. 

Please access properly and do not allow them to over or misclaim any to their benefit. 

If is not a significant sum I would most likely go for a private settlement. 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

Jasmine Png 

96688021 

Sent from my iPhone 

 

On 6 Feb 2018, at 2:09 PM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Jasmine, 
 

We refer to your below email and to our telephone conversation earlier. 
  
Please be informed that we are still in the midst of finalizing the cost of repair to the claimant’s vehicle. 
  
We will get back to you for an update in due course. 
  
Thank you. 
  

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or 
distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you 
received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and 
all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all 
attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
  
  

From: Love Blanc [mailto:loverueblanc@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 26 January, 2018 11:30 PM 
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To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: My Vehicle no: SKA8887U 

  
Hi Siti, 

 

Thank you for calling earlier. 

The following are photos of the opposite party car. 

Please have a look as a reference when they claim. There were no bang sound when i jam brake in 

time so I am really not sure if this is cause by me or the old lady who rented this car cause this 

damage herself and take me as a scapegoat. When the incident happen she drove off and I get no 

chance to even see if my car did rub into her car until I horn her to stop her car at the side but I’ve file 

in my explanation in report briefly.  

Please inspect carefully & do not allow them to overclaim.  

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

Jasmine Png 
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Sent from my iPhone 


