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"s‘ CYS Automobile Services Pte Ltd

ROC Reg No ADSO412001E

G5T Rog ND 20-D105041-E

MA L PRAVIN KUMAR POLICY NO THIRD PARTY CLAINMS
83 FLORA DRIVE YOUR REF GBA 3280 U (AXA)
£02.35 SINGAPORE 505887 OUR REF TP 5867
VECHICLE NO FRA 3559 G
MAKEMODEL YAMAHA SPARK
DATE OF ACCIDENT 241217
SURVEY BY DATE 230118
1 SET FAIRING ASSY S5-dt §S P« 42500 _—
1 SET REAR BUMPER V5 35000 5
1 PC  TAILLAMP A 13500
1 PC  REAR EXHAUST RIM A1 2000 ir
1 PC REAR FENDER & qm00 —
1 PC REAR RIM SHAFT A4 a500
1 PC REAR RIM BEARING iy 3800
1 PC SWING ARM Lffrst 36500 37
1 PC REAR KEY SET LOCK ASSY 1 e:.-%?’ A1
5% 1823
LESS  10% 182 30
5§ 164070 :
/.‘_;..f-#
1 PC REAR NO, PLATE . , S84/ w00 SNETT
1 PC REAR BOX (4 fe—esrnsooo ¥
! PC  REAR BOX BRACKET 14710000 3 ~
1 PC REARTYRE 14 12000 >
1 PC SWING ARM BUSH Aen 3500 &
5% 47300
TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTION S5 BOOOK
LABOUR GHARGES 480 00 9129
58 257470
ﬁ %)
SIN POLLARS TWO THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED SEVENTY-THREE AND GENTS 5 Y ONLY

YOUR FAITHFULLY

Na # M(:

CESPTELTD © A B
Sk &

P e |

Dt 1 @O7T-1T Adrmiraity | i Park Singepose TATTOO
Tel: 6719 2098 (1 Lines) Fax: 219 2086 E-mail: cysauto@singnet com.sg
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MR L PRAVIN KUMAR
83 FLORA DRIVE
#02-36 SINGAPORE 506887
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CYS Automobile Services Pte Ltd

GST Reg, NO: 20-0105041-E

: THIRD PARTY CLAIMS
. GBA 8280 U (AXA)

TP 5862
FBA 3559 G

: YAMAHA SPARK
1 241217

23.01.18
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Tel: 6219 2098 (3 Lines) Fax: 6219 2096 E-mail: cysauto@singnet.com.sg
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*ARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 1 of 2

Enﬁuire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner |D; £344C
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: FBA3559G
Vehicle to be Exparted: Mo

Intended De-registration 30 Jan 2018
Date:

Vehicle Make: YAMAHA
Vehicle Model: SPARK 135 M
Primary Colour: Blue
Manulacturing Year: 2006

Engine No,: S5YP710413
Chassis No.: 5YP710413
Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value: $185300
Original Registration Date: 17 Apr 2006
First Registration Date: 17 Apr 2006
Transfer Count: 4

Actual ARF Pald: £278.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 31 Mar 2021
COE Category: D - Motorcycle
COE Period{Years): 5

PQP Paid: $3.280.00
COE Rebate Amount: $2079.00
Total Rebate Amount: $2,079.00
Message

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when
the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier,

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Jan 2018

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDeregInput ?ZFUNCTION_ID=F0304009... 30-Jan-18
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Ju: Irene (LKKAuto)

From: CYSAUTO <cysauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 12:36 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuUto)

Subject: FW: Acknowledgment  Your ref : FBA3559G  Our ref : STMO0645MC/TE -
DEMAND LETTER

Attachments: GIA RECEIPT.tif; GIA FEES.tif

Dear Ms Joy Irene, WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Artached herewith supporting documents for your attention.

We have instruction to settle as follow:

Cost of Repair 5 1,070.00(inclusive G5T)

Loss of Use (4daysX$30) 5 120.00(recommend 3days+arrangement)
GIA Fees 5 2.00(as claimed)

TOTAL 51,192.00

Kindly confirm. Thanks and look forward for your reply.

CYS Automobile Services Pte Ltd
Ms Tee Wee Sin

Tel: 62192098 Fax: 62192096
Email: cysauto@singnet.com.sg

——Driginal Message-—-

From: namrata.dhiwar@axa.com.sg [mailto:namrata.dhiwar@axa.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, January 24, 2018 9:47 AM

To: CYSAUTO <cysauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: TAY Ernest <ernest.tay@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Acknowledgment Your ref : FBA3559G Our ref : STM00645MC/TE

Dear Sir Without Prejudice

We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop, We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list below to
conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

List of our motor surveyors:-

Lee Wee Ho/Billy Loh/ Sani /Mohamed Anwwar (AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd)
Hari Haran/Patrick Ng/ Patrick Favacho Gerard / Mohamad Affandi [AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd)
Mohd Fadhilah Bin Osman/ Derek Oh Siong Wee (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)
Mohd Noh Bin Sapoh/ Stan See Chee Seng (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)

Ricky Teng/ Elgene Teng (RT Appraisal Pte Ltd)

Elson Teng/ Michael Chong (RT Appraisal Pte Ltd)

Simon Ho/ Mohammed Rasul (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)

Ma Chin Fook/ Adrian Ling/ Chua Weijie (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)

Kenneth Kong/ Marcus Chua/ Hendry Ng (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)

Gerard Favacho (A-PAC Investigation Solutions Pte Ltd)

HOENOnA WM

o



Please let us know within two (2) warking days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate quotation in
order for our surveyor to complete the pre repair survey.

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand In light of one cause of action,
save as to costs and expenses.

Please send your reply to the in-charge claim handler who is copied in this email.

Regards,

Namrata Dhiwar

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



.Inz Irene !LKK.Autn!

From: Joy Irene [LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 4:39 PM

To: ‘[feng@singnet.com.sg’

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 9280U AND FBA 3559G ALONG HOUGANG AVE 10 ON

24 12.2!!:!1:!r 1B45HRS

JIN FENG MACHINERY WORKS
Policy Holder

ATTENTION : Ms. Angie

Dear Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18001551/Ujb3
YOUR REF : GBA 9280U

1
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 9280U AND FBA 3559G ALONG HOUGANG AVE 10 ON 24.12.2018 1845HRS

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by
your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD, acting on behalf of the owner of
FBA 3559G against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had rear-ended the Third
Party vehicle FBA 3559G. As such, liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against
your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct
of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7
days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to

joyirene@|kkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at AXA's reporting centre.

The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)



* Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)
* |f you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to
keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA's prior
knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the
final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact the undersigned.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

All contents of this emall is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.|f you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.



WITHOUT PREJUDICE to :
(&) Insurers’ Subregaleda Clium anyior
(b) Any Personal Injury Cimms
. [Mote This Notice supergedes and inconsisiencies
found in this Discharge Voucher]

AUTHORISATION TO ACT .

L Prvia Bumer (“the third party claimant”) of __t3 Fwen  Duive
#03-3L  Sow, \DLRPR (address), owner of FRAINXAG (vehicle no.) hereby
anthorize __ CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD (the workshop™) to act for
me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or of use (“claim") for my
wmdum.mmmewmmmmm:mJﬂ:mmM
(date) along Howgand A 1o (Idcation) involving vehicle
nols GEA F2um (“the accident”).

I further autharize the workshop to settls my above mentioned claim in 2 manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to of my claim with
payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach dn my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other
vehicle/s is concerned.

paedthis_ L4 (dayyof__'%  (month)20!} (year)

.f/
%ﬂtﬁemmmw

(with company stamp if applicable)




M redefining /insurance

CLAIM REF  : 57MDOB45 L e ral Injury C
INSURED : JIN FENG MACHINERY WORKS A - ' i

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
We/l L PRAVIN KUMAR NRIC No. 59246344C hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars | ONE
THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED NINETY TWO ONLY | (5§ 1192.00 | paid to us/me by AXA

INSURANCE PTE LTD as full and final settlement of all claims of whatever kind including damages far
personal injuries and damages to property that we/| may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE
LTD ar their insured ar the driver of motor vehicle no. |GBA 92804] as a result of an accident along
[HOUGANG AVE 10] on [24/12/2017] of which we/l weref/was the driver/ owner/ hirer/
passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer of motor vehicle no. [FBA 3559G].

We/l hereby declare that the said Insurer or owner and/or driver of Insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s] whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver af vehicle no. [GBA 9280u] in connection directly ar
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l arefam the person(s) entitled to receive the above sasttlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlemant.

It is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. [GBA 92804]

Dated this he dayof ___ 2% 2018
Claimant’s Signature : L PRAVIN KUMAR i
NRIC no./ Company Stamp 1592463440 2
Occupation/ Business : ~
Address : 85 Flvey,  Dugyq %M03-Th 3L §F )
Iy -
Telephone No. ; = NP
Witness's Name : Jey e
Witness’s Signature )
td
Witness's NRIC Na,
Tel: 62149 .:,__!_".-.1 -I ' '--_- ,&: 19 2008

A Insurance Pie Ltd (Company Reg. Mo, 198903512M)

B Sheinn Wy, #2401 AXA Tower, Srgapore DSRA11
Customer Canire #5101

Tei: +85 BR80 2888 Far +85 B338 7577 Wehsits: www, 223 c0m 5§



TAX INVOICE
Invoice No |
|
M/S AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD POLICY NO |
B SHENTOM WAY OUR REF
#27-01 AXA TOWER VEHICLE NO [
SINGAPORE 0BBB11 MAKEMODEL
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT. DATE OF ACCIDENT |
DATE
SURVEY BY
|
TO AGREE AT THE SUM AT
GST 7%

SIN DOLLARS: ONE THOUSAND AND SEVENTY ONLY

YOURS FNTHLULLY.

—
FO S AUTD WEJLE_EEWW%TD

- |

|

CYS Automobile Servicgs Pte Ltd

ROC Reg. Mo :AD5041/2001E

N EERKERB AR
——

GST Reg. NO: 20-0105041-E

7695

: THIRD PARTY CLAIM
: TP 5862

: FBA3S58 G

: YAMAHA SPARK

: 24-Dec-17

: 03-Jan-19

1,000.00
70.00

1,070.00

38 Woodlands Industrial Park East 1 #07-17 Admiralty Industrial Park Singapore 757700

Tel: 6219 2098 (3 Lines) Fax: 6218 2096 E-mail: cysauto@singnet.

com.sg



[nvoice

Page | of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 8224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday 8am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-1B-011888
Date of Requast: 2310172018 Your Rel No; Oniine Purchase
CYS Automobile Services Ple Ltd
38 Woodlands Industrial Park East 1
#07-17, Admiralty Industrial Park
Singapore 757700

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 2310112018

T iy By TEE WEE SIN
T Vehicle No. GBASZBOU
Accidant Date 2411202017
Enquiry Result
[TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
|GBAGZE0U AXA Insurance Fte Lid 10/04/2017-08/04/2018 6338 7288
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded 1o the centre by the members of the Genaral Insurance Association of Singapom
and we take no responsibiity for thelr accuracy or contents and shall be under no llabllity whatsoaver for any loss or damage srising cut of or in connection

with the reports of their images.

T s acomputer generaled documen! and requires no signature

https://www.giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsasé& fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=170... 23-Jan-18




Invoice Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Cuay #18-00, Singapore 048580
I"SUMNCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Feox: +85 8224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam o 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDOS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-011888
Date of Request: 23012018 Your Raf No: Online Purchase
CYS Automobile Services Pte Lid
38 Woodlands Indusirial Park East 1
#07-17, Admiralty Industrial Park
Singapore 757700
Dear SirMadam,
Engquiry Date 2310172018
" uiry By TEE WEE SIN
Tr Vehicle No. GBAS280U
Accident Date 24122017
|DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)
| TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
IGST Amount 0.13
| Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You,

This is & computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
M GIRQ [] Cash [ ] Chegque

htps://www.giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvtp&refid=170... 23-Jan-18




THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[‘o"uhir.:ln No: GBA 9280U {Insd veh)| Model: TPVD YAMAHA SPARK-
[FBA 3559G {TP veh) 136CC
Date of Accident: R412/2017
Global Sum Seitlement | [ [ 1 Yes [ [X] No
Repair Estimate 5 2.7531.86
Final Repair Cost -] 1.070.00
Loss of Use 5 120.00 ddays at $30 00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 days
LTA I GIA Se=arch Fee ' 5§ 2.00
Others: |: El 0.00
-
Final Settlement Sum S 1,192.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [1] YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GlA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA S rio N
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: oe @ resne cena ?

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (). (%)
* Assessed Liability to be fiiled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

Remarks

Paymant Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1} Y5 AUTOMOBILE SERVICES FTELTD 5 1.182.0
JOANMNE LEE KHANG MIN 01022019
LKK Aulo Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Raport! Bill {if any)
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