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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 October, 2018 10:15 AM

To: Autoexcel

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [Spam-pop3] RE: PC 7710 H PHOTOS & SUPPLEMENTARY LKK REF 

CC4/AIG18001499/M1hb3

Attachments: MARKED ESTIMATE.pdf

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Ryan, 

 

Please find below COR recommendation by our surveyor (subject to our principal’s approval). 

 

Vehicle Date Of Accident Recommended COR 

PC 7710H 25/01/2018 L/S @ $7,550.00 with 10 DAYS 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Autoexcel [mailto:aeexcel@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 22 October, 2018 9:23 AM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: [Spam-pop3] RE: PC 7710 H PHOTOS & SUPPLEMENTARY LKK REF CC4/AIG18001499/M1hb3 

 

Hi Vic, 

 

How long I been holding, you chase me for photos, I search and forward you once I found , 

Than your company no reply till I make noise again 

 

By today 5pm no finalize I will pass to lawyer 

 

Thank you 

 

regards 
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Ryan Soh ( Manager ) 

AE Auto Pte Ltd  

AutoExcel Engineering Pte Ltd  

160 ,Sin Ming Drive # 06-01 ( Main Office ) 

Sin Ming AutoCity  

Singapore 575722. 

Website : www.autoexcel.com.sg 

Facebook Pages : AE Auto Pte Ltd 

H.P : 93825367 , 90030857. 

Tel : 64535654 

Fax : 64591698 
 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 9:15 AM 

To: Autoexcel <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [Spam-pop3] RE: PC 7710 H PHOTOS & SUPPLEMENTARY LKK REF CC4/AIG18001499/M1hb3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Ryan, 

 

Kindly  hold the matter, we will get back to you shortly. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Autoexcel [mailto:aeexcel@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Saturday, 20 October, 2018 11:18 AM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: PC 7710 H PHOTOS & SUPPLEMENTARY  

 

Hi Mr Vic, 

 

You waiting for me pass lawyer than finalize is it? 
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Ryan Soh ( Manager ) 

AE Auto Pte Ltd  

AutoExcel Engineering Pte Ltd  

160 ,Sin Ming Drive # 06-01 ( Main Office ) 

Sin Ming AutoCity  

Singapore 575722. 

Website : www.autoexcel.com.sg 

Facebook Pages : AE Auto Pte Ltd 

H.P : 93825367 , 90030857. 

Tel : 64535654 

Fax : 64591698 
 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Friday, October 19, 2018 11:41 AM 

To: Autoexcel <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: PC 7710 H PHOTOS & SUPPLEMENTARY  

Importance: High 

 

WTHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Ryan, 

 

Thank you for the email. 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Kindly assist CC4/AIG18001499/M1hb3 

 

 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

   

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Autoexcel [mailto:aeexcel@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 19 October, 2018 11:22 AM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: FW: PC 7710 H PHOTOS & SUPPLEMENTARY  

Importance: High 

 

 

 

 

Ryan Soh ( Manager ) 

AE Auto Pte Ltd 

AutoExcel Engineering Pte Ltd 

160 ,Sin Ming Drive # 06-01 ( Main Office ) Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722. 

Website : www.autoexcel.com.sg 

Facebook Pages : AE Auto Pte Ltd 

H.P : 93825367 , 90030857. 

Tel : 64535654 

Fax : 64591698 

 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Autoexcel [mailto:aeexcel@singnet.com.sg] 

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 6:50 PM 

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: PC 7710 H PHOTOS & SUPPLEMENTARY 

Importance: High 

 

Hi Vic, 

 

At last I able to get back the email 

 

Please do not lost it again and please finalize with us ASAP. 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards 

 

 

Ryan Soh ( Manager ) 

AE Auto Pte Ltd 

AutoExcel Engineering Pte Ltd 

160 ,Sin Ming Drive # 06-01 ( Main Office ) Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722. 

Website : www.autoexcel.com.sg 

Facebook Pages : AE Auto Pte Ltd 

H.P : 93825367 , 90030857. 

Tel : 64535654 

Fax : 64591698 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Autoexcel [mailto:aeexcel@singnet.com.sg] 

Sent: Friday, February 2, 2018 5:13 PM 

To: 'macf@lkkauto.com' <macf@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: PC 7710 H PHOTOS & SUPPLEMENTARY  

 

                            Dear Sir, 

 

Attach photos & Supplementary parts 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards 

Ryan Soh 
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Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link 

attachments: 

 

_DSC0487 

_DSC0488 

_DSC0489 

_DSC0490 

_DSC0491 

_DSC0492 

_DSC0493 

_DSC0494 

_DSC0495 

_DSC0496 

_DSC0497 

_DSC0498 

_DSC0499 

_DSC0500 

_DSC0501 

_DSC0502 

_DSC0503 

_DSC0504 

_DSC0505 

_DSC0506 

_DSC0507 

_DSC0508 

_DSC0509 

_DSC0510 

_DSC0511 

_DSC0512 

_DSC0513 

_DSC0514 

_DSC0515 

_DSC0516 

_DSC0517 

_DSC0518 

_DSC0519 

_DSC0520 

_DSC0521 

_DSC0522 

_DSC0523 

_DSC0524 

_DSC0525 

_DSC0526 

_DSC0527 

_DSC0528 

_DSC0529 

_DSC0530 

_DSC0531 

_DSC0532 

_DSC0533 

_DSC0534 

_DSC0535 

_DSC0536 

_DSC0537 

_DSC0538 

_DSC0539 

_DSC0540 

_DSC0541 
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_DSC0542 

_DSC0543 

_DSC0544 

_DSC0545 

PC 7710 SUPPLEMENTARY 

 

 

Note: To protect against computer viruses, email programs may prevent you from sending or receiving certain types 

of file attachments. Check your email security settings to determine how attachments are handled. 


