Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 April 2018 11:47 AM

To: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); KKLau

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Your Ref: CS3/LPC17022540/WvbsOur Ref: 17/17/17/VC00/0020234 -Accident

involving PA 7225C, GBD 1785S & SDW 8515K along Upp Changi East towards SG
Expo on 24.11.2017 Your ref: GBD 1785S Our ref: PA 7225C/WL/sy/ch
Attachments: 06042018113318.pdf

Dear Mr Lau/Olivia

PRI and paper survey were conducted by your Wilson Teo and survey report was counter-
signed by Ho Leong Chuan.

However, in view of the big difference in the surveyors’ opinion on the TP COR ($10,500.00
vs $19,350-TP surveyor Andrew How of Prominent Appraiser), the TP lawyer has proposed a
SJE be a member of the SAAA.

May we have your comment?

Our client is unable to accept your offer on quantum.,

As parties are too far apart, please let us have a copy of the CV,
re-inspection fee (if any) and Court’s attendance fee of your
client’s consideration, as soon as possiblec.

Our client’s main request is that the proposed SJE be a mer

Automobile Appraisers Association. /4_:‘:-»

Thanks.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 2:12 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW: 2nd Notice to Conduct Pre-Repair Survey -Accident involving PA 7225C, GBD 1785S & SDW 8515K
along Upp Changi East towards SG Expo on 24.11.2017 Your ref: GBD 1785S Our ref: PA 7225C/WL/sy/ch



Re-send

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 2:07 PM

To: 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)'

Cc: 'mt_claim@lonpac.com'

Subject: RE: 2nd Notice to Conduct Pre-Repair Survey -Accident involving PA 7225C, GBD 1785S & SDW 8515K
along Upp Changi East towards SG Expo on 24.11.2017 Your ref: GBD 1785S Our ref: PA 7225C/WL/sy/ch

Dear Catherine,

Our claim reference is 17/17/17/VC00/0020234.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 12:59 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; 'assignments'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: 2nd Notice to Conduct Pre-Repair Survey -Accident involving PA 7225C, GBD 1785S & SDW 8515K
along Upp Changi East towards SG Expo on 24.11.2017 Your ref: GBD 1785S Our ref: PA 7225C/WL/sy/ch

Dear Mr Gerald,

Kindly provide us the claim number.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 27 November, 2017 10:11 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt _claim@Ilonpac.com>; sur@Ikkauto.com

Subject: RE: 2nd Notice to Conduct Pre-Repair Survey -Accident involving PA 7225C, GBD 1785S & SDW 8515K along
Upp Changi East towards SG Expo on 24.11.2017 Your ref: GBD 1785S Our ref: PA 7225C/WL/sy/ch

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Monday, 27 November, 2017 9:09 AM

To: accident@kscgp.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; assignments@Ikkauto.com

Subject: RE: 2nd Notice to Conduct Pre-Repair Survey -Accident involving PA 7225C, GBD 1785S & SDW 8515K along
Upp Changi East towards SG Expo on 24.11.2017 Your ref: GBD 1785S Our ref: PA 7225C/WL/sy/ch

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear See Yee,

We are not agreeable to your list of Single Joint Experts and we
shall appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for the pre-repair survey

Aside to LKK - Kindly proceed with the pre-repair survey.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: accident@kscgp.com [mailto:accident@kscgp.com]

Sent: Friday, 24 November, 2017 5:32 PM

To: ONG LI LI; MT_Claim_SG; assignments@lkkauto.com; admin-d@Ikkauto.com

Cc: motor@kscgp.com

Subject: 2nd Notice to Conduct Pre-Repair Survey -Accident involving PA 7225C, GBD 1785S & SDW 8515K along
Upp Changi East towards SG Expo on 24.11.2017 Your ref: GBD 1785S Our ref: PA 7225C/WL/sy/ch

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Please find enclosed our 2nd Notice to Conduct Pre-Repair Survey.

Thank you.

Regards,

Chit Yee

KSCGP Juris LLP

10 Hoe Chiang Road

#13-03A Keppel Towers

Singapore 089315

Tel: 6538 3611 / DID: 3152 0989 / Fax: 6538 3708
Email: accident@kscgp.com

KSCGP Juris LLP (UEN/Registration No: T10LL1855L) is registered in Singapore under the Limited Liability
Partnerships Act (Chapter 163A) with limited liability. This message is intended only for the use of the individual or
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entity to whom it is addressed (including any attachments) and is confidential and may be protected by legal privilege.
If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by return email, delete this message and
you should not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein. Please note that e-mails are
susceptible to change and we shall not be liable for the improper or incomplete transmission of the information
contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage to your system. We do not guarantee that
the integrity of this communication has been maintained nor that this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or
interference.

----- Original Message -----

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong @lonpac.com]

To: accident@kscgp.com.mt_claim @lonpac.com,assignments @lkkauto.com,admin-d @lkkauto.com
Cc: motor@kscgp.com

Sent: Fri, 24 Nov 2017 07:56:46 +0000

Subject:

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Sir/Mdm

We will proceed to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle jointly
with your workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached
list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert. (Please see attached).

Please let us know within 2 working days whether you are agreeable to the appointment of
any of the motor surveyors provided to you as a single joint expert. You may select one of
the listed motor surveyors.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: accident@kscgp.com [mailto:accident@kscgp.com]

Sent: Friday, 24 November, 2017 2:23 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: motor@kscgp.com

Subject: Notice to Conduct Pre-Repair Survey - Accident involving PA 7225C, GBD 1785S & SDW 8515K along Upp
Changi East towards SG Expo on 24.11.2017 Your ref: GBD 1785S Our ref: PA 7225C/WL/sy/ch

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Please find enclosed the Notice to Conduct Pre-Repair Survey.

Thank you.

Regards,

Chit Yee

KSCGP Juris LLP

10 Hoe Chiang Road

#13-03A Keppel Towers

Singapore 089315

Tel: 6538 3611 / DID: 3152 0989 / Fax: 6538 3708
Email: accident@kscgp.com




KSCGP Juris LLP (UEN/Registration No: T10LL1855L) is registered in Singapore under the Limited Liability
Partnerships Act (Chapter 163A) with limited liability. This message is intended only for the use of the individual or
entity to whom it is addressed (including any attachments) and is confidential and may be protected by legal privilege.
If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by return email, delete this message and
you should not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein. Please note that e-mails are
susceptible to change and we shall not be liable for the improper or incomplete transmission of the information
contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage to your system. We do not guarantee that
the integrity of this communication has been maintained nor that this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or
interference.



