Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 January 2018 9:22 AM

To: '‘Bazlin Ahmad’; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for SGR1905E against GBB5418L(URGENT)

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE- MARKED.pdf; Preliminary Advice.pdf; LKK SURVEYOR PHOTO.pdf

Your ref: TBA
LKK ref: CC4/EQI18001386/Kus3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Lynn,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a third party direct settlement case.

Enclosed revert of vehicle: SGR 1905E

Date of survey: 23/01/2018

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair

- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841
2360.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 January 2018 12:03 PM

To: 'Bazlin Ahmad' <bazlin.ahmad@egqinsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for SGR1905E against GBB5418L(URGENT)

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 23 January 2018 11:26 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>; Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@eginsurance.com.sg>; Bernadette
Yeo <bernadette.yeo@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for SGR1905E against GBB5418L(URGENT)

Dear LKK

We refer to the above new assignment.
Kindly contact Hui Yang and please find attached both vehicles GIA reports for easy
reference.

Thank You.
Regards,

Lynn Ahmad
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From: Hui Yang Motor [mailto:hui yang motor@hotmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 23, 2018 11:12 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad

Cc: Janet Tan; Elaine Cheong; Bernadette Yeo

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for SGR1905E against GBB5418L(URGENT)
Importance: High

URGENT

Hi Bazlin

We like to appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct this survey.
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*Kindly receipt of this email.

Thank you & Regards,
Bel

Hp: 90473466

From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang motor@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 23, 2018 10:39 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad

Cc: Janet Tan; Elaine Cheong; Bernadette Yeo

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for SGR1905E against GBB5418L(URGENT)

URGENT

Hi Bazlin

Kindly help to arrange surveyor by today as requested on yesterday email dated 22/01/2018.

Thank you & Regards,
Bel

Hp: 90473466



From: Tan Wei Yin <weiyin.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, January 22,2018 2:03 PM

To: Bazlin Ahmad

Cc: Janet Tan; Elaine Cheong; Bernadette Yeo; hui_yang motor@hotmail.com
Subject: FW: 3rd Party Claim for SGR1905E against GBB5418L

FYNA

Regards,

Tan Wei Yin

eq

EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax {{7

~b‘ & Womber of City state (@_.__._S_k — ':.-’D-u"'-'e' g@t [}

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

From: Hui Yang Motor [mailto:hui_yang motor@hotmail.com]

Sent: Monday, January 22, 2018 2:01 PM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@eginsurance.com.sg>; Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>; Tan Wei Yin
<weiyin.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: 3rd Party Claim for SGR1905E against GBB5418L

Importance: High

URGENT

Hi

Please refer to attached estimate and will pass surveyor the GIA report tomorrow.

Please arrange surveyor to survey vehicle SGR1905E on 23/01/2018 (Tuesday) and vehicle already in our workshop.



Thank you & Regards,
Bel

Hp: 90473466



