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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 January, 2018 11:02 AM

To: Aileen Tan Lee Noi; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: KKLau; Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: Acc on 06.11.2015 invlg SHD3205R & SJL7995B (AIG) CDGE Ref: 

T1115/SHD3205R/AT *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG15019076/H1ja3q2 -1

Dear Aileen, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

By copy to Joy. 

 

FYI and necessary action please. 
 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Aileen Tan Lee Noi [mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 22 January, 2018 11:49 AM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Acc on 06.11.2015 invlg SHD3205R & SJL7995B (AIG) CDGE Ref: T1115/SHD3205R/AT 

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
The Officer-in-charge  
M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
 
We refer to your email dated 14 April 2016.  
 
Strictly without admission of liability and solely to wrap up the case amicably at this stage, we accept your offer of 
S$1,232.84.  Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any 
personal injury claim, if any of the taxi driver.  
 
Kindly arrange to let us have discharge voucher for early execution.  Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
Aileen Tan 
Claims Department  l  ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 
Off: 6214 8735  l  Fax: 6214 1843 

 

 

 
From:        "Joy Irene (LKK Auto)" <JoyIrene@lkkauto.com>  
To:        Andrew Cornelius Goh Cheng Chuan <andrewgoh@cdge.com.sg>  
Cc:        CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>, Aileen Tan Lee Noi <aileentan@cdge.com.sg>, Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>  
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Date:        14/04/2016 08:03 PM  
Subject:        T 1115/ SHD 3205R / AG (J) ON 06.11.2015 / AIG: SJL 7995B  

 

 

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

 SAVE AS TO COSTS 

   
   
 

Dear Mr. Andrew,  

 
We refer to the round table meeting for negotiation settlement with our Ms. Hsiao Tong on 08.04.16.  
   
We note that you have rejected our offer at 50%.  
   
In your taxi driver’s report, he stated that he proceeded to park his taxi in a certain parking lot and before he could complete his 

parking, our insured ,moving out from a parking lot hit into his taxi.  
   
In view of this, there was motion from both vehicles whereby vehicles are: one is reversing and the other is coming out from a 

parking space.  
   
In such scenario, both vehicles should take evasive action to avoid collision and both are to exercise greater caution as per BOLA 

scenario 24 (a).  
   
We regret to inform you that we maintain our offer at equal liability basis which we believe is fair and reasonable basing on the 

circumstances of the accident reported and in the absence of substantial evidence to prove that one is in the wrong and fully 

liable.  
   

Kindly re-consider our offer settlement as follows:  
   
   

Cost of Repairs + 7% GST      $ 1,551.50  

Loss of Rental       $    603.48 ($100.58  x 6 days) 

Loss of Use/Income       $    300.00 ($50 x  6 days)  

TOTAL       $ 2,454.98  
     $         5.35  
   
offer at 50%   $1,232.84  
  

 
   
Please confirm acceptance.  
   
Thank you.  
   
   
   
Best Regards,  
Joy Irene | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6749-4274 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  
“Please note the above offer and any settlement arising from the above settlement is on a without prejudice basis, and should 

not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our insured.  
Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in 

respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only.  
No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters”.  
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This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender 

immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.  
   
   
   
   

 

 

_______________________________________________________________________________________________

___  

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you 

are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, 

and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. 

Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by 

ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for 

discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding 

agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except 

as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  

 
ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. 

We encourage you to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  


