Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 March 2018 949 AM

Tao: Zaini (LKK Auto} Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLaw; alfred Toh; Hwang Shiang ¥i

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLT9996U (O ;
SMNM18D00347C02/6) AND SHC2312B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTINB0MZTT/Kkad) en
18/01,/2018

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

LKK REF - CCEICTIlEHUlZ??lekaE
CTI REF - SNM18D00347C02/6 (SLT9996U)

Cear Laini
We refer to your email of 26 March 2018 pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 53,608.74.

We await your payment advice to enable Irene to act accordingly,
Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte Ltd

3 Anson Road

#15-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID : +65 6389 6183

FAX: +B65 6224 T175/6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com

Wehsite: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Dhacloiiner

[ty message is confidviiial, s contents da nol constitile o coyitment by Chima Taiping lesmrance (Simgupores Pie. L. except where provided
for i o written agreement betweert yor and Ching Taiping fsrance (Simgapere) Pre. Lid Ay wianthorized disclosure, use or dissehiination
cither in whole or porthal, s profubited. 1O vau are ol e interded reciient of the mressage. please notify the sexler immedfioneh

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) 1mailm:Zatni@lkkautn.cum]

Sent: Monday, March 26, 2018 5:41 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=

Ce: Irene Tay <irene.lay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=; Alfred Toh
calfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com:

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate= Direct settlement - Accident Involving SLT9996U (Ol : SNM18D00347C02/6) AND
SHC23128 (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18001277/K1ka3) on 18/01/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your ref : TBA



Our ref « CC3/CTI118001277/K1ka3s2

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 9996U & SHC 23128 ON 18/01/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Thic ic a head ta rear collision. As such, liability is down against our insured.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any} would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "COMFORTDELGRO ENGIMEERING PTE LTD" at 53,608.74(all-
in].

The summary is as follows: -

amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) 55,178.62 $3,156.50
7 Loss of Rental (3days x $98.25) 5 29475 §  294.75 (3days x $98.25)
3. Loss of Income (3days x $80.00) & 240.00 §  150.00 (3days x 550.00)
4. LTA/GIA search fee 5 749 5 749

Total %5,720.86 $3,608.74

=*+()3 days recommendation for repair.
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Tainl Kusalnl | Cose Handsr
LK Aulo Consultonts Phe Lid

48212132 | emal Jonidlkauto com | fox: 4741-4108

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 3:08 PM

To: Lucas Lee <lucas lee@sg cntaiping com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cotaiping. com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@|kkauto com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
=chawht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@ lklkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdepl @sg cntaiping.coms=
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5LT9996U (O1: CT1 - TBA) AND SHC2312B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18001277/K1ka3) on 18/01/2018

Dear Lucas,
Preliminary advice as requested.

Lk VoL,

Hest Rogards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LI K Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: G366 tass | enmail: MeiKwanglkkauto.cony | [y 67414108

B 51, Pava Kb bdustrisl Pack, Ubl Avenie 1, #o2-25 | Sla08931)

i




*I . | COMFORIDELGRO

—

ENGINEERING

Our Ref T 0118/ SHC2312B /WT(st)
Your Ref:
Date : 28-Jan-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept
50 Layang Drive 4th Fir
CHINA INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508369
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHC2312B YOUR INSURED SLT9996U
AND OTHER _ ON 18.01.18

We are the authorised repair workshap for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Wehicle No : SHC2312B which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SLT9996U
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 3,156.50

2 3 days Loss of Rental @ _3$ 98 25 perday 3 284.75

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) 3 -

4  LTA Search Fees $ 749

5 GIA |/ Police Report Fees $ -

& Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees 5 -

SubTotal: § 345874

HIRER'S CLAIM

T 3 days Loss of Income @ _$ 80.00 per days $ 240.00
Total Claims: $  3,698.74

We enclosed herewith the following documents 1o support the claims: -

a)  Original repair bill and photostat photographs 8 pcs.

b)  LTA search slip/s of : SLT9996U

¢)  GIA/ Police report/s of . SHC2312B

d)  Letter of authority from owner { hirer / operator
{ ) Traffic Compound ( j Towing/Medical billireceipts [ ) Certificate of Insurance
() Photograph/s of Accident Scene ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record ( x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully
‘Mallhiam Lan

Deputy Manager
CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 8737 Fax: 6214 1843 Email - williamtan@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. Mo signature is required.

- o £ O
COMFORIDELGRO :
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Our Ref: CCYHCTI8001277/K1kad

12 FEBRUARY 2018

ONG YEONG LEE EVELYN
BLOCK 418 PASIR DRIVE 6
H10-303

SINGAPORE 510418

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 99961 AND SHC 23128 ON 18.01.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed 1o negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

Y ours faithfully,

Zaini

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132

FAX: 6741 4108

Email; Zaini@lkkauto.com

cie China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



CDG.VARS. V. LettofAuthorisation

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(MAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING  SONATA SHC2312B , SLT9996U ON 18-Jan-18B 08:20
ALONG PASIR RIS DRIVE 1 TWDS ELIAS RD SLIP TO TAMPINES AVE 12
I/ we LIM ENG HOE (Hirer) MRIC No.:  S1397833F
and/or LIM AH KUAN (Relief) MRIC No.:  S1206B69G

Taxi Number SHC2312B
hereby authorise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd{CDGE):

|, To submit my/our claims for damages, casts and expanse, including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs:

Page | of |

2. To have absolute discretion to agree toany settlement or compansation amount In respect of my/our claim

agamnst third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on myfour behalf,

4, To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the clalm against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly to COGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
"CcomfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 18-Jan-2018

Harme of Hirer LIM ENG HOE

Hirer NRIC S1397833F Signature :

Address 5300 PASIR RIS DRIVE 1 #08-416
514530

Contact No. 98273480

Name of Relief LIM AH KUAN

Relief MRIC S1206B69G Signature |

Address

Contact No, 91524323

hitp://cdgek2srv:82/ Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View ICDGNARS. V. LettofAut...

18/01/2018




policy Ne @
Claimant

Amount

pMECSHE041011700

tlaim Ho SHM1BDOO34T7CO2/E

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD

553,600.00

DOLLARS THREE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED OHLY

1/We agres to Accept the above
final settlement of all claims,

menticned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
costs & disbursements for injuries / damages

sustained by me/us through an acgident invnlving

Ciaimant Vehicle No.
Insured Vehicle Neo.

pate of Loss
place of Accident

IN COMSIDERATION aof the payment made
CHINA TAIFING IMSURANCE
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE

Insured Name
Driver Hame

frem all claims,

present oI

s BLTOG9ED
SHCZZ1ZE

. 1a/01/2018
. SLIP ROAD PARSIR RIS ODRIVE 1

v mafus of the afcrementiconed sum by
{STNGRPORE] PTE. I/We agree absolutely TO
|SINGRFPORE) ETE. LTD. and/or

mry
Lt e @

. ‘ONG YEONG LEE EVELYN
. ONG ZHENG HRO NCEL

future 1in respect af all loes; injury or damage

sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment 1s

made without admission of ltability on the

part of CHIMAR TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFPORE] FTE. LTD:
[1] Global Sum 85 3,600.00
::::’-l::::!-.::ﬁ'ﬂ-:::
TOTAL - & = : . G FRE 3,.600.00
e EmmmmE
CEAME DI AR TRENT
COMEORTICEL SR EUCHNEE RE FTELTL
) 50 LOVANG ORIVE
Claimant Hame . SINGAPERE 5958 HRIC Mo ¢
\iv od
H'— #" %' # o ’ g
Signature | | Date

“Tre conenis of this document ap0ly 10 venicle dameqes any
Al personel inunes and damages aising hesefion &t exciuded

Plagse forward your chogue mAde payable to:

GOMPORTOELGRO ENGINEERING PTE 1T

o the amoi and anofication of this el



CO'MFOR‘1DEI.CJRQ ",'-:,l.!‘!'in‘.:"i.-'.‘_'|t-.’(.‘: Engineering Pte Lid
ENGINEERING

miser of COMFORIDELGRD :
COMPRANY REG. RD.: 1995068045W

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE Page: 1
8010012 VEHCLK, NO INV. NO/DATR
SH(231 7K 91353772 24.01.2018

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO(S) PTE I

SPRTNGLEAF TOWEH MAKK JOB RO,
1 HYUNDAT 305108358

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00

SINGAPORE 079909 MODKI, ODXMKTER RKADTNG
. TA

CONTACT ND: B22773b6 o o
DATE OF REG
04.11.2010
(CHASSTS (XK JOB TYPE

L KMHRT47 VMAATI6097
= Description : 3P 18.01.18

Invoice for Lump Sum Repair

Total Lamp Sum Repair Amt 2 .950.00
Add GET @ 7.0000 % 206,50
Total Invoice amoumt 3,156.50
assued hy - %?IH?E%?%%RN 74.01.2018 09:50:34
epalr Type : CLBO/5T/
Paymenfr¥$§prerm : fUredit 30 days
ol
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
A member of COMFORIDELCAD ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.

Head Oifice:
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 379701

Kindly note that no receipt shail be lssued unless requested.

CUSTOMER'S COPY



Our Ref: CT18010529

comrort
Date: 23 January 2018 = -'”’“—"""__“I
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
Dear SirfMadam
ACCIDENT ON 18/01/2018 @ 08:20 hrs
ALONG PASIRRISDR 1= ELIAS RD X TAMPINES AVE 12
INVOLVING SLT99a6U

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHC2312B (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired o LIM ENG HOE IC NO
$1397833F a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aferementioned accident at a rental rate $98.25 per day (inclusive
of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with India International Insurance Pte
Ltd on a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshap of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully

Christine Tay
Executive, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 8453 3183
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—F 1801001 ET&dispatch=logolf&param=110%278610506537....

1ARIZOIE  hips:ivil.ita.goy 5.9n'llaiwl.'acluun.'hubﬂmrenl TransactionLogs TFUNCTION_ID

*

4

=) [\

Goh Cheng Chuan Andrew Cornelius has successfully logged out.

Your last login date and time was 18 Jan 2018, 15:49:26.

To return to ONE.MOTORING, please click here

Eor security reasons, please CLEAR YOUR CACHE after each session.

Session Transaction History

S/No.Asset Type Asset I Asset Transaction Type Transaction Date/Tim
Owner 1D Amount(5%)
o ;
+ Vehide SLT9996U - 18.32 Insurance Enguiry (GIRO 749 18 Jan 2018/
Payment) > 15:50:12



-
111842018

Enquire Vehicle Insurer
Vehiclz No. Incident Date/Time

Insurance Particulars Enquiry By Agents Detail

Search Status Insurance Compa

sLT9996L 1B Jan 2018/ 08:20:00 Successful Col

Previous

ny Code Insurance Company Mame
CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PTELTD

OK




