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FARF/COE Robme Fngury

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type:
Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vchicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Pawer Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

Foreign Identification Number

B4B1R

FBAS446D

No

19 Jan 2018
HONDA

CB400

Blue

2006
NC23E3100187

JH2ZNC39976M200172

$6,644.00
07 Jul 2006
07 Jul 2006
5

$997.00

Mo

$0.00

06 Jul 2026

Tt e i 2 o S o | e oniong LilniHtobiatiski 'ubl ieBoforelDereg Input MFUNCTION 10=§ 000a00aT |



'|.'1||7|..".*':1'-!=I|I PARE OO Hobate Enguiry

‘«  [COE Gategory: D - Motorcycle

|

COE Period(Years): 10

PQP Paid: $6,36%9.00
COE Rebate Amount: $5,390.00
Total Rebate Amount: $5,390.00

The information cantained herein is correct as at 18 Jan 2018

OK
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= _‘ T ZONE TOWING & RECOVERY SERVICES
T Z O N E B Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #06-32 Premier@Kakl Bukit

IOETTOIEETIE ere coometoun
Emall: $-zonetowing@live.com.sg

TEL: 97297337 Reg No. 53125821A

CASH SALE / WORK ORDER
Q (LB

Svc Date r

Member's Name éﬁ\

M'ship { NRIC No.

Membar's Contact No.

e TBETEALED
Car Maka / Mode! S‘—L@trk.

Remarks (i any)

ADDITIONAL CHARGES
"] Dolly Wheels / Fiat bed
[] Basement/Multi-storey
[ Crane up/ Bogged

[ ] causeway /2nd Link

] Low Bodykit

] Coliection of Key

"] ERP/Carpark

9&5&? bi7SAFE,

Tow Dnver's Nama & Signature

No.T 509456

Tima Racerved

Time Armved

From @ :] g“'\gﬁ
- @t
e W0 B
P NYo)

BODY & PAINT CONDITION RECORD

wmmmrm
beiongings in the car

Membar s Signature

Mote: w-mnm&mmwrwmwhmuMWumm

wihilat baing fowed



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Manday, 25 Febiruary 2019 6:46 PM
To: Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: FW: 79305982755G-003

Dear Chee Heng,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that this case has been re-assigned to Hsiao Tong,

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Thank you

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupeifikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Ak 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>
Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 3:08 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Cec: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 79305982755G-003

Dear Vivian,
As the case has been more than 12 months, kindly let us have an update.

In view of Witness SD, you may reject TPPD claim and submit report. Kindly let us know the date of last
correspondence with TP.

Thank you

Best regards,

Loh Chee Heng

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-18 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 1881
Chee-Heng.Loh@aig com | www.aig.sq

Visir to learn more.

100 Celebrating 100 Years: 5,



Follow us:
MPORTANT NOTICE

The information i thes @mail (and any altachments) is confidgential If you are nat he intended recipvent, you must nolt pse or dissaminale the
information If you have received this emadl in emor, please immediately nolify me by Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any
copias or prntouts thareal. Although s emal and any altachments are believed (o be free of any virus or other defect thal might affact any
computer systam imo wiich i i received and apened. i s the responsibility of the recipient fo enstre thal It is wirus fres and no respansibilily (s
acoeplad by AIG for any loss or damage ansing in any way from ils use

From: Loh, Chee-Heng
Sent: Tuesday, 17 July 2018 4:47 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 79305982755G-003

Dear Vivian,

OlI's witness Statutory Declaration uploaded in Merimen and shared for your viewing. Witness stated OIV within lane
and did not change lane.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Loh Chee Heng

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(078120)
Tel +{65) 6419 1881 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

eng.Loh | www.aig.com.sg

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information in this email {and any afiachments) is confidential If you are not the infended recipient. you must nal use of dissaminala the
infarmation. If you have received this email in error, please immediataly notify me by "Reply” command and permanantly delste the orgingl ond any
copies or prinfouts ihereod Although this email and any attachments are believed ta be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, il is the responsibillly of the recipient o ensure thal i i wirus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AlG for any loss or damage anaing in gny way from its uss.

From: Loh, Chee-Heng

Sent: Friday, July 13, 2018 3:06 PM
To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: 79305982755G-003

Dear Vivian,

Our examiner for injury claim, Joane, is appointing investigator to secure OI's witness Statutory Declaration.

We will keep you informed when received the 5D.

Kindly do not settle PD claim.,



Thank you,

Best regards,

Loh Chee Heng

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

7B Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 1881 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

| www.aig.com.sg

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Tha inforrmalicn o s email (and any atfachments) is confidantial If you ané ot Ihe infended recipen!, you must not use or dissamunale e
irformmatian. i you have received this email in emor, pleage mmediately motify me by Reply ™ comemand and permanently delete the onginal and any
copins or prinfouts thomol. Athough this email and any atfachments are belioved fo be fres of any wirus or other defect thal might affect any
computer sysham into winch i is received and opened, it is the responsibiity of the recipient fo ensure ffat if is wirus free and no respansbility 1=
accepied by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from ils use

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it Is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



Vivian Lau !LI{KAuto!

From: Vivian Lau [LEKKAutD)
Sent: Tuesday, 2 April, 2019 2:10 PM
To: 'kkmotor@singnet.com.sg'
Cc: Hslao Tong (LEKAuto)
Subject: Your Ref; FBA 6446D,0ur Ref: CC4/AIG18001209/Kwb3,Accident involving Vehicle
FBA 6446D & SKV 807Z ON 07/01/2018
Attachments: Ol's witness Statutory Declaration.pdf; Sketch Plan pdf
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE'
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your Ref: FBA 6446D
Our Ref: CCA/AIG1 8001209/ Kwb3

Dear Sir/Madam,

Accident involving Vehicle FBA 6446D & SKV 807Z ON 07/01/2018
We refer to the above matter

We refer 1o the above matter.

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client, Witness
stated our insured was travelling within lane and did not change lane.

We attached herewith our insured’s accident report and our Insured’s witness Statutory Declaration for your perusal.
Under such circumstances, we have our principal’s instruction to deny liability of your client’s claim.

As such, we will close the matter at our end.

Kindlv note that thiv negotiation benween parties on this matter is purely on a without prefudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admizsion of Hability, whatsaever, should he
deemed [ inferred from this negotiation af lerms/settlement

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influgnce on the
issues of llabilit'damages. either party is not bound, thereafier, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank vou

Hest Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | emall: Vivianlanelkkaute.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Bewoied | Ho settiamant

|CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING - B ) |
| Cage higtified (Est Submated | Ag) Asmigned Ad) Rpt Ad) Submitie Ins Auth'ed | STt

§ 09 Jan 2018 | I;E-tlﬁ' 2018 £$2,.700.00 5$5$2,700.00 Hﬂnﬂ-““ For Servey
| _senes | £an Ady At | e Exmates | | view Rt | Cancet Case |

Main Reference Claim Dwtails

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
Insured: Kah mll" Serena. 1D SESIBTTRA

S ABDUL AJEEZ RIYAZ, ID: GOI6B481R
FBAG446D Dote of Loss | 07/01/2018 12:00 - -5

Policy/Cover | 2100418750 (Comprehansive)
TP / 793059827556 e F_m;_;mmu_“};wmn

Pollcy No. |
SKEUBOTL |
(c1 1): S5067000510-03

= Excess: i
Kim Keat Molor Co (HQ) Bk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A, £05-34 AMK AutoPoint, 568047 Ang Mo Kio - Tel: 64833167
AIG Axia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-641%-3000 ... [Handled by Loh, Chee-Heng) Chee-Heng.LohBalg.com

E—

HTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd [HQ) - Tel:
|LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3551 _ [Handled by KENNETH KONG| . [ Final Rpt due 30/01/2018]
|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED o
There are no mall for this case.

view Al |  Compose case mail ||

I

" ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSS view Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complate ||

Due Date Priority  Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo results.

https:/singapore. merimen,com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 14/5/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*FBAG446D (79305982755G)

[SKUBDT7Z]
™

ABDUL AJEEZ RIYAZ

Jan 7 2018 12:00PM

[Koh MeilLing Serena]
Kim Keat Motor Co

Page 1 of 2

Upluad Documents | upinad Photes | Compose New Letter | Uplosd ies | Upiced sudis | View [Visw in Browser | v |
'_ﬁlllﬂmmt Reports 1 par page vl &
EN’L‘I Finalized On | ATG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (SG) Thumbnail | Print
1 (2200018 1428 WMELM KOH MEILING SERENA © | Losa e
Photos/Images 3 per ~1| &4
He | Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) Thumbnail | Print
1 L3/08/18 15:05 | Genersl View © | wacws | 4
2 |13/B8/18 1505 | General View € | loases | A
3 13/08/18 1505 | Genaral View © | Lasrs
4 10818 1505 | General View O | wadws | A
5 13/08/1815:05  Genersl View ©  cowe B
(6 13/08/18 15:05 | Genaral View O | tcsdiec | A
7 108/18 15:05 | General View 0O eaws | 2
810818 1505 | General View D dws | &
{9 [13/08/18 15:05 | General view O | tsdws | A
10 | 13/08/18 15:08 General View D | lades | A
11 | 1/08/18 1505 | General View 0| lmows | A
12 13/08/18 15105 | General View O wors | @
13 | 13/08/18 15:05 | General View 0 | lwdrs | 4
(14 13/08/18 15:05 | Genersl View O | aas | A
(15 1130818 15:05 | @enaral View © | acrs | A
|16 | 13/UB/18 15:05 Genaral View D | tcaeipc | & |
117 [1/08/18 15:05 | General View D | osais | A
(18 |13/08/18 15:05 | General View O weowc | 2
15 13/08/18 15:05  General View ©  eaws | BB
20 |13/0E/18 15:05 | General View D | tesdec | A
21 |13/0B/18 15:05 | General View 0 | loaaws | B
22 |13/08/18 15:05 | Ganersl View O ows | &
Documentation 1 per page ~] &
[No  Relahel/Reorder | LKK Autn Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmail Frint
[t 1159/01/18 16:33 | EMAIL FROM WORKSHOP DD 18.01.2018 2 Load POF
(2 |19/01/18 16:33 | EMAIL FROM AlG DD 1E.01.2018 Load PDF
3 19/01/18 16:33 | NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP + TP GIA REPORT + TP ESTIMATE § Load POF
) 29/01/19 18:47 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF
5 D2/04/1% 14:11 lﬂlﬂhl\'ﬂlﬂphrﬂ.ﬂ“‘lm Load POF
No | Finaltzed On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre. Ltd. [5G) Thumbnall| Print
1 25/06/18 14:24 " GIA Load POF
{2 |17/07/18 16:45 | OI's witnass 5D 3 Load POF

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc...

14/5/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST weset | save | wom |
There are no decument checkhsts canfigured I

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HGQ)

Show Remarks Tor [ Handling Insurer
Hom: Rarrsris are DrIVALE UNINES yOU Shom T (D DIRED pETDES.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 14/5/2019



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg Mo 1ess071s8m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Indusirial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 68256-3561 Fax 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto. com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Fllae Ne: CC#&/AIG18001208/xWB302
Date: 1410572018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Palicy No: 2100418750
Claimant Vehicle £aages6D Insured Vehicle No: SKUBO7Z
Date of Loss O7/012018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 793058827556
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FBAB446D
Maka & Modeil: HONDA CB400, 3889cc Engina Nao: NC23E3100187
Reg. Date: OT/07/2006 (Man, Year 2008) Chassis No: JHZNC38876M200172
Colour: Multi-colour Odomeler: 2560408 km
Engine Capacity: 3899 cc
Market Valua/New Car Price; N/A
Sum Insured (SS): Market Value/Mew Car Price
M VEHICLE AT THE TI E
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabls)! Yes Engine Modification Mo Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 120/60Z R17 Rear Tyre Size: 160/80 R17
Front Left Side Bridgestong 2 mm Rear Left Side Bridgestone 4 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side 0 mm
The above values represent [he remaining lyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 4,859.00 3.224.00 1.835.00 3365
Miscellaneous |tems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 250.00 200.00 50.00 20.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towng 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 5,109.00 3.424.00 1,685.00 32.98
Approved Total (Overridden) (S%) 2,700.00
Nett Amount (S§) 5,109.00 2,700.00 2,409.00 47.15
Global Sum Settlement {S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 18/0172018
Date Inspected: 18/01/2018 Inspected At Kim Keal Motor Co (HQ)
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industnial Park 2A, #05-
34 AMK AutoPoimt
Singapore 568047
Estimated Period of Repair. 4 0 days
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/5/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VIVIAN LAU PEI FENG

NOTE: This report represenis our findings af the me and place of ngpection stated Pemsin. Such inspecton has besn carmed out fo ie best of aur
kncwigdge and abilly but any oifer labiify undee any othar circumstances is horaby expmssiy excluded,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/5/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 “HANDLE BAR Repair 155.00FL “-FL
2 1 *METER ASSY Cracked 1.280.00FL  *1,280.00FL
3 1 "SIGNAL LAMP ASSY FRONT R Cracked BO.0OFL *BO.00OFL
4 1 "SIGNAL LAMP ASSY FRONT L Cracked 80.00 FL *80.00 FL
5 1 *FORK PROTECTOR L Dented 35.00FL *35.00FL
8 2 ‘FORKTUBELA&R Serviceable B50.00 FL *-FL
7T 2 *SET OIL SEAL SET L&R Serviceable B65.00FL *FL
g 1 *RADIATOR ASSY Serviceable 8B80.00FL “FL
2 1 *FOOTREST BAR FRONT L Distorted / Dented B5.00FL "85.00 FL
10 1 *PAIR HANDLE BALANCER Dented BO.OOFS "BD.OOFS
1 1 *PAIR LEVERS Dented 150.00FS *150.00F5
12 1 "NUMBER PLATE FRONT Bent 10.00FS *"10.00F5
13 1 *PAIR ENGINE GUARD Bent 150.00FS *150.00FS
14 1 *ROLL WRAP Torn 50.00FS *50.00F5
15 1 “MUFFLER ASSY Denled / Cut 1,3B0.00F8 *1,38000FS
18 2 *BOTTLE COOLANT Mot Necessary 50.00FS *-F5
17 1 *BOTTLE FORK OIL Nol Necessary 10.00FS *-F5
FeFranchise pant S=SpcNett L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total (S$)  5,190.00 3,380.00
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (S$) 331.00 156.00
Total Parts (S§) 4,859.00 3,224.00
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous liems selected.

Recommended Labour
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No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems

1 TRANSPORT FEE New 50.00 50.00

2  LABOUR New 200,00 150,00

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 250.00 200.00
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