Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Hi Denise,

Esther Tey Chor Keng (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC/AR)
<TeyChorKeng@smrt.com.sg>

Sunday, 11 March 2018 12:07 PM

Denise Tay (LKKAuto); SUR

Koo Yew Chung (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/AR & SC); Peh Eng Hock (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz
Svcs/AR & SC/ARQ)

RE: URGENT - SLQ800B CTP OD - Finalize

Ok. Please close at Lump sum $6300/-, 8days

Thanks.
Regards,
Esther

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: 07 March 2018 08:42

To: Esther Tey Chor Keng (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/AR & SC/ARC/AR); SUR
Subject: RE: URGENT - SLQ800B CTP OD - Finalize

Dear Esther,

Check with Taufikh, offer still remains as Lump sum $6300/-, 8days

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 4:42 PM
To: Esther Tey Chor Keng (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/AR & SC/ARC/AR) <TeyChorKeng@smrt.com.sg>; SUR

<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: URGENT - SLQ800B CTP OD - Finalize

Dear Esther,

Lump sum $6300/-, 8days

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Esther Tey Chor Keng (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/AR & SC/ARC/AR) [mailto:TeyChorKeng@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: Sunday, 25 February 2018 12:30 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: URGENT - SLQ800B CTP OD - Finalize

Hi Tawffiek,

Kindly advise ASAP.
Thanks.

Regards,

Esther
(Tel: 6555-5556)

From: Esther Tey Chor Keng (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC/AR)
Sent: 22 February 2018 15:11

To: SUR

Subject: SLQ800B CTP OD - Finalize

Hi Tawffiek,
Kindly confirm the finalize amount for SLQ800B ASAP, thanks.

Regards,
Esther



