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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Daniel Lim <daniellim@motorimage.net>

Sent: Saturday, 26 May 2018 9:18 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Sayedinah

Cc: SUR; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SFL9959R-OD RECOVERY -MSIG-FINALIZED

Dear Sayed 

 

PLs invoice out asap 

 

Tks 

 

 

 

Best Regards 

 

 

Daniel Lim 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: 25 May, 2018 5:21 PM 

To: Sayedinah <sayedinah@motorimage.net> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Daniel Lim 

<daniellim@motorimage.net> 

Subject: RE: SFL9959R-OD RECOVERY -MSIG-FINALIZED 

 

Dear Sayedinah Ali, 
 
Confirmed $6313.72 before excess $700 and GST @ 8 working days. 
 
Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to MSIG 
 
 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Sayedinah [mailto:sayedinah@motorimage.net]  

Sent: Thursday, 24 May 2018 3:30 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Daniel Lim 

<daniellim@motorimage.net> 

Subject: RE: SFL9959R-OD RECOVERY -MSIG-FINALIZED 

Importance: High 

 



2

Hi Veron, 

Attached as requested. 

 
Regards 

Sayedinah Ali 

Service Executive 

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255 

HP;92992693  DID:67038109 FAX:+65-62535535 

Email:sayedinah@motorimage.net 

Website:www.tanchong.com :: www.motorimage.net 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 24 May 2018 11:59 AM 

To: Daniel Lim <daniellim@motorimage.net> 

Cc: Sayedinah <sayedinah@motorimage.net>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) 

<KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SFL9959R-OD RECOVERY -MSIG-FINALIZED 

 

Dear Daniel, 
 
Supplementary Labour surveyor’s revised to $290 instead of $580. 
 
Please confirmed $6,313.72 before excess $700 and GST @ 8 working days. 
 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Daniel Lim [mailto:daniellim@motorimage.net]  

Sent: Monday, 21 May 2018 5:22 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Sayedinah <sayedinah@motorimage.net> 

Subject: FW: SFL9959R-OD RECOVERY -MSIG-FINALIZED 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Veron 

 

We had sent to Kenneth for finalized but no reply from him yet 

 

Best Regards 

 

 

Daniel Lim 

 

From: Sayedinah  

Sent: 14 May, 2018 4:11 PM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Daniel Lim <daniellim@motorimage.net>; Daniel Jude <danieljude@motorimage.net>; Kuan Wei Loong 

<weiloong@motorimage.net> 

Subject: SFL9959R-OD RECOVERY -MSIG-FINALIZED 

Importance: High 

 

Hi Kenneth, 

Attached for your reference 

 
Regards 

Sayedinah Ali 

Service Executive 

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255 

HP;92992693  DID:67038109 FAX:+65-62535535 

Email:sayedinah@motorimage.net 

Website:www.tanchong.com :: www.motorimage.net 
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