Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & 1A/Taxis/Claims) -
<LeeGek@smrt.comsgs '

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March, 2018 6:45 PM

To: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident on 13/1/2018 involving SHBE 913K & SLK 4172K (AIG insured) Cur Ref:
TAX/0L/18/2084/1g)

Attachments: 01 18 2084 pdf; img-321182951-0001.pdf

Dear All,

We guantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of Repair 55305.12
Loss of Rental 5103683 | 85 daysx 512198 )
Loss of Income $195.00 ([ **3.25 daysx S60.00 )
LTA Search Fee S7.00
Total B $56543.95

We enclose the following documents:
1} Repairinvoice
2] Proof of rental rate
31 GlA report
4] Accident vehicle laid-up report
&} LTAsearch
6] Vehicle Attachment History ** (our hirer took courtesy taxi)

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

—
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Vivian Lau {LKKAutn!

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 January, 2018 3:12 PM

Te: ‘eyap@lioncityrentals.com.sg’

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LK 4172K & SHE 913K ON 13/01/2018

Our Ref: CC3/LCR18001100/R1wa3
23 January 2018
LION CITY RENTALS PTE LTD
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 4172K & SHB 913K ON 13/01/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
vou and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Thank vou

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Partv Claim)

UWE, _SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party claimant) of 60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4,

SINGAPORE 757705 (address), owner of SHB 913K (vehicle no.) hereby authorize _ SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD  (“the workshop™) (o act for me with respect to my claim for repair

costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no. _SHB 913K that was damaged pursuant

to the accident which occurred on __13/01/2018_ (date) along DUXTON HILL  (location) involving

vehicle no/s SLE 4172K  (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to setile my ahove mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit and the
workshop is further authorized 1o receive payment further to settlement of my claim with payinent chequels
being made in favour of the SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without prejudice and

without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

P .
Dated this ___1.) tday) of !'th [iVida {maonth) ED_'I'i {vear)

i W T I' :..\.I
| Vi | ry
| ) | \ g

Latnl )
\ \ I".FI','-.-' .f\ ! I"L //k: _.'..'_.-'I
\‘xri?u’// AR
Signed by “the third party elaimant” Signed by “the workshop™

{with chop if applicable) {with chap)



RELEASE VOUCHER
{ATG Asia Pacific - Express Third Parcty Claim)

“Well, SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Ltd LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for $ 6.450.00 (Global
Sum) for vehicle no. SHB 913K that was damaged pursuant to the nccident which occurred on 13/01/2018
(date) along DUXTON HILL (location) involving vehicle nofs SLK 4172K.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 16/01/2018 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/T confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (*the third party claimant™)
of vehicle no, SHB 913K muke the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to
settle the matter on his/her behalf in o manner that we/T deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of autharity
given by “the third party claimant™,

We/fl further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid for all damages, loss and/or
expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant” after the above said
agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to costs of
repairs and/or rental andfor loss of use pursuant to the damage to SHB 913K (vehicle no.) as a result of the
accident,

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in [ull and final settlement of any claim of “the third party
claimant” pursuant 1o the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without
admission of liability basis,

This agreement is subject w the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive

Jurisdiction aver any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this '\.';] (day) of [\ﬂ'\&\r (:k""” (month) Et'l_l_g_ (year)

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)



@smm'

AUTOMOTIVE

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Lid
251 Worth PBridge Road Singapore 179102
Tael: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoice

Customer Code: 3000063 GST Reg No. ME-B500001-7
CEN : 139004280Z
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD Invoice No. : IV1B0200502
Date : 24.02.2018
Block Unit Vehicle Mo, SHBS13K
Your Ref No, : TAX/01/18/2084
60 WOCDLRANDS TWDUSTRIAL PARK E4 Cur Ref No. : 24094083
SINGAFPORE 737705 Terms : 30 Days
Description Oty Unit Rdd / (Discount) Amount
Cost % Amount
Parts
FENDER BUB-ASSY, FR , LE I.00 % 933.10 (100.00) 5 .933.10 g 0.00
EMBLEM, SIDE PANEL ( HYERID) 1.00 5% 52.30 (25.00 ) 5 1322 S 39.67
COVER, FR BUMFER 1.00 5 455.50 (25.00 ) S ¥23.87 5 371.862
SUPPORT, FR BUMPER LH 1.00 5 82.30 (25.00 ) 8 20,57 S 61.72
COVER, FR BUMPER LH 0.00 5 28.10 (25,00 ) § 0.00 3 J.00
HUMBER PLATE 1.00 $§ 35,00 { 0.00 ) 3 0.00 3 35.00
NUOMBER FLATE FRAME 0.00 % 25.00 ( 0.00 ) 5 C.o0 3 .09
GRILLE SUB~ASSY 1.00 % 335.60 (25.00 ) &1 8390 3 251.70
SUPPORT S/Bn UPPER 1.00 5 364.90 (100.00) 5 364,90 3 0.00
UNIT, HEADLAMP , LH 1.00 52558.90 (10.00 ) 5.255.89 5 -2303.01
HOOD SUB-ASSY 1.00 % 938.40 (25,00 } & 234,80 5§  703.80
HINGE ASZY, HOOD, LH- 0.00 5 57.00 {25.00 ) & 0.00 £ 0.00
S8EAL, RADIATOR TO LH 1.000 § 22.B0 {25.00 } 5 6,20 5 18.6a0
Sub-Total & .32785.12
Lebour
TC REPAIR LH FROWNT FORTION 1.00 % &00.090 Q.00 g 0.90 ] 600.00
Others
TOWING CHARGE 1.00 & 40.00 { 0.00 ) 5 0,00 LS 40.00
TQ CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION 1.00 5 €0.00 { 0.00 ) L .00 k] 60.00
Ta APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON AFFECTED 1.00. 5 60.00 { 0.00 ) =] 0.00 s 60.00
ARER
TC REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS 1.00 % 20,00 {0,000 ) 3 Q.00 g 20.040
TO wasH AND VACUUM 1.00 5 40.00 ¢ 0.00 ) 3 Q.00 5 40.00
T0 BESPRAY FRONT FENDER LH i.00 & 200.00 ( 0.00 ) kS 0.00 5 200.00

[

Authorised Signature
for SMRT Rutomotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1/2
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AUTOMOTIVE

SHRT hAutomotive Servicas Pta Lid
251 MNozth Bridge Read Singapoze 173102
Tel: §5 63311000 Fax: 65 GI3A0247

Tax Invoilice

Customer Code: 3000063 G5T Req No, @ MR-8300001-7
CEH + 1590042808
SMRT TRXIS PTE LTD Invoice No. ¢ IVIBEQZ00302
Date : 24.02.2018
Block Unit Vehicle Mo. t SHE913K
Your Ref Wo. : TRX/QL1/18/2084
60 WCODLANDS IWDUSTRIAL PRARE E4 Our Ref Ho. ;o 24094085
SINGRPORE 737705 Terms 1 30 Days
Dascription GEy Unit Add / (Discount) . Amount
Cost % Amount
TC REPSRAY FRONT BUMPER 1.00 & 200.00 { 0.00 ) 9 0.00 5 200.00
0 RESPRAY FRONT SUPFORT PRHEL 1.00 5 100.00 { 0.00 ) s 0.00 5 1060.00
TO BREPSRAY FRONT HOOD 1.00 § 200.00 { 0.00 ) g .00 = 200.00
FRAMD TOTAL 5 5,305.12
Femark @
Make/Model : PRIUSY

Rocident Date : 13.01.201B

H.8. Paymant by chague should be crossed and
made payable to 'SMRT Automotive Sexvices Pte Ltd',
Mo raceipt will be izsued unless requested.

Ruthorised Signature
for SMRT Butomotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 2/2
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@smm

SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref: TAX/O1/18/2084
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 2210172018

ACCIDENT ON 13/01/2018 INVOLVING SHE 913K & SLK #172K
ALONG DUXTON HILL

This is to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHB 913K is $121.98 per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third 8party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD

for Manager
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SMRT TAXIS PTI

Woodiands Industrizl Pay|
Singapore

Tel: B5 643

Fax 6563

W smt,

30 January 2018

Vehicle Attachment History of TAN SHIN LER (S7046276A)

Wehicle Num Vehicle Make  Vehicle Model Atlachment  Attachment Start Attachmant End Date Return Reaso
Type Date Time Time

SHF330Y CHEVROLET EPICA-2D MAIN 0402014 0220 PM DEOTZ01T 11:16 AM

SHBS50GZ CHEVROLET EPICA-2.0 hAAIN 17/03/2017 032:25 PM 180122017 08:30 AM Vehicle Chang:
SHESTIK TOYOTA PRILSA MAIN 190127201 7-04:30 PM

SHBE3806S  CHEVROLET EPICA-20 COURTESY 0UDXZ017 04:01 PM 1400372017 12:00 PM

EHB5434T CHEVROLET  EPICA-20 COURTESY 290032017 1028 AM  DS/D4/2017 1215 PM

SHETZ22U TOYOTA PRIUS COURTESY 291172017 03:35PM  18/12/2017 .08 46 AN

SHF440L TOYOTA PRILUS CCLURTESY 1701201610035 AM  22/071/2018 0331 PM

Pa
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1H1ER2NIE Wehicle Hub

Enquire Transaction History
Transaction History Details

Log Date/Timo: 16 Jan 2018 /09:01:27
Asgsel Type: Wohicle Transaction Amounti:
Asset 10: SLEA1T 2K
1832 Insurance Enguiry (GIRG Ch
! : annek
Transaction Type: Payment]
User ID: ESASBAMO- BALOISH BINTEABDUL  Business Transaction
e HALIL Feference Mo.
Search Date / Time: 13 Jan 2018 20:05:00
Insurance Compariy: AIG ASIAPACIFIC INSURAMNCE PTE. LTD:

i
Informationdisplaved 1s correct as gt the log date and time.

Enquire Related Logs OK

hitps:tvil ia govsgitafvrifactionthubAgency TrmLogListing ¥F UNC TION_|D=F 1801 004ET

37.49

External Agency ~
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