Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Grace <grace@ricardo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 January, 2018 1:00 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SJL7226M Claim against AIG Ref: CC6/A1G14021237/Kya3q2-1
Categories: HMK

Let me check and come back to you. Thanks.
Kind Regards,

Grace Tan
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

T: 6475 2112 (Main)
6460 9542 (DID)

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.

NOTICE: This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed, and may contain information that is privileged, confidential or
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient of this message, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the
intended recipient, you are advised that any dissemination, distribution, copying or acting upon the information contained herein, may be a violation of applicable law and
is strictly prohibited. Action may be taken upon any unlawful use as proscribed herein. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by
replying to this message

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, January 18, 2018 12:11 PM

To: Grace <grace@ricardo.com.sg>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SJL7226M Claim against AIG Ref: CC6/AIG14021237/Kya3q2-1

Dear Grace,
As spoken, our surveyor recommended amount before GST is $ 23,355.20.
Please refer to our report attached.

Kindly let us have your confirmation.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Grace [mailto:grace@ricardo.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 18 January, 2018 11:28 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SJL7226M Claim against AIG Ref: CC6/AIG1421237/Krm3

Hi Mei Kuan,
Please update status. Thanks.

Kind Regards,

Grace Tan
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

T: 6475 2112 (Main)
6460 9542 (DID)

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.

NOTICE: This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed, and may contain information that is privileged, confidential or
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient of this message, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the
intended recipient, you are advised that any dissemination, distribution, copying or acting upon the information contained herein, may be a violation of applicable law and
is strictly prohibited. Action may be taken upon any unlawful use as proscribed herein. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by
replying to this message

From: Grace [mailto:grace@ricardo.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 5:29 PM

To: 'cs-a@lkkauto.com' <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Re: SIL7226M Claim against AlG Ref: CC6/AIG1421237/Krm3

Hi Kathy,

We have sent above claim to you since July 2017, any outcome can you update. Thanks.

Kind Regards,

Grace Tan
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

T: 6475 2112 (Main)
6460 9542 (DID)

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.



NOTICE: This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed, and may contain information that is privileged, confidential or
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient of this message, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the
intended recipient, you are advised that any dissemination, distribution, copying or acting upon the information contained herein, may be a violation of applicable law and
is strictly prohibited. Action may be taken upon any unlawful use as proscribed herein. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by
replying to this message

From: Grace [mailto:grace@ricardo.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 4:41 PM

To: 'kathylai@lkkauto.com' <kathylai@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SIL7226M Claim against AIG Ref: CC6/AIG1421237/Krm3

Hi Kathy,
We have sent above claim to you since July 2017, any outcome can you update. Thanks.

Kind Regards,

Grace Tan
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

T: 6475 2112 (Main)
6460 9542 (DID)

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.

NOTICE: This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed, and may contain information that is privileged, confidential or
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient of this message, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the
intended recipient, you are advised that any dissemination, distribution, copying or acting upon the information contained herein, may be a violation of applicable law and
is strictly prohibited. Action may be taken upon any unlawful use as proscribed herein. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by
replying to this message



