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Vie

From: Vic

Sent: Tuesday, 12 August, 2014 4:19 PM

To: Albert-XZ Hong@aig.com

Ce: Thin Thin: Admin-A (LKK Auto); Vic; Yeo, Lincoln-ZG
Subject: RE: 22/05/2013_Yous Ref. B00659121_insured: SKF621
Dear Sir,

Woe refer to the below email.
Kindly advise further instructions.
Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Vic Alpeh

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi industrial Park
Singapore 408933

DID : 65- 6841 2096

Fax : 65- 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com

Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary:

From: Vic

Sent: Tuesday, 17 June, 2014 10:48 AM
To: Gnoh, Pau-Loong

€c: Thin Thin; Admin-A (LKK Auto); Vic
Subject: RE: 22/05/2013_Your Ref: 800659121 _Insured: SKF6211¢

T

Dear Sir,

We had checked with the insured workshop M/s Sing Hwee Motor where we were informed that they did not filed a TP claim,

However, they do repaired insured vehicle.
Kindly advise further instructions.
Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Vic Alpeh Sanghilan

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

DID : 65- 6841 2157
Fax:65-6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

From: Gnoh, Pau-Loong [mailto: Pau-Loong.Gnoh@aig.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 27 November, 2013 1:18 PM

To: Vic

Cc: Manis; Team A; Leonard Khaw

Subject: RE: 22/05/2013_Your Ref: 800659121 _Insured: SKF6211G

G



Vic

From: Vic

Sent: Tuesday, 17 June, 2014 10:48 AM

To: Gnoh, Pau-Loong

Cc: Thin Thin; Admin-A (LKK Auto), Vic

Subject: RE: 22/05/2013_Your Ref: 800659121 _Insured: SKF6211G
Dear Sir,

we had checked with the insured workshop M/s Sing Hwee Motor whefe we were informed that they did not filed a TP claim.
However, they do repaired insured vehicle.

Kindly advise further instructions.
Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Vic Alpeh Sanghiian

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25

paya Ubi industrial Park
Singapore 408933

DID : 65- 6841 2157

Fax : 65- 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@ikkauto.com

From: Gnoh, Pau-Loong [mailto:Pau-Loong.Gnoh@aig.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 27 November, 2013 1:18 PM

To: Vic

Cc: Manis; Team A; Leonard Khaw

Subject: RE: 22/05/2013_Your Ref: 800659121 _Insured: SKF6211G

Dear Vic,

Thank you for your email update on the PD matter. Please assisk to check with Ol on the status of their PD claim prior
to deciding next course of action, thanks,

Kind regards

Gneh Pau Loony

AlG

Claims Service Executive

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 0791 20

Tel +(65) 6419 1753 | Fax +(63) 6835 7416

pau-logng gnoh@aig.com | www aig.com.sq

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

you have received this email in ermor, please immediately notify me by "Reply" com and and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts
thareof. Atthough this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virug or other defect that might affect any computer system into which itis
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus #tee and no responsibility is accepted by AlG for any loss or damage
arising in any way from its use

The information in this email {and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not thqi:tended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If




Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

From: Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 15 May, 2015 4:23 PM

To: Hong, Albert-XZ

Cc: Vic

Subject: Your ref; 800659121 / DOA : 22.05.2013
Your ref : 800659121

Insured : SKF 6211G

DOA :22.05.2013

TP - SHB 7504L (TRANS-CAB)

Dear Mr. Albert,

With reference to the above subject.
We would like to enquire if there is body injury claim settlement for this case.
Please advise.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: jovirene@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408033)

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in arror) piease notify the
sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distfibution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.




Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

From: Hong, Albert-XZ <Albert-XZ Hong@a
Sent: Friday, 15 May, 2015 4:30 PM

To: Joy Irene {LKK Auto)

Cc: Vic

Subject: RE: Yourref 800659121/ DOA
Hi Joy,

No body injury claim settlement for this case.

Regards,

Albert Hong

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1089 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
Albert-XZ Hong@aig.com | Www.alg.com.8gq

IMPORTANT NOTICE!

The information in this email
i
any copies of printouts there
computer system into which
accepted by AIG for any foss or

u are not

of.
it is received and opened. it is the responsibifity o
damage arising in any way from its use.

¥ ihd

From: Joy Irene {(LKK Auto) [mailto:JoyIrene@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, May 15, 2015 4:23 PM

To: Hong, Albert-XZ

Ce: Vic

Subject: Your ref : 800659121 / DOA : 22.05.2013

Your ref : 800659121

insured - SKF 6211G

DOA £ 22.05.2013

TP . SHB 75041 (TRANS-CAB)

Dear Mr. Albert,
With reference to the above subject.
we would like to enquire if there is body injury claim settlement

Please advise.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler

notify ma
heiibved to be free of any virus or

igicom>

1 22.05.2013

the intended recipient. you must nat use or disseminate the
by "Reply" command and permanently defate the onginal and
other defect that might affect any

b recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is

for this case.




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-6051 | email: Jr_s_\lre_m\gidﬁuuqmi fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged informatian. If you are not the intend pd racipient {or have received this email in error) please notify the
sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribygtion of the material in this email is strictly forbidden,




Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ms. Jasming,

Joy Irene (LKK Auto)
Monday, 18 May, 2015 5:15 PM
Jasmine Tan

'roe\.c@transcabservices,com.sg'; 'zhewei‘kek@transcabservices.com,sg'
FW: 2013 CASES PENDING ACCEPTANCE AND LOD
SHD 9564P pdf;, SHD 5327J.pdf; SHD §294U.pdf; SHC 5032P pdf; SHB 7504L.pdf

Amended to 6 {2013) cases.

For your review, consideration and accepiance:

GLOBAL SUM OFFER AT 80% $ 3,500.00

OUR REFERENCE TAXI DOA SETTLEMENT OFFER STATUS
1 | CC3/AIG13013807/Kjt2 <D 9564P | 28/07/2013 _| CAR(W/GST) $7,70800 | NO LOD BOCUMEN
LOR{$114.40 x 5.5 DAYS}  § 629.70
LTh search fee $ 535
TOTAL $ 8,339.05
GUOBAL SUM OFFER AT 80% _$ 6,670.00
2 | CC3/AXA13014524/Kjm3 [sHpD 5327) | 06/08/2013 COR(W/GST) $5,029.00 | NOLOD DOCUMEN
LOR($96.30 x 7 DAYS) $ 674.10
LOI($50 x 7 DAYS) $ 350.00
LTA search fee § 535
TOTAL $ 6,058.45
LOBAL SUM OFFER AT 50% _$ 3,025.00
3 | CC3/AXA13022346/Kiy3 [ SHD 52940 | 22/11/2013 QOR(w/GST) $513600 | NOLOD DOCUMEN
UOR(696.30x 7.5 DAYS)  $ 72225
LTA search fee & 535
TOTAL $ 5,863.60
GLOBAL SUM OFFER AT 80% $ 4,690.00
4 | CC3/AXA13023824/Kjy3 [ sncsoszp | 13/12/2013 COR(wW/GST) $3,693.14 | NOLOD DOCUMEN
LOR($133.75 x 4 DAYS) $ 535.00
LOKS50 x 4 DAYS) $  200.00
| TA search fee 5 535
TOTAL $4,433.49

GLOBAL SUM OFFER AT 100% $ 1,500.00

5 | CC3/AXA13023825/KjY3 [sHpo1731 | 25/11/2013 COR(w/GST) 5133750 | NOLOD DOCUMEN
LOR($115.56 x 2 DAYS) $ 23112
LTA search fee $ 535
TOTAL $1,573.97

& | CC3/AIG13009648/Kht2 SHB7504L |  22/5/2013

COR({w/GST) 51,444.50
LOR($114.49 x 2.5 DAYS) $ 286.23

NO LOD DOCUMEN




LOISEO x 2.5 DAYS) § 125.00

LTA search fee 5 5.35
TOTAL $1,861.08

GLOBAL SUM OFFER AT 50% & S3800

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: joyi rene@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged infarmation. if you are not the intendad recipient {or have received this email in error) please notify the
sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure of distribukion of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene {LKK Auto)

sent: Monday, 18 May, 2015 3;44 PM
To: Jasmine Tan

Ce: 'roel.c@transcabservices.com.sg'; 'zhewei.kek@transcabservices.com.sg'
Subject: 2013 CASES PENDING ACCEPTANCE AND LOD

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ms. Jasmine,

Kindly review the following offer settlement of these (5) 2013 cases for your consideration and acceptance:

OUR REFERENCE TAXI DOA SETTLEMENT OFFER
1 CC3!A1613013807/Kjt2 SHD 9564P 28/07/2013 COR(w/GST) §7,704.00 NOL
LOR($114.49 X 5.5 DAYS]  $ 629.70
LTA search fee 5 5.35
TOTAL $8,339.05
LOBAL SUM OFFER AT 80% %6,670.00

2 | CC3/AXA13014524/Kjm3 SHD 5327) | 06/08/2013 _||COR(w/GST) $5,029.00 NO L
LOR{$96.30 x 7 DAYS) $ 674.10
LOI{$50 x 7 DAYS) $  350.00
LTA search fee 5 5.35
TOTAL $ 6,058.45
GLOBAL SUM OFFER AT 50% _§ 3,025.00
3 | CC3/AXA13022346/Kjy3 ['sHpD 5204y | 22/11/2013 COR(w/GST} $5,136.00 NOL
LOR{$96.30 x 7.5 DAYS) $ 72225
LTA search fee 5 5.35
TOTAL $ 5,863.60
GLOBAL SUM OFFER AT 80% _$ 4,690.00

4 | CC3/AXA13023824/Kjy3 [ sHcs032p_| 13/12/2013 COR{w/GST) §3,693.14 NO L
LOR{$1323.75 x 4 DAYS) 4§ 535.00
LOKS50 x 4 DAYS) $  200.00
LTA search fee S 5.35
TOTAL $ 4,433.49
GLOBAL SUM OFFER AT 80% _$ 3,500.00




5 | CC3/AXA13023825/Kjy3 [ sHp 91731 | 25/11/2013 Coilw!GST} $1,337.50

LOR{$115.56 x 2 DAYS) S 231.12
LTA search fee ] 5.35
TAQTAL $1,573.97

GLOBAL SUM OFFER AT 100% $ 1,500.00

NOL

Please revert.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: jovirene@lkkautg.com) fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §(408933)

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a wit
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No agmission of li
negotiation of terms/settlement.

hout prejudice basis with the sole intenticn of resolving the
ability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/

This email may contain confidentia! and/er privileged information. !f you are not the intends
sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure ar distriby

settlerment.

pd recipient (or have received this email in error) ptease notify the
ltion of the material in this emall is strictly forbidden.




Joy lrene (LKK Auto)

From: Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 8 June, 2015 11:24 AM

To: Hong, Albert-XZ

Cc: Vic

Subiject: Your ref- 800659121 / SKF 6211G / DOA: 22.05.2013

Dear Mr. Albert,
We refer to the above-subject.
Ol strongly disputed liability on this case.

Due to small quantum of claim and circumstance of the accident, W
matter at best.

We have made an initial offer of 50% to TP Trans-Cab on the same
ups on their reply, however to date, no response from their side.

ye had your instruction on 01/04/15 to settle the

day after your mandate and have made follow-

Our last reminder was sent on 18/5/15 and still no response from them.

in view of no further development from TP, we would like to submy
Kindly advise if we may proceed to close this 2013 case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: jovirene@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

it our report to your good-office on wp.

This ermail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intengled recipient (or have received this emailin error) please notify the
sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distrijution of the material in this emait is strictly forbidden.




Joy Irene {(LKK Auto)

From: Wong, Justin <Justin. Wong@aig.com?>

Sent: Monday, 8 June, 2015 11:41 AM

To: Joy trene (LKK Auto)

Cc: Vic; Hong, Albert-XZ

Subiject: #800659121B#023# AIG REf, / SKF 6211G / DOA: 22.05.2013

On behalf of Albert,
Dear Joy,
Please proceed as submit the report for WP closure.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Justin Wong

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1880 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
Justin. Wong@aig.com | www.aig.com.sq

IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) 1s confidential. If you are not i
information. If you have received this email in error. please immediately nolify me
any copies ar printouls thereof, Aithough this email and any attachiments are belel
computer system into which it is received and apened, it is the responsibility of the
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Joy Irene (LKK Auto) [mailto: Joylrene@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, June 08, 2015 11:23 AM

To: Wong, Justin

Cc: Vic

he intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the

by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and
Ved to be free of any virus or ofher defect that might affect any
recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is

Subject: FW: Your ref: 800659121 / SKF 6211G / DOA: 22.05.2013

Dear Mr. Justin,
We understand that Mr. Albert in on reservist until 23/06/15.
With reference to our e-mail below,

We would like to seek for your kind assistance for an approval to

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: joyirened lkkuuto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

This email may contain confidential and/or grivileged information. If you are not the int

submit report on wp for closure.

ded recipient {or have received this email in error} please notify the

sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distlibution of the matarial in this email is strictly forbidden,

1




From: Joy Irene (LKK Auto}

Sent; Monday, 8 June, 2015 11:24 AM

To: Hong, Albert-XZ

Ce: Vic

Subject: Your ref: 800659121 / SKF 6211G / DOA; 22.05.2013

Dear Mr. Athert,
We refer to the above-subject.
Ol strongly disputed liability on this case.

Due to small quantum of claim and circumstance of the accident, we had your instruction on 01/04/15 to settle the
matter at best,

We have made an initial offer of 50% to TP Trans-Cab on the same day after your mandate and have made follow-
ups on their reply, however to date, no response from their side.

Our last reminder was sent on 18/5/15 and still no response from them.
in view of no further development from TP, we would like to submit our report to your good-office an wp.
Kindly advise if we may proceed to close this 2013 case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: jovirepegelkkauto com, fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. i you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the
sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distrjbutian of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient.
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanenly delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments gre believed to be tree of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it ik received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.




! V ' Auto

-m om o Consultants
Bl BA B Pte Lig

S1UBIAVE 1. #01-25 PAYA DBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SING APORE 408933 TEL : 10651 62503560 FAN {5 a25N4ILS

Our Ref: CC3/AIG13009648/Kh2t2
14 NOVEMBER 2014

CHAN CHIAN POH
BLOCK 71D JALAN SENANG
SINGAPORE 418363

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 6211G AND SHB 75041 ON 22/05/2013

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you| and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the|matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 5 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if pny) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next rerjewal due to this Third Party claim.

However, if your policy has a NCD protector featuge, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully

Vic Alpeh ganghilan

Case Hangller

DID: 6844 2157

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpehii:lkkauto.com

ce. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)
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| CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
|
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| 04 Jun 2013 | 27 May 2013 $%1,350.00 S$1,350‘0('i' Pending for Survey ‘
Main Edit Reg | 00:00 Fdit Estimates View Rpt Report

Edit Ad] Rpt | Cancel Case J .

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

Claim Detail

[Created by adjuster]

Insured: 'Chan Chian Poh, NRIC: S66154508

| Main Claimant: TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD,

NRIC: 200303

I878K

Vehicle Reg. No. i SHB7504L Date of L§ss: 22/05/2013 14:00 - :59
i . . |2100308315 ( Comprehensive)
Ciaim Typée: _|TP/ 800659121 Policy/Caver Note NO.: | o) arage: 18/07/2012 - 17/07/2013 |
Vehicle Reg. No. ! i "
(Insured): SKF62116G Policy Noj (Claimant): D-12047359MFSH
Repairer: Trans Cab Autc Services Pte Lid {HQ) No 58 Defu Lane 1, 539498 Defu Lane - Tel:

Handling Insurer: 64151753]

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, {SG} - Tel:

65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Gnoh, Pau-Loong -

Ialmant's Insurer: First Capital Ingurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62222

3ip

Adjuster: |due 07/06/2013]

1 KK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd {HQ) - Tel: 6256+

n561 ... [Handled by KENNETH KONG] .., [Final Rpt

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

View All J fompose Case Mall

s AIG_SG (30/07/2014); CLAIM STATUS FOR CLAIM NO: 800659121 (SHB 7504L)

B2

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS View All Search Tasks I Create New Task J CompleteJ
. Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
Mo results.

hitp://singapore.merimen. com/claims/index.cfm?fusebos

 ~MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ds... 10/6/2015




Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SHB7504L (BO06591

[SKF6211G]

™
TRANS-CAB SERVICES
May 22 2013 2:00

[Chan Chian Poh]
Trans Cab Auto Services

121)

ELTD
M

Pte Ltd
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Adjuster Report

| KK Auto Consultants Pte L
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax;: 6844-8805 Email: account@lkkauto.com;su

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPEC(

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi In
Singapore 408933

Page 1 of 3

ld (Co.Reg.Mo: 189607 198R}
dustrial Park

r@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkaulo.com

STION REPORT

Our File No:  CC3/AIG13009648/KJA3Q2
Date: 10/06/2015
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. Policy No: 2100308315

Claimant Vehicle No : SHB7504L Insured Vehicle No : SKF6211G

Date of Loss: 22/05/2013 Nature pf Claim: TP Claim No: 800659121
DESCRIPTI IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No: SHB7504L

Make & Model: CHEVROLET EPICA, 2.0 {A) Engine No: Z22051448821K

Reg. Date: 13/03/2012 (Man. Year: 2011) Chassis No: KL1LAS9RJBB076818
Colour: Red/MWhite QOdometer: 166516 km

Engine Capacity: 1991 cc

Market Value/New Car Price: N/A

Sum Insured (S$):

Market Value/New Car Price

TI F LEATTHET E
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbyake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRE
Front Tyre Size: 195/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195765 R15
Front Left Side: West Lake 4 mm Rear Left Side: West Lake 3 mm
Front Right Side: West Lake 4 mm Rear Right Side: VWest Lake 3 mm
The above values represen! the remaining tyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference  DIff %
Parts 2,538.95 688.20 1,851.75 72.90
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 2,539.95 6588.20 1,851.75 72.90
Approved Total (Overridden) (S%$) 1,350.00
(S$) 2,539.95 1,350.00 118995  45.85
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 1¥7.80 84.50 83.30 48.85
Nett Amount (S$} 2,T17.75 1,444.50 1,273.25 46.85
Glabal Sum Settlement (S$) 0.00

INSPECTION
Date of Assignment:
Date Inspected:

Estimated Period of Repair:

27/05/2013
27/05/2013 Inspected At:

2.5 days

Trans Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd (HQ)
No 58 Defu Lane 1
Singapore 539498

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG

NOTE: This report represents

http:ﬁsingapore.merimen.conﬂc!aimsfindex.cfm?ﬁjsebo:

our findings at the time and place of inspection stated
knowledge and ability but any other tiabifity under any other cirtumstances is hereby

Manager:

=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g...

Joy Irene Bascao

arain, Such inspection has been carmed out lo the best of our
xprassly excluded.

10/6/2015



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 2 of 3

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 *FRONT BUMPER {BUMPER A-FRT) Repair 1,202.00FL *FL
1 *FRONT BUMPER RETAINER RH Senviceable 102.00FL *FL
1 *FRONT FENDER RH Bent 837.60FL *837.60FL
1 *FRONT DOOR LH (PANEL A-FRT DR LH} Repair 1,133.00FL *FL
1 *SET FRONT BUMPER FASTENER CLIP Not Necessary 24.00FS *FS
1 *FRONT DOOR STICKER TRANS-CAB Necessary B60.00FS *60.00FS

1
2
3
4
5
6
F=

Franchise part. S=SpcNett, L=ListlternDisc.

Sub Total (8%)

. List Item Discount on L Items 25.00/125.00% (S$)

Total Parts (S$)

3,358.60 897.60
818.65 209.40

2,539.85 688.20

[ Report was unsubmitted duringjthis print-out.

http://singapore.merimen. com/claimsx’index.cfm?ﬁlsebor=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g. . 10/6/2015
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour
There are no labour items selected.

|_ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

http://singapore.merimen.com/claims/ index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 10/6/2015




