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Vic

From: Leonard Khaw [leonard.khaw@mclarens.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 3 July, 2013 6:42 PM
To: 'Gnoh, Pau-Loong'; Vic
Cc: Manis; Team A; Tan.Boon-Heng@mclarens.com
Subject: RE: 22/05/2013_Your Ref: 800659121_Insured: SKF6211G

Hi Pau Loong, 

 

I have just spoken to the authorised driver, Ms Goh Sok Kheng. She maintains that she was not at fault for causing 

the accident and does not want AIG to settle the claim. 

 

I advised her that she has to be prepared in case of incurring solicitor’s fees to defend the case herself and she is 

fully aware and prepared to do so. 

 

Kind Regards, 

 

Leonard Khaw | McLarens  

leonard.khaw@mclarens.sg 

 

4 Robinson Road #03-01, The House of Eden, Singapore 048543 

+65 6224 9466 | office 

+65 9224 7877 | mobile 

+65 6224 1103 | fax 

www.mclarens.com 

 
CONFIDENTIALITY AND PRIVILEGE NOTICE: The information in this e-mail and in any attachment is confidential and may be privileged or otherwise protected 

from disclosure. It is intended solely for the above-named addresses and the contents should not be transmitted or disclosed to any others. If you are not one of 

the intended recipients you are hereby notified that retention, copying or the dissemination of this transmission is prohibited and unlawful. If you received this 

transmission in error, please immediately delete it from your system and notify the sender. 

 

From: Gnoh, Pau-Loong [mailto:Pau-Loong.Gnoh@aig.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 2 July, 2013 3:29 PM 
To: Vic 

Cc: Manis; Team A; Leonard Khaw 
Subject: RE: 22/05/2013_Your Ref: 800659121_Insured: SKF6211G 

 

  

  
Dear Vic, 
  
Thanks for your email below and as just spoken, please do not settle and KIV the PD matter since OI is also making a 
third party claim against taxi. 
  

  
By copy to Leonard, 
  
Do take note of this case, thanks. 
  
Claims history for your reference below. 
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Thank you and kind regards 
  
Gnoh Pau Loong 
AIG 
Claims Service Executive 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1753 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416 

pau-loong.gnoh@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If 
you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts 
thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is 
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for any loss or damage 
arising in any way from its use 

  

 

From: Vic [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, July 02, 2013 11:22 AM 
To: Gnoh, Pau-Loong 

Cc: Manis; Team A; Vic 

Subject: DOA: 22/05/2013_Your Ref: 800659121_Insured: SKF6211G 

Your Ref: 800659121 

Our Ref: CC3/AIG13009648/Kk1t2 

 

 

Dear Sir, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 6211G AND SHB 7504L ON 22/05/2013 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

This is a conflicting version where both OI and TP driver reported that the other vehicle cut to their lane resulting in the 

accident. Please see attached both OI and TP GIA reports. 

 

There was also no proof provided by both parties to prove the other vehicle cut lane. 

 

We had spoken to the insured previously where she was informed about the TP claim and in the event that if there is no 

concrete evidence to show TP is at fault, we may have to settle the TP claim at best and we are looking into a 50/50 case and 

her NCD will be affected. At that point of time, the insured understands and agreed to let us settle and she requested to know 

the final amount of TP claim before closing case. 

 

Once the amount is finalized at a 50% basis, we had informed the insured about it and at this time, the insured is now disputing 

on the TP claim and the liability. The insured said that one investigator from McLarens had interviewed her and she said that 

she already give all evidence she have to the investigator. The insured insisted that she is not at fault. She highlighted to us that 

she sent a sms to the TP driver asking him to go down to her workshop for the repair of her vehicle and TP driver replied OK but 

did not showed up. For the insured, she insisted that this reply was the evidence showing TP driver admits at fault. She gave this 

sms correspondence to the investigator. 

 

We then informed insured that the message response is still not a strong proof that TP driver admits at fault. However, the 

insured insisted on NOT to settle the TP claim and she is willing to fight the case all the way. 

 

Please advice as TP claimant is chasing for settlement. 

 

Thank you. 
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Kind Regards, 

Vic Alpeh Sanghilan 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25 

Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408933 

DID : 65- 6841 2157 

Fax : 65- 6741 4108 
Email : vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 

 

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE:  

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, 

you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 

immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or 

printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other 

defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of 

the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International 

Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any 

way from its use. 


