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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubd Ave 1 2801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapomne 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 128807108R GST Rag Mo 19-0807198-R

AffMiated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref | CC4/EQI1BO0107TE/R1ua3
AT LA
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date  17-01-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, GBB 1091X Veh. Inspected GBD 7741D
Policy No. DMCPHO17-002684 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 1710172018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Mako & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 | Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, ] Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 16/01/2018 I'Mpﬂﬂﬁﬂﬂ Date 18/01/2018
Survey held at WOON MENG MOTOR PTELTD
50 BUKIT BATOK ST 23
#01-06 MIDVIEW BUILDING
SINGAPORE 659578
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

Office 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-06 Midview Building, Singapore 658578
Workshop: 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-08 Midview Building. Singapore 859578
Tel 8315 1131 HP- 9730 2017 Fax: 6318 7050
42 5ungel Kadut Ave, Singapore T29666 Tel 63268523
{ Email Adress : woonmeng @singnel.cam.sg )

Co Reg No, 200803578M GST Reg No. 20-0603678M
Estimate
TP CLAIM
To : EQ Insurance Company Ltd
Motor Claims Dept Date : 18 Jan 2018
Dear Sirs ° Fax : 6223 4180

RE : ESTIMATE COST FOR TOYOTA KDY2318017748 - GBD7741D
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD7741D & GBB1091X ON 16/01/2018

ITEMS DESCRIPTION QrY  PRICE
1 Rear tailgate r?f - ipc § 1.461.20
2 Reartailgate lock @$255ea X ¥V 2pcs § 510.00
3  Rear tailgate hinge @511%a yesve dpcs § 476.00 ¥
4  Rearlamp @$269.6ea bRs 7 2pcs § 539.20,
5  Rear end panel. 4~ ipc $ 494 67
6  Rearlamp bracket @$56.42ea Y < 2pcs $ 112.84
7  Rear number plate gamish zds ipc § 88.30 /
B Rear mudfiat panel. T <~ ipc § 128.80
9 Rear mudfiat rubber. ¢~4 /~ pc § 35.00

3 3.846.11

Less 25% ] (961.52)

$ 2,884.59

10 Rear number plate. Bfe < ipc § 25.00
11 Tool box -sn. W7~ e § 350.00
12  Rear stopper o/s -sn. M~ ¢ pc § 15.00
Sum Carried Forward $ 3,27459
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Sum Carried Forward 4 try Regairet $
Sqynatils:

Labour Charge & Misc Dase

To remove, replace, repair & install }

damaged parts. )

To R & R rear exchuast.

To R & R wiring.

To putty & spray painting.

Total

All prices guoted are subjectad lo 7% GST.
This Is a computer generaled document. No signature [s required.
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From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear rasul

Accept your offer $3300.00
Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050

——0riginal Message—---

Heng Sew Sow <woanmeng@singnet.com.sg>
Saturday, 17 November 2018 6:57 PM

‘Rasul (LKKAuto)

RE: Estimate GBD7741D

From: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Saturday, 17 November 2018 6:53 PM
To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Estimate GBD7741D
Arttached for your reference.

Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050

——-0riginal Message—

From: Rasul [LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 12:06 PM
To: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Estimate GBD7741D
HI Ms Heng,

Refer to attachment

Finalise amount is at $ 3,300.00 / 5 days lump sum Kindly confirm

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | 5(408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary

—--0riginal Message—

From: Heng Sew Sow [mallto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg|
Sent: Thursday, 1 February, 2018 2:18 PM

To: Rasul [LKKAuto]
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INSURED / ADDRESS POLICY KO 1 MUDOAsEs
DESIGNBLILD CONSTRUCTION PTELTD POLICY TYPE : COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
-] POLICY PERIOD * DEMDS/20TT TO OT/0SAC1A
MANDAI ESTATE DATE OF ISSUE PoNoaoT
#0203 ACCEPT DATE ¢ DLDARCTT
INNOVATION PLACE FREMIUM DUE 1 5GD12aTE
(Inchusive of GST)

ACCOUNT ¢ 10TEDDA
AIGK MUMBER : 0001 Commarsial Viehisle
BUSINESS/PROFESSION OF INSURED +  Cormawuclen compony
REGISTRATION NUMBER 1 GROTTR1D
MAKE | TOYQTA Loy | Plckup Hood
TONMAGE/SEATING CAPACITY { 1.8 TONS
YEAR OF MANUFACTURE ;2014
YEAR OF REGISTRATION s 2015
ENGINE NUMBER 1 TRD24584T0
CHASSIS NUMBER : KDYZN001TT4R
VEHICLE USAGE i Carry Own Geade[Nat for Hira ar Reward)
TYPE OF COVER : Comprehonsive Apprevas Workshap Plan
SUM INSURED : Provalling Markat Valus

Additional Excose for Unnamed Oriver(s) : SGD 1,500,00 (AN Cioima)
Additional Excass for Young, Eidarly or Inoxpotiance ! SG0 2,000,00 {4l Caimz)
Divar(e)

NCD (15.00%] «200.3a
Gives Promium |For (o poriod insured) 1,135 28
TOTAL PREMILUM PAYABLE (INCLUSIVE OF G5T) 12416
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Nivitha (LKK Auto

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 17 January 2018 4:25 PM
To: assignments
Subject: FW: Accident involving GBD7741D & GBB1091X on 16.01,18
Attachments: 20180117132705.pdf; OLpdf
6 abpe © 13lol| 20¥
vthide In
Best Regardy, Mm@' '[‘.‘.'n' Wﬁ
Shu Pel| Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupe|8kkaulp.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Wbl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408923)

From: Janet Tan [mailto:janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 17 January 2018 4:25 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Subject: FW: Accident involving GBD7741D & GBB1091X on 16.01.18

Dear all,

Attach both parties’ report for your reference.

Please arrange to attend to the PRS of the said vehicle, direct settle if possible.

The OIC for this case is Elaine Cheong.

Thank you.

Regards,

Janet Tan

eq'nsuronce

EQl Insurance Company Limited

i 45 4 : tel BS ¢ i fan .- T . /
L\{:‘Lu
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From: Heng Sew Sow [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2018 1:34 PM



To; Tan Wei Yin <weiyin.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>; Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Subject: Accident invalving GBD7741D & GBB1091X on 16.01.18

Dear Sir'Madam

We refer to the above accident

Kindly be advised that we will be assisting our client, owner of vehicle no:
GBD7741D, to submit a third party claim against your insured vehicle. We
would like to proceed with direct settlement.

Please arrange for your surveyor to liaise with us for an inspection on our
client’s Vehicle at your earliest convenience.

Location : 50, Bukit Batok St 23 #01- 06 Midview Building ( S ) 659578 (
Vehicle in )

Attached GIA report of STH7290Y for your reference.

Thank You.

Woon Meng Motor Pte Lid
Tel : 63161131

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link
attachments:

20180117132705



Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent
sending or receiving certain types of file attachments, Check your e-mail
security settings to determine how attachments are handled.



Cecilia Chuna !LKK Auto!

From: Woan Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 4:06 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: YOUR REF: GBD 7741D (OUR REF: CC4/EQI1B001076/R1ga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING

GBB 1091X & GBD 7741D ON 16/01,/2018 ***

Dear Cecilia,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention,
Kindly be informed that we confirm acceptance of amount $3,465.00.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

H0O1-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax: 63167050

From: Cecilla Chong (LKK Auto] <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 1:46 PM

To: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: GBD 7741D (OUR REF: CC4/EQI18001076/R1ga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 1091X & GBD
7741D ON 16/01/2018 ***

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We are pleased to offer Global Sum $3400.00 (all-in).
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter Is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher [for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,
Ceeilin Chong | Case Hundler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@kknuto.com) fax: 6741-3108
Blk 51, Paye Uly Industrinl Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
i1
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From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 2:48 PM

To: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: GBD 7741D (OUR REF: CC4/EQI18001076/R1ga3) *=* ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 1091X & GBD

7741D ON 16/01/2018 ***

Dear Sir/Mdm

For cost of repair, the amended recommended repair cost as calculated is L/S $2900.00 (before GST) with 5 repair days.
Kindly forward your LOD and other documents to us (LKK).

Thanks

Best Regards,

Cecilin Chong | Case Hundler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CecilinChong @ lkkaute.com) fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #0z2-25 | S(408931)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 4:08 PM

To: 'Woon Meng' <woonmeng@singnet.cam.sg>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: GBD 7741D (OUR REF: CC4/EQI18001076/R1ga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 1091X & GBD
7741D ON 16/01/2018 ***

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Kindly email us the LTA search fee invoice as well as you are claiming the LTA search.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Cerilin Chong | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CecilinChong @ lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(40H933)

From: Woon Meng [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 2:55 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong @Ikkauto.com>

Subject: YOUR REF: GBD 7741D (OUR REF: CC4/EQI18001076/R1ga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 1091X & GBD
7741D ON 16/01/2018 ***

Dear Cecilia,



We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.
Kindly find the attached for your reference.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578}
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, B July 2019 6:38 FM

To: Woon Meng <woonmen; ingnet.com.sg>

Subject: YOUR REF; GBD 7741D [OUR REF; CC4/ EQI18001076/R1ga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 1091X B GBD
7741D ON 16/01/2018 ***

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE'
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your ref* GBD 7741D
Our Ref: CCdr’EQIIEﬂUIﬂ?ﬁFRIgﬂ

Dear Sir'Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 1091X & GBD 7741D ON 16/012018
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly check and advise if your client is still interested to pursue with his third-party claim against our principal M/s
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please rn;sp-und and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise. we shall have no other option but
to submit our report to our principal for closure.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you s strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our palicyholder andfor the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice engagement
should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding In any other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CecilinChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(4089733)

¥y EIys o
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m Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50 Bukit Batok Strest 23 #01-08 Maview Building, Singapore 659578

Tel «G553181131 / +8553181151 FAX. +B583167050

Wnﬂﬂ HE.B Workshop 42, Sunged Kadul Ave Singapone 729666 Tel +B5B3628521
Email. woohmengd@singnet com sg)
Co Reg No 20080387TEM GST Reg No. 20-06036TAM

EQ Insurance Company Ltd 18 Nov 2018
5 Maxwell Road

# 17- 00 Tower Block

MND Complex

Singapore 069110

Attn:  Motor Claim Dept.
Dear Sirs

DIRECT S ENT FOR REPAIR OF TOYOTA KDY21 48 - GBD7741D

RE . ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD7741D & GBB1081X
ALONG PIE TOWARDS JURONG ON 16/01/2018

We have been given the full authority to act on behalf of Designbuild Construction Pte Ltd,
registerad owner of motor vehicle no: GBD7741D, which was involved and
damaged In the above accident.

We were told that the said accident was caused solely due to the negligence
of your insured driver. Therefore, we are compelled to claim against you

for the losses incurred as follows -

1) Cost of repairs. $ 3,103.00
2) Loss of use for 8days @$120perday $ 720.00
3) LTA search ] 2.00

TOTAL AMOUNT - $ 382500

We have told our client that this matter is strictly on a DIRECT SETTLEMENT

basis. If you do not dispute liability, please arrange to let us have your payment

for the sum of S/D : THREE THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED AND TWENTY FIVE ONLY
in full and final settiement for our client's claim

We enclose herewith the GIA report, Surveyor's report and the invoices for your
attention.

look forward to your early favourable reply

faithfully,



!’UU Auto

-
s BnA B Pl Lig

S UHEAVE 1, 800-25 PAYA UBHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 4i5%33 TEL : 1065) 62505300 FAX ; (063) 62564015

Our Ref: CC4/EQIIB001076/R1ua3
01 FEBRUARY 2018

UNITECH CONTROL & INSTRUMENTATION PTE LTD
126 JOO SENG ROAD

i#03-10

GOLDPINE INDUSTRIAL BUILDING

SINGAPORE 368355

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 1091X AND GBD 7741D ON 16/01/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against vou and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us, We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
seltlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours fnithﬁ:ll;,
¥

THIN THIN HLAING

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

Fax: 6741 4108

Email: thinthin@lkkauto.com

cce.  EQINSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
{Mator Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To: L& /ifuarte Co ) A

ACCIDENT INVOLVING ¢74/) )%/[] YGLL T

ON /ﬂ'/ V/ £  aonG P/ 73:{MW ‘_7}{#5&{
Db Guero R S0 /00707

Of

Owner of Motor Registration Nn{%ﬁ ?%M do hereby

Authorise M/S WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD as my agent

and representative to correspond in, negotiate and settle, on my
behalf, my claim against the parties involved in the above-mentioned
accident. In the event of final settlement, we agreed that payment be

make payable to M/S WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD.




m Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50 Bukit Batok Streat 23 #01-08 Matview Bulding, Sngapors £59573
Tel. 6583161131 / +B583161157 FAX. -658316T050
WOON MENG woisnon 42 5ungel xaout Ave Singapors 720688 Ter +8583828523

Emaill: wocnmangifsingnat com sg)

Co Aeg No 2005036TEM GST Reg No 20-0803678M

TAX INVOICE NO: WM2018/C04188/naviTP
Date : 19 Nov 2018

EQ Insurance Company Ltd
5 Maxwell Road

# 17- 00 Tower Block

MND Complex

Singapore 069110

Attn  Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs
E: REP OSTF OYOTA 8017748 - GBD77
ccC VOLVING GBD7741D & GEB1091X ON 16/01/2018
ITEM DESCRIPTION ERICE
1 Lump sum repair cost $ 2,900.00
5 12,800.00
ADDGST7% 8 20300
TOTALAMOUNTSS § _3103.00

S/D : Three Thousand One Hundred And Three Only.

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.



1TROE

GENERAL
INSURANCE

Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapora 048580
Phona; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
Operaling Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ©ST Regisiration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No. GR-18-008914

Date of Requast: 171012018 Your Ref No: Online Purchasa
Woon Meng Motor Pte Lid
50 Bukit Batok Streat 23,
#01-06 Midview Bullding
Singapore 659578

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Data 170172018

Enquiry By Heng Sew Sow

TP Vahicla No GBB1091X

Accident Date 16/01/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vahicla No. Insurar Period af Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
GBB1091X EQ Insurance Company Lid 27/09/2017-09/07/2018 6223 8433

Thank You.

The imagas provided to you are taken from the original repons forwarded 1o the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and wa taks no fnrnmirmywmnhnuandMhmdnrmlnnﬂnymumnrhrwmunrmwnqmd

or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.
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1MT2018 Irrvoce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
'NSUM"CE Phona: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operaling Hnulr:- Monday o Friday 9am to 5pm

TAX INVOICE

Our Rel Na: GR-18-008014

Date of Requast: 171012018 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchasa

Woon Meng Molor Pte Lid

50 Bukil Batok Street 23,

#01-06 Midview Building

Singapore 659578

Daar SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 1r/01/2018

Enquiry By Heng Sew Sow

TP Vehicle No. GEB1031X

Accident Date 180172018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (585)

TP Insiirer Engliry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Ameunt Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official usa:

Date:

[¥] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

hitps fsngapone manmen. comiciams/indos cimMusabox=MTRsasslussaction=dap_geninviphrefid= 16975384 CF ID=266795538CF TOKEN=614 202



) -n. : ; Pre Lt Company Registration Na. 1§960T188R

EUIREAVE |, M2-25 PAYA LI INDUS THIAL PAREK, SINGAMIKE 08930 TEL ; (065) 42503341 FAN - (45) 62564815

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date; 20/08/2019

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT
.- GE.B 1'09_11'. (Insd Veh) ‘I’Eur Ref. No. : DMCPHQ17-003684

GBD 7741D (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CC4/EQI18001076/R1ga3q2

Date of Accident 16/1/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost -3 3,103.00 R
Loss of Use Bl 360.00 B days
Rental (If any) o days
Dthar_s: - 2.00

3,465.00
Final SettlementSum |: § 3,465.00
Remarks -
Payment | ion: Payee's Breakdown
1) [WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD 5 3,465.00
JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




1 7d 74
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 8258 3581 FAX B256 4315

Reg. No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-950T188-R

Afflllated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobiie

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

5 MAXWELL ROAD

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK

MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110

Rel CC4EQIB001076/R 1ga3q2

Date 20-08-2019

Code . EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GEB 1081X Veh. Inspected GBD 7741D
Policy No. DMCPHQ17-003684 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  JANET Assign Date 17/01/2018
) Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KDY2318017748 Colour GREY
Odometer 187938 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3 ‘Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/70 R15C MULTIVAN 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/70 R15C MULTIVAN 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |165R13C (D) MULTIVAN 5/5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |165R13C (D) MULTIVAN 5/5 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  16/01/2018 Inspection Date 18/01/2018
Survey held at WOON MENG MOTOR PTELTD
50 BUKIT BATOK ST 23
#01-06 MIDVIEW BUILDING
SINGAPORE 859578
Sa, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sb, Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 8258 4315

Reg. Mo 195607188R GST Reg No. 18-8607188-R Page No, 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBD 7741D
i T IR Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Cendition Workshop ($)) (S)
IREPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAILGATE BENT 1,461.20 1.461.20
2|REAR TAILGATE LOCK @3%255.00 SERVICEABLE 510.00
4|REAR TAILGATE HINGE @%118.00 SERVICEABLE 476.00 -
1|REAR LAMP @%$269.60 BROKEN 539.20 538.20
1|REAR END PANEL BENT 4894 BT 484 B7
2|REAR LAMP BRACKET @556.42 BENT 112.84 11284
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE GARNISH CRACKED 88.30 88.30
1|REAR MUDFLAT PANEL BENT 128.90 128.80
1|REAR MUDFLAT RUBBER cuTt 35.00 35,00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -8961.53 -715.03
2,884.58 2,145.08
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) EROKEN 265.00 25.00
1|TOOL BOX (SN) BENT 350.00 350.00
1|REAR STOPPER QIS (SN) NECESSARY 15.00 15.00
380.00 380.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE,REPLACE .REPAIR & INSTALL DAMAGED 800.00 800.00
PARTS.
TO RAR REAR EXHALUST, NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TOR & R WIRING. 60.00 30.00
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING 800.00 500.00
1,780.00 1,130.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,054.58 3,665.08
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,900.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18001076/R1ga3q2
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor

DIBCLAMER OF LLARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report i made salsly lor the use snd benelil of ihe Cllent namad on the frenl page of his Repen.




Joanne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 4:03 PM

To: ‘Joel Gah'

Cc: 'CeclliaChong@lkkauto com’

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB 1091X (Ol) and GBD 7741D (TP) on
16/01/2018

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT. pdf

Dear SirMadam,

Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please,

Ihank vou.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 emall: report ®Ikkauto com
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



