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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Ref : CS/FCI1B001053/Urb

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 P, IR0 ” " ["l‘lm"mm”l"
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 7158U Veh. Inspected SLV 6674H
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 17/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
b General Information
Accident Date  17/01/2018 Inspection Date 17/01/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENMUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks

AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

B)IN ACCORDAMNCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.,




51 UBLAVE 1, 801-15 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18000494MFSH

Our Ref: CS/FCI18001053/Urb

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SLV 6674H .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 17/01/2018 at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD and have the

following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8§ 14.264.80
Revised Estimate Amount -S%  6.883.12
“Check” Items Amount : S§

Market Value : S§ -
LTA Reimbursement Value b -
Nett Value : S% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at rear portion.

Froeg

Yours faithfully
MARCUS CHUA
Automotive Assessor



H H : : Company Reg. Mo, 1950001080
First Capital Insurance Limited GST Reg. No. M2-0001676-9

A, IREAX Gompany
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 17-01-2018 Our Ref No. D18000424MFSH
Accident Date 17-01-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC7159U Third Party Vehicle. SLVE6T4H
Survey Location 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-46/48/50AUTOBAY
Contact Person. MANCY LAM
Contact No. 67465405/ 0 Fax No. 67458520
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
A inted
PRainte LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 684186315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD Attention. MIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspaction
This is & computer generated letter, no signature required.

Main Office : & Raflles Qumy #2400 Singapore 048580 Tal: AS-E222 2311 Fax 556722 1547 Website: wew first-nsurance.com 5
Clalms Departments & Motor Underwniting Department : 38 Hobinson Road 81801 Cily Hogse & \qapone 0GEETT Tol: BS-B507 3848 Fax 65-B507 3849
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Survey
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LAM) = Emailld: NANCY.LAM@FASTECH " 'TD.COM,5G
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i — PTE LTD To Surveyor WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM
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o
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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, January 19, 2018 12:49 PM

To: ‘Clairm Workflow System’

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@FIRST-INSU RANCE.COM.SG;
LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18000494MFSH/1

Dear Sir,

please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle 5LV 6674H on 17/01/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, January 18, 2018 4:11 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ ccwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.5G; LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18000494MFSH/1

Dear 5ir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [ma ilto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 18 January 2018 3:47 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @FIRST-INSU RANCE.COM.SG; LURENEJAW @MSFI RSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18000494MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, January 18, 2018 4:11 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; assignments

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@FIRST-INSURANCE.COMSG;
LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.5G; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18000494MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

Erom: Claim Workflow System [mailtu:cwsmuturcIaims@msfirstcapital,cum.sg]

sent: Thursday, 18 January 2018 3:47 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMDTURCL&IMS@FIRST-INSURANCE.CDM.SG; LUHENEMW@MSFIRST{:APITAL.EDM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18000494MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CW5 within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System
Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner 10:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mao.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Maodel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis Mo.

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapare NRIC

3093k

SLVaSTAH

Mo

17 Jan 2018
HONDA

CITY 1.55V CVT
Grey

2017
L15Z15204879
MRHGMa660TO00280
B8.0 kW (118 bhp)
$17.683.00

09 Jan 2018

0% Jan 2018

0

$17.683.00

Yes
0B Jan 2028

$13.262.00

08 lan 2028

A - Carup to 1600cc & F7kW
(130bhp)

10
$42,502.00
$42.798.00

$56,060.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Jan 2018

OK

Page 1 of 2

I1ttp5:.-'fvri_ILa.gm-.5gf11&-"x-'r1f"actiun,-’n:nquireRehateB}'PuhlicBeforeDercgl|1put‘."Flﬂ\ZCT[UN_] D=F0304009... 17-Jan-18



Date of Accident
Accident Place
Vehicle. No. (Car Plate No.)

Insurace Company

Owner or Company Name /IC No.

Owner or Company Contact No.
DRIVER’S Name / IC No.
DRIVER’S Date Of Birth
Relationship of Owner & Driver
DRIVER'S Address

DRIVER’S Contact No./ Alt No.
DRIVER'S Occupation

Email Address

Weather & Road Surface

Reporting Type

Number of Passengers (Including Driver): !

~
Was there any video Captured by car cameral YES\ NO

o1/
1/ -' mlghccidt Time:_| 434 pe(24-HR-Format)

H[D“j AYE dowuld BIE
SV bbT%H  Make/Mode:
To iV Movine pogios No.
B Ahmed [41693093F

ZulkiHee

Owner’s Hp Company Tel

DRIVER’S License Pass Date

: Spouse \ Parents \ Children \ Sibling \ Employee\ Others; )\~~~

:1) 2)

:@ OUTDOOR (e.g. working inside or outside office)

=y

LEAR & DRY \RAINING & WET \ AFTER RAIN & WET
S e
: Reporting Only \ Clg Other Party_}JClaim Own [nsurance

ps e

Exact purpose for which vehicle was being used at the time of mcﬁmt@mk purpose

Any Injury (If YES, Pls state):

YL
o

Other Party Driver’s Particular (if any)

SHouCTul st ocf‘)

Vehicle. No: 3 F T1¢06S

Vehicle, No:
Vehicle Make'Model: Vehicle Make\Model:
MName Driver: Mame Driver:

i, B S| mAEN .
1€ No. Driver/Coiilavi.

I No, Driver/Contact:

* NEW - Passenger’s name & gender:
Roliona Bint, Molame Salleh CF)



SKETCH PLAN

2 ) 0 [ N U S I

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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DECLARATION

I/\We declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect.

—

!
Paolicyholder's Signature Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Date & Time: (If driver is not the policyholder) Mame:;

Date & Time:

SMRMC SketcliPlanFonm w3

NRIC/FIN No.:
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te #SLVO
VEHICLE NO: SLVE674H /S -

,.({
Aty Particular Amount 55 .-\

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

List [tem:

1PCS  BOOTLID 4 EM"(?H: C éLe.1p s 84120 &
1PCS BOOTLID INNER LOCK T =1 $ ~TI5A0 o
1PCS BODTLID LOCK STRIKER -1 5 66.50 X7
1PCS BOOTLID 'H' LOGO WA S 4200
1 PCS BOOTLD 'VTEC' EMBLEM  #LeA 5 6200 _—
1PCS BOOTLID 'CITY' EMBLEM  ALA $ 48.00
1PCS BOOTLID OUTER CHROME MOULDING gl /&y L9 §  325.00
2 PCS BOOTLID REFLECTORS @5333 7 1 s 666.00 X
1PCS BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP  Tw] Iy o s 197.20
1PCS  BOOTLID INNER TRIM 1 s 28830 X
15ET BOOTLID INNER TRIM CLIPS A1 5 50.00 X
1PCS  REARBUMPER oo /9 ¢L3- 70 S 64230 —
1 PCS REAR BUMPER LOWER CENTRE GARNISH 7 -7 § 18540 -
2 PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @535.20 €24+ 3 70.40 ~
1SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS nar 5 39.00 "
4 PCs REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSORS @5188 M 7% 5 75200 2Pe¢y
2 PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE GARNISH @565  0/S iy S 13000 1pg
2 PCS REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS @360 /[ caa 472 " s 12000 (p ¢
2 PCS TAILLAMPS @5388 £na i ; s _776.00
1PCS REAR END PANEL -‘!..f_{r‘r-'ﬂ 2h:39y343 10°60 § 60500 —
1PCS REAR END PANELTOP GARNISH [ ¥ [§ )50 s 32000 -
1PCS REAR END PANEL OUTER LOCK SENSOR ¢ 2 $  190.00 —
1PCS  REARFLOOR PANEL Vs s 98500 X
1PCs REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD Tora )95 Lo $ _480.00 «—
2 PCS REAR FENDER INNER TRIMS @5305 #1 $  610.00 )
1PCS  REAREXHAUST  Aeaf( % Y3329 $ 58820
2PCS  REAR EXHAUST MOUNTINGS @435 /1eA_ § 7000
List Item Total: (_lﬂ s 93sa80  YQU.§
Special Nett lterm: 11 ¥l =
1PCS BOOTLID TOP SPOILER aAn $  680.00 3
1PCS REAR END PANEL SEALANT  Ada s 50.00 L—
1PCS REAR REVERSE CAMERA a1 s 38000 X
1SET REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR  Aga S 150.00 ,"}g -
Special Nett Total: $ 1,260.00
Labour Charge:
TO CHECK WIRING 5 80.00 2o
TO TRANSFER BOOTLID MECHANISM 5 80.00 62O
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR 5 g0.00 o
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE REAR EXHAUST S 80.00 b0
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT, CUSHION UPHOLSTERY $ 12000
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING $ 120,00 ﬁ?)
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX PETROL TANK 5 100.00 ?(
A



LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING,CUT, WELD,STRAIGHTEN E REPLACING PARTS

s 150000 /dOD
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING S 1,500.00 f‘& DD
Labour Charge Total: 5 3,660.00

ESTIMATE PARTS AND LABDUR GRAND TOTAL 5 14,264.80

Lk Aulo Consultanls hence notify
the: Sepairer of the following:
» To resyrvey. belonsfalier spray ,|:.-a|nhnq
« To cisplay damaged panis) du:ng :ﬂm
» Parts prices are subjict 1o confirma
« Third party survey is on a “Withoul Prejudics” basis
» Nt llenal modifcationis] is allowed -
» Spiplemantary em(s) must ba resurveyed
s subject 1o finai approval from Insurance Compamy

Acknowiedged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
TEL: B256 35681 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 15-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18001053/Urbn2
H16.01 CITy HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 o aIs mlulm““mmnlﬂ
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 7159U Veh. Inspected SLV B674H
Policy No. D-18088937MFSH Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18000494MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 18/01/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CITY (A) c.c 1497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. MRHGMEEE0JTO00280 Colour GREY
Odometer 185 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/55R16 ERIDGESTOMNE 9 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/55 R16 BRIDGESTOME 9 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/55 R18 BERIDGESTONE 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/55R18 BRIDGESTONE 9 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/01/2018 Inspection Date 18/01/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAWVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Lbl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607T198R GST Rep. No. 18-8607198-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SLV 6674H
i Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition W nﬂmhnp?g]} “J}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BOOTLID BENT / BUCKLED B41.20 65520
1|BOOTLID INNER LOCK TWISTED 165,30 195.30
1|BOOTLID LOCK STRIKER NOT NECESSARY 66.50 -
1|BOOTLID "H" LOGO MECESSARY 42,00 42 00
1|BOOTLID "I-WTEC" EMBLEM MECESSARY 62.00 62.00
1|BOOTLID "CITY" EMBLEM MECESSARY 48.00 48.00
1|BOOTLID OUTER CHROME MOULDING NECESSARY 325.00 184.20
2|BOOTLID REFLECTORS @$333.00 NOT NECESSARY 666,00 +
1|BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 197.20 144 .20
1|BOOTLID INNER TRIM NOT NECESSARY 288.30 -
1|SET BOOTLID INNER TRIM CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 50,00
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED/ 64230 463.70
DEFORMED
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER CENTRE GARNISH TORMN 185.40 185.40
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @%35.20 BENT T0.40 70.40
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 35.00 39.00
4|REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSORS @%188.00 SHORTED (2 PCS 752.00 376.00
ONLY)
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE GARNISH @$65.00 O/sS TWISTED 130.00 65.00
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS @$60.00 /S CRACKED 120.00 52.00
2| TAILLAMPS @$388.00 CRACKED 776.00 570.60
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED B805.00 605.00
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH TWISTED 320.00 182.50
1|REAR END PANEL OUTER LOCK SENSOR CRACKED 190.00 180.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 985.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD TORMN 480,00 29520
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIMS @3$305.00 NOT NECESSARY 610.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST BENT / TWISTED 588.20 433.20
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTINGS @$35.00 NECESSARY 70.00 70.00

Report Ref No, CS/FCI18001053/Urbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1801-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 8256 4315

Reg. Mo: 195607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo ﬂmhnp?g]} '::{
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -985.78
5,344 80 394312
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|BOOTLID TOP SPOILER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 580.00 .
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR REVERSE CAMERA (SN} NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
1|SET REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR (SN) NECESSARY 150.00 130.00
1,260.00 180.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. B80.00 30.00
TO TRANSFER BOOTLID MECHANISM. B0.00 60.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR B0.00 50.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE REAR EXHAUST. 80.00 60.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT CUSHION UPHOLSTERY. 120.00 80.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING. 120.00 B0.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX PETROL TANK NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING,CUT WELD,STRAIGHTEN 1,500.00 1,200.00
& REPLACING PARTS INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
REAR FLODR PANEL
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 1,500.00 1,200.00
3,660.00 2,760.00
GRAND TOTAL 14,264.80 6,883.12
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,500.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18001053/Urbn2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THERD PARTIES:- This Report is made solety for the use and benelit of the Client named on the front page of this Raport.

O Ay Chard Darty wio 0

reply on the Repon




