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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

. :; E. 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
e il TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607195-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile
QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Ref : CC4/QBE18001047/T1hb3

1 RAFFLES QUAY #26-10 SOUTH ROT——

[N

TOWERSINGAPORE 048583
Code: QBE
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLG 96270 Veh. Inspected SHB 4588P
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 17/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model C.C o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Medification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mrm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mim
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  11/01/2018 Inspection Date

Survey held at DING AUTO PTELTD

BLK 10 #01-20 SIN MING IND EST SEC C SINGAPORE 575645

Sa. Remarks

AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS

B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Aakr
CCapsUfiants

Company Registration No 1ABGOT10RR

P L id

SUUHTAYE I, fEE25 Ay A LR IS S THIAL PAaltk, SINCGATNORE J08933 TEL s ieE f2E6ASN1 FAN s hX=nddls

Yourref:  To Be Advised Date: 18.01.2018
Our ref’ CC4/QBE18001047/T1hh3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s QBE INSURANCE ({ INTERNATIONAL) LTD

Dear Sir™adam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHB4588P
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 17.01.2018
at the premises of M/s Ding Automotive Pte Lid _and have the following 1o report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount I 5% 2,858.30

Revizsed Estimate Amount 5% 056,90

"Check" Items Amount 5§ 619,60

Market Value 1 8% -

LTA Reimbursement Value 5% -

Nett Value 1 5% -

Description of Damage: ;-—_ﬂ_—.m_n:: —,

The vehicle sustained damages at the r_ L O - 2
Rear Portion e

Comments/Present Status;
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours faithfully.

MOHD, TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



Catherine Chona (LKK Auto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@ikkauto.coms
Sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 4:29 PM
To: assignments
Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB4588P AND SLG9627D ON 11/01/2018 - ARRANGE
SURVEYOR
Attachments: SAS2339594,PDF; 3P insurance.html
W
oAb
Best Regards, Illtt() -{:'\‘ v -
dn

hu Pei| Admi -
Shu Pei| Admin %\%\
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd '}u\%
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 G\@‘

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408533)

From: Joyce Foo [mailto:joyce.foo@gbe.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 4:06 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHBASEBP AND 5LG5627D ON 11/01/2018 - ARRANGE SURVEYOR

Qur Ref. V0016096
Hi

Please assist to arrange TP survey,

Thank You & Best Regards
Javee Foo
Sanior Assistant - Claims

DBE Azia Pacific — Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapora) Pla Lid
Phona: +55 6477 1184
Email joyee foogqbe.com

Visit us an the web at www qbe com sg

AT} LU

A




From: Jenny Toh
Sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 4:02 PM

To: Joyce Foo <joyce. foo@gbe.com>
Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB4588P AND 5LG96270 ON 11/01/2018 - ARRANGE SURVEYOR

Jenmy Toh
Sanior Assistant, Claims

CRE Emerging Markets — Singapore

OBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
Phone +65 8477 1225

Email jenny lghfgbe com

Visll us on the web at www Qbe. Com 89

From: taxiscs@stengg.com [@_i_‘!mﬂa:-:is::sr,ri-szFr}i:H.L'mn]

i T

sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 3:46 PM

To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Cc: J’B.ECDL[_NTS%DlNGAUTQ.SG. ADM;N@DlNGAUTUMC}]’WI:.EDM.SG

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHRBA4588P AND SLG9627D ON 11/01/2018 - ARRANGE 5U RVEYOR

Dear Jenny,

This vehicle( SHB4588P ) now at 31 Corporation Road Singapore 649825 , please arrange surveyor ASAP and
update liability .
vehicle is in workshop for 2 days already .

Thank you.

Best Regard

Ding Automotive PTE LTD
Alex Khong

83039588

From Taxis Cusiomer Service/KASICBG/IST Kinetics

enny lohi@gbe com angeline kohfghe com
Cc "ACCOUNTSEDINGAUTO SG7, “ADMINEDINGAUTOMOTIVE COM. SG"

Diata Thu 11 Jan 2018 06:52 PM
Subject ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB4588F AND SLGOE2TD ON 1140172018 - ARRAMGE SURVEYOR
Dear All |

This vehicle( SHB4588P ) now at 31 Corporation Road Singapore 640825 . Please arrange surveyor come to 15 Jan
2018 .



Thanks

Best Regard

Ding Automative PTE LTD
Alex Khong

83035588

[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify
us immediately: you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank
you]

[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify
us immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank
you]

[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify
us immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank

you]

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclasure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply
email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



AR Ding Auto Mail - SHB45BEP - Finaize Amount & After Repair Photo.

# _‘ﬁ -
sq ,] l\/‘ I l Accounts Ding Auto <accounts@@dingauto.sg=>

SHB4588P - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo.

Taufikh (LKK Auto) =taufikh@ikkauto.com= Thu, Feb 15, 2018 at 11.11 AM
To: laxiscs{@siengg.com
o ACCOUNTS@dingauto.sg, ADMIN@dingautomative.com.sg, vicalpeh@lkkaulo.com

1 Ades o
COR Ifs 5650, 2 days

papard:
Tauhkh

Kl Bko

From: lax|sosi@stengg.com [r'l'lilil‘tl;l:1ax:3c5@5ler1gg.culﬂ]

Sent: Friday, 19 January 2018 1:58 PM ]
To: laufikn@@ikkauto.com L
Cc: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG; ADMIN@DING&UTDMDTWE.CUM_SG

Subject: SHB4588F - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo.

Hi Taufikh

Slegee see below for the finalize according 1o our conversion to finalize for SHB4588P

ﬂfmah:e Amount
fotal Repair - 2 Days

Labour - $420

Special Netts - $0

Parls - $536.90

Pans after 20% discount =$429.52 h-
Total L+S+P =849.52 -20% LUMP SUM

Final Amaunt = 5679.616

Please help lo close this case ASAP
Thanks

Best Regards

Ding Automotive Pte Lid

Alex Khong
Hp 83039588

hups.s‘.frnnul.g.n-nglu.cbm.-'rnml.n'ufﬂ:"?uwzmr.:HI1ﬂM&pﬁFﬁGﬂﬂleﬂ.eh.&uﬂtm&m=151 B??E&h&cﬂ&ﬁ&&mhmnbﬂ:mﬂﬂﬁ19??25n3:. 12



SHB4588P - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo.
Taxis Customer Service 1o taufikh Eri 19 Jan 2018 01:58 PM

CC ACCOUNTS, ADMIN

[We encourage everyone to do his / her part in helping o preserve the environment. Kindly refrain from printing
this email unless it is absolutely necessary ]

Hi Taufikh

Please see below for the finalize according to our conversion to finalize for SHB4588P

[ — [ — e - e

DSC02023.JPG DSC02024.JPG DSC02025.JPG DSC02027.JPG DSC02028.JPG DSC02025.JPG

Finalize Amount
Total Repair - 2 Days

Labour - $420

Special Netts - S0

Parts - $536.90

Parts after 20% discount =$429.52
Total L+S+P =848 52 -20% LUMP SUM

Final Amount = $679.616
Please help to close this case ASAP

Thanks

Best Regards

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Alex Khong

Hp 83039588

[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please
delete it and notify us immediately: you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its
contents to any other person. Thank you]
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Vehicie No:_SHBHSEE @ Relief ) Job Card No. __ Coliokw

Reporting Date: ' /O !/ 1§ Time: | S SChrs FSMS REP.NO.CC |golo3eA

Accident Date: [ / &1/ 1% Time:\ > Othrs SAS No.MSK. | 19608442

[op ATP] WC / Cash ] [PE: Q1 [sPDL Km/H] Mbeagas__JOSSSH -
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[Location: .
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Ping AuTomotive rie Lt

Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Est. sector C, #01-20, Singapore 575645
Tel:6452 1208, Fax:6452 0614

i ETReH

= H#ﬂ-——‘g::——"'_
TJO FAX NO:
ESTIMATE REPORT 15T Quatation 16/01/2018 B33
JOB-NQ: 50110447
'S P, u
NAME: CiyCab PTELTD (Fleat) COMNTACT: 85533680 Paga 1of 2
ADDRESS: 383 SIN MING DRIVE £4730522
SINGAPORE 5757170
VEHICLE DETAILS
LICENSE NO:  SHB4588P TRANS: AUTO CHASSIS: KMHLB41UMHUDE8352
MAKE | MODEL: HYLUNDA! | 40 ENGINE:  D4FDGUTOT3ED
OWNER'S INSURER: EIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
JOB-CODE: TP SA: Ding Auto User 1
CLAIM DETAILS
QUOTED  MARK UP WARKLIP - REV

DESCAIPTION ary COSTS apce IND SURDER  ppep
+ PANEL BEAT A STRAIGHTENCHASSIS ~ 100 80040 0.00 800,00 v A0
2 CHECK WIRING 1.00 80,00 £.00 80,00 v -1t
1 R4 RBOOTLID COMPOENENT 1.00 80,00 0.00 80.00 Yoz X
4 RUST PROOFING 1,00 &0.00 0.00 £0.00 Y- ¥
§ SPRAY BOOTLID AND REAR BUMPER 100 60000 0.00 B00.00 ¥ 2 [il]

TOTAL: 1,600.00 0.00 1,800.00
1 REAR BUMPER 100 53830 0.00 538.50 ¥ dg >
2 REFLECTOR RRHS 1.00 30,60 0.00 30,50 ¥ ;{
3 REFLECTOR RLHS 1.00 3080 0.00 30.60 ¥
4 REAR BUMPER RENFORMENT 1.00 428.40 000 £28.40 Y !
5 REAR REINFORMENT BRACHET AHS 1,00 D30 .00 B0.30 T
& REAR REFLECTOR BRACKET LHE 1,00 8030 o 80.30 ¥
7 REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET RHS 1,00 35,60 .00 45,80 v X
& REAR BUMPER S!DE BRACKET LHS 1.00 3550 0.00 3560 Y o

TOTAL: 1,288.30 0.00 1,258.30
TOTAL PARTS & LABOUR 2,858.30 0.00 2,858.30
EXCESSLOADING:BS ﬂ.un f
Mo, Of Day:
RE-SURVEY: BEFOREIAF @nms
PART-BY-PART OR LUM

|
OATE OF SURVEY: r | o HG
. - ] T |
SURVEYED BY: g £l gy 2°
G

CONTACT NO: Q’}‘fﬂ'ﬂ i‘IFM{ND: g --D—J'n I__’z
NOTE: LUMP UM AMOUNT WOULD BE REVISED IF SUPBLEMENT REPAIR IS REQUIRED T ot o\ ?)j‘i‘ - 5?'2.
DAt .
Ding Auto User 1 - qu’ C{ (:[1: (
ESTIMATOR
STA ALUTOCENTRE
TEL: Fax:

G-STAR-WIET-001-02-Revi0



CLAIM DETAILS

CQUGTED  MARKUP LARKLUP REV
okl " IND SURDISP
DESCRIPTION oTY COSTS Pl —

G-STAR-WI-ET-001-02-Revil



Ding Automotive Pte Ltd

8lk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Est. Secto

Tel:6452 1208, Fax:6452 0614

r C, $#01-20, Singapore 575645

TO Fa NO:
E TE RT 15T Quaotation 161012018 8:33
JOB-NO: 50110447
OWNER'S PARTICULARS
MAME: CltyCab PTE LTD (Fleet) CONTACT: 65533880 Page 1of 2
ADDRESS: 383 SN MING CRIVE 847308522
SINGAPORE 875717 0
VEHICLE DETAILS
LICENSE NO:  SHB4538P TRANS: AUTO CHASSIS:  KMHLB41UMHUO98352
MAKE [ MODEL:  HYUNDAI [ 40 ENGIME:  DAFDGUTOTIGD
OWNER'S INSURER: FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
JoB-cODE: TR sa: Ding Aute User 1
I DO LS
QUOTED  MARK UP MARKUP s REW
OESCRIETION ary COSTS pricE NP DISP ppyce
LABOUR
1 PANEL BEAT & STRAIGHTEN CHASSIS 100 80060 .00 A00.00 ¥ Q GT
2 CHECK WIRING 1.00 60.00 a.00 &0.00 vy 20-
1 R AR BOOTLID COMPOEMNENT 1 20,00 0.00 £0,00 ¥ K ¥ 'vT
4 RUST PROOFING 1.00 60.00 a.00 £0.00 Y X an
5 SPRAY BOOTLID AND REAR BUMPER 1,00 00,00 0.00 600,00 W [l
TQTAL: 1,800.00 0.00 1,600.00 ylo
WA LS et
1 REAR BUMPER 100 53690 0.00 536.90 ¥ dﬂ =
2 REFLECTOR RRHS 1.00 3060 0.00 30,80 ¥ ;
1 REFLECTOR RLHS 1.00 3060 a.00 30,60 v
4 REAR BUMPER REINFORMENT 1.00 A428.40 0.00 42840 W d 5{'
5 REAR REINFORMENT BRACKET RHS 1.0 80.30 000 80,30 v 1 il
& REAR REFLECTOR BRAGKET LHS 1.00 8030 .00 £0,30 ¥ 4
7 REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET RHS 1.00 35,80 0,00 3560 ¥ Z‘
§ REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET LHS 1,00 3560 0.00 3580 Y X
TOTAL: 1,268.30 0.00 1,256.30
TOTAL PARTS & LABOUR 2,858.30 0.00 285830
- o
EXCESSILOADING:SS 0,00 ; {;"1“1 7
No. Of Day: WA 20~ 215
RE-SURVEY: BEFORE/AFTER PAINTING wlo
PART-BY-PART OR LUMF BLIM: 55 ) 3
oATE OF survey: L= 1\ IE:LIEJ:AA m
SURVEYED BY: T LJ 'Ji <l)
CONTACT NO: pfr}\‘f i ﬁ‘i ‘ iFAX NO: ‘J‘?
NOTE: LUMP SUM AMOUNT WOULD BE REVISERIFSUTP LIRED

DaAutatnd
Ding Auta User 1

ESTIMATOR
STA ALUTOCENTRE
TEL: FaxX:

the Repairer ul the ir:-'liowmg
« To resurvey before/atier spray painting
« To display damaged part{s) during resurvey
» Parts prices ara subject 1o confirmation
« Third party survey = on @ “Witnoul Prajudice” basa
« Ng lllegal modification|s) is allowed
» Supplemeantary (lemis] s e resurveyed and
ln subject to final approval from Insurance Compa

Acknowledged by Repairer
Siqgnatuse:
Date:

G-STAR-WI-ET-001-02-Revi0




CLAIM AILS
QUOTED  MARK UP MARKLUP REV

j BIsP
DESCRIPTION oy COSTS price 'ND SURDISE  popcp

G-STAR-WI-ET-001-02-RevDi



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Accounts Ding Auto <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 March, 2018 11:28 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Cc: Kenneth Ding; Kelly Ding; DAMtaxi; Sales Ding Auto; Admin Ding Auto; Ding Ding
Auto; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: (REF : CC4/QBE18001047/T1hb3) BILLING FOR SHBA4588P TP CLAIMS AGAINST
SLGY627D ON 11/1/2018

Attachments: SHE4588F (DV).pdf; SHBA588P (REPAIR INVOICE).pdf

Dear Vic,

Please view attached file for signed DV and repair invoice.
We will also mail both original invoice to your office.

Kindly revert back regarding payment as soon as possible.
*NOTE: Payment is to be made to Ding Automotive Pte Ltd.

Thank you so much.

Yours Sincerely,

Fang XinYi Michelle
Office Contact : 92394128
Ding Automotive Pte L1d

On Mon, Mar 26, 2018 at 4:55 PM, Vic (LKK Auto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

RESEND

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Michelle,

We refer to your below email and kindly ignore our previous offer made due to type error.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal mandate and we offer settlement as follows:



Cost of Repair (w/gst) 5 595.50
Loss of Rental (5116.82 x 3 days) 5 35046
Loss of Income (550 x 3 days) $  150.00
GlA Search Fee 5 2.00

TOTAL $ 1,197.96

and sign the attached DV and forward back to us the original signed copy
riginal hard copy) for our Principal to

If agreeable, kindly let the owner chop

process the payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to DING AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD.

Thank you.

"plegse note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on o without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
<hould also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Qur offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely ta resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other refated matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
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Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an

unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a viclation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the

read this e-mail or any attached items.
attachments and any copies thereof, Thank you.

sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all



From: Accounts Ding Auto [mailto:accounts@dingauto.sg

Sent: Friday, 23 March, 2018 3:20 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kenneth Ding; Kelly Ding; DAMtaxi; Sales Ding Auto; Admin Ding Auto; Ding Ding Auto

Subject: Re: (REF: CC4/QBE18001047/T1hb3) BILLING FOR SHBA588P TP CLAIMS AGAINST SLG9627D ON
11/1/2018

Dear Vic,

We have already e-mailed all supporting document.

But we still have not get back any update at your end.

Kindly update us on the states so that we can close the case as soon as possible.

Thank you so much,

Yours Sincerely,
Fang XinYi Michelle
Office Contact : 92394128

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd

On Sat, Mar 3, 2018 at 11:48 AM, Accounts Ding Auto <gccounts@dingauto.sg= wrote:

Dear Vic,

We have already e-mailed all supporting document.

But we still have not get back any update at your end.

Kindly update us on the states so that we can close the case as soon as possible.



Thank you so much.

Yours Sincerely,
Fang XinYi Michelle
Office Contact : 92394128

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd

On Mon, Feb 19, 2018 at 11:19 AM, Accounts Ding Auto <accounts@dingauto.sg> wrote:

Dear Vic,

Ref : CC4/QBE18001047/T1hb3

Please see attached supporting document to claims against your insured .

We have completed the repair, driver has collected the vehicle and your surveyor has finalize the repair at
$650 - total 2 days repair job.

We would like to claim for our insured as per following :

Total Number of days : 3

Repair Cost : $650 + 7% = $695.50
Loss of Rental : $116.82 x 3 = $350.46
Loss of Income : $80 x 3 = $240

LTA Search Fee : $1.87 + 7% = $2

Kindly revert back with our offer so that we can issue our LOD & invoice and close the case as soon as possible.

Thank you so much.



Yours Sincerely,

Fang XinYi Michelle

HP Contact : 87483145
Office Contact : 92394128

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd



Satisfaction Voucher

Date: 17/01/2018

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

Attention: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

Dear SirfMagam

A F .
/0 f; (A1 Ol f'é/f:”ll

I/We hereby acknowledge having received from Singapore Technologies Kinetics

Lid. 248 Jalan Boon Lay,Singapore §19523, my/our vehicle number SHBE4588P
which has been repaired fo my/our satisfaction and acceptance. |['We admit that

the payment of SGD account for such repairs is in full discharge

of mylour claim upon the corporation under the policy number D-15072702MFSH
reference claim number 50110447 in respect of the damage caused 1o the

said vehicle in an accident that occurred therelo or about the 11/01/2018

at ALONG KALLANG AVE APER

Dated this day of . 201

7
/1 I ff //ﬁ
Signature: { U

/ o - )
Y f [ 5
O -ty o A

—_— C.ompany Stamp if applicable

o,

Name: CityCab PTE LTD (Fleet)

Address: 383 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE 5757170

Eorm G-STAR-WI-FC-005-01- Rev00




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 109B07198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607196-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

OBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Ref : CC4/QBE18001047/T1hb3n2

1 RAFFLES QUAY #29-10 SOUTH .

TOWERSINGAPORE 048583 Gage= DDA NMM”"I“W ||I
Code: QBE

1.

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SLG 96270 Veh. Inspected SHB 4588P
Policy No. B-VO018006-MVA Coverage ($) D.00
Claim No. VCO11083 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JOYCE Assign Date 16/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. KMHLB4 1 UMHUOS8352 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 207824 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 TRIANGLE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 TRIANGLE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 TRIANGLE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/80 R16 TRIANGLE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  11/01/2018 Inspection Date 17/01/2018
Survey held at DING AUTO PTE LTD
BLK 10 #01-20 SIN MING IND EST SEC C SINGAPORE 575645
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Lbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R G5T Reg. No, 19-9607196-R Page Mo.:1of1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHB 4588P
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rkshup?;}] {S!J
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 536.90 536.90
1|REFLECTOR RRHS NOT NECESSARY 3080
1|REFLECTOR RLHS NOT NECESSARY 30.60 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORMENT NOT NECESSARY 428.40 -
1|REAR REINFORMENT BRACKET RHS NOT MECESSARY 80.30 -
1|REAR REFLECTOR BRACKET LHS NOT NECESSARY 80.20 -
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET RHS NOT NECESSARY 3560
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET LHS NOT NECESSARY 3560 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -107.38
1,258.30 429.52
LABOUR
PAMEL BEAT & STRAIGHTEN CHASSIS. B00.00 200.00
CHECK WIRING &80.00 20.00
RAR BOOTLID COMPONENT. NOT NECESSARY B0.00 -
RUST PROOFING. NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
SPRAY BOOTLID AND REAR BUMPER. &00.00 200.00
1,600.00 420.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,858.30 B849.52
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS £50.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/QBE18001047/T1hb3n2
—@ {l
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor
Automotive ASSessor
DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: This Report is made solaly for the uss and benefil of the Clberl named on the front page of this Report.
b Hability of responsibiiite whatscever, in contact or tor is accented to any KNS Rary e fa- BRI Eepor whally or n part, Any third early acting or replying on this
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