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o i ‘l REF A4 /

ALn" ASSIGNMENT
Kennet

From [ale

)] ) -
Veh No j//(’: 5¢Jd/‘/\ Regn ’/ ) 6’5

Estimatsd Cost:

Type: M.Car I M.Cycle | Bus / Van | Lorry | @1‘ Prime Mover |

on@}wsnp RES | OD RES { EVA/ INV/ MV
To Inspect Vehicle No:

Truck | Trailer or

Make: ‘75:7 ( Phenn C.C 255 f:/

at Workshop m/s : ,_/:?‘_,4 7 ( aé Colour h-—f ;;Z( /A, _» NC  Insured/Std/NI/NA
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Jet Ting (Admin-B)

From: Tan Tiong Beng [tantiong.beng@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 26 January, 2013 1:34 PM

To: admin-b@lkkauto.com

Cc: Belliana Lim

Subject: Direct Settlement / Trans-Cab Auto / C0259268 / OD SJA6778B / TP SHC5406U /
08.01.13 / EST $4503.02 /LB

Attachments: Preliminary Advice.pdf; Estimated..pdf, SHC 5406U - - TP GIA REPORT ..pdf; SJIAG6778B -
080113.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Ol GIA.

Dear Belliana,

Pls input VTP & affect the NCD in AS400. Thank you.

From: Jet Ting (Admin-B) [mailto:admin-b@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2013 2:42 PM

To: Winnie Ho Ping Ping; Tan Tiong Beng; Kitty Teo Poh Guek

Cc: "Jesslyn Soh'

Subject: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl SJA 6778B (OI) & SHC 5406U (TP) ON 08/01/2013 (LKK Ref :
CC3/AXA13001447/Kv1f3)

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 5406U AT M/s Trans-Cab Auto Service.
Enclosed herewith a copy of TP's GIA report, estimated cost of repair and preliminary advise for your perusal.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jesslyn and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051

Thanks & Regards,

Jet Ting

LKK Auto Consultants PL
DID: 6841 1972

FAX: 6741 4108



Jet Ting (Admin-B)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear Sir/Madam,

Jet Ting (Admin-B) [admin-b@lkkauto.com]

Tuesday, 22 January, 2013 2:42 PM

'Winnie Ho Ping Ping’; 'Tan Tiong Beng'; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek'

'Jesslyn Soh'

Direct Settlement - Acc Invl SJA 6778B (Ol) & SHC 5406U (TP) ON 08/01/2013 (LKK Ref
- CC3/AXA13001447/Kv1f3)

Preliminary Advice.pdf; Estimated..pdf; SHC 5406U - - TP GIA REPORT..pdf

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 5406U AT M/s Trans-Cab Auto Service.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP's GIA report, estimated cost of repair and preliminary advise for your perusal.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jesslyn and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051

Thanks & Regards,
Jet Ting

LKK Auto Consultants PL

DID: 6841 1972
FAX: 6741 4108



! UU Auto

g Consultants
BARs B Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R

t

51 UBIAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your ref: To be advised
Our ref CC3/AXA13001447/Kv113 Date: 22/01/2013

The Motor Claims Department
M/s AXA Insurance Singpore Pte Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHC 5406U
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

21.01.13  at the premises of M/s TRANS-CAB and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount : 8§ 4,503.02

Revised Estimate Amount : S§ 653.00

"Check" Items Amount : S$ -

Market Value : S$ -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S$

Nett Value - S$ -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Front O/S Portion.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 1  days

Yours faithfully,

Kenneth
Licensed Appraiser



Electronic Driver Data Information & Enquiry System Page 1 of |

Status of Driving Licence

Licence Number: S8414572F

Status of Driving Licence: Valid

Classes of Licence: 2B,3

Expiry Date: Valid for life unless revoked, suspended or disqualified.

The above information is accurate as at 28/01/2013 12:01 AM

(Priﬁ‘_p [Bact{]

https://www.psi.gov.sg/NASApp/tmf/TMFServlet 28/1/2013



TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD i LI DAN
NO.58 DEFU LANE 1 SINGAPORE 539498 Ver Ayzp .
TEL NO.6287 6666 ~ FAX NO.6281 1400 y N S
CO/GST REG NO.201019626G v 3y
SHC5406U - Ly’ &5 2g]
Vehicle No.: SHC 5406U - LI DAN
Chassis No.: LXS12-00021359*
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: CROWN TAXI
Date of Accident : 08.01.2013
Third Party Insurer : AXA
PART LIST
1 1  Front Bumper Assembly $ By 417.40 —
2 1  Front Bumper Reinforcement / Beam $ R 269.35 y
3 1 Front Side Lamp RH $ e 170.60 —
4 1  Front Headlamp RH $ N 411.54
5 1  Front Support Panel Assy $ 7 626.30 £
6 1  Front Fender RH $ 7 732.83 X
$ 2,628.02
25% $ 657.01
TOTAL $ 1,971.02
Specical Nett
1 Set Front Bumper Fastener Clip $ M 12.00 «—
TOTAL $ 12.00
TOTAL PARTS $ 1,983.02

Panel Beating, Knocking And Straightening
The Necessary Portion, Remove And
Renewal Of Parts, Adjust And Realign The
Same

To Rust-Proofing Of The Affected Areas.
To Check Electrical Lighting Concerned.

Putty And Spray Painting Of The Affected
Portion.

1,000.00 0 &
A 900,00 X

100.00 2/

N 720,00 X



TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD LI DAN
NO.58 DEFU LANE 1 SINGAPORE 539498

TEL NO.6287 6666 ~ FAX NO.6281 1400

CO/GST REG NO.201019626G

SHC5406U -

To Remove And Refit Interior Fittings,

Trimings, Garnish, Fittings And Other, To
Enable repair. $ YA 250.00 A

To Transfer Of Fender Fittings, Attachments

And Perform Water Seepage Test. $ *n o 150.00 X
Towing Fees. $ MV~ 100.00 X
TOTAL § 2,520.00
Over All Total $ 4,503.02
Total Repair Days ,Oﬁ)ays
/ o

7



Ai Chin

From: Belliana Lim [belliana.lim@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 15 April, 2013 10:39 AM

To: Ai Chin

Subject: RE: Your ref: C0259268;0ur ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kef3
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Without Prejudice

Hi Ai Chin

We refer to your below e-mail.
Please proceed to offer based on 50:50 and please write to Insured first before confirming any settlement with TP.

Thank you.

Belliana Lim

Executive — Motor Claims

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way, #27-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811

belliana.lim@axa.com.sqg
DID: (65) 6880 4269 Fax: (65) 6880 4838

Website: www.axa.com.sg

M redefining /insurance

Tiis message Is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and
AXA. Any unauthorised disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From 14 March 2011, AXA Insurance will be located at 8 Shenton Way, #27-01 Singapore 068811.
Our Customer Service Centre will be located at #B1-01. All contact numbers remain unchanged.

iﬁ Please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Ai Chin [mailto:chaiac@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, April 12, 2013 7:43 PM

To: Belliana Lim
Subject: Your ref: C0259268;0ur ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kef3

Your ref: C0259268
Qur ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kef3
Dear Ms. Belliana Lim,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJA 6778B AND SHC 5406U ON 08 JANUARY 2013.
1



We refer to the above matter.
We have inspected TP vehicle at M/S TRANSCAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD. The estimate cost of repair is S$ 4,503.02.

TP reported that he was travelling straight at Carpark Driveway between BLK 269-267A Toh Guan Road. There are two
humps before the bend, so he slowed down and turn left. Suddenly vehicle B, SJA 6778B made a sharp turn from
opposite direction and cut into his lane and collided onto his taxi’s right front portion.

Ol reported that he was driving along the driveway and car B, SHC 5406U went over the bump without slowing down,
swerved into his lane and hit the right front portion of his car.

We called up to Ol verified the accident happened, he mentioned that TP swerved into his lane and resulted the
collision but no proof/evidence. Furthermore, he mentioned that he did not see any passenger in taxi.

However, we have received a copy of witness statement from TP workshop. See attachment. Based on BOLA 32, this
case should be 50/50% liability.

Kindly let us have your instruction regarding this matter.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Ai Chin

LKK Auto Censultants Pte Ltd
Tel : 6841 2132

Fax : 6741 4108



U U Auto

= T Consultants
Bdn BE B Pte Lid

31 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kv1f3
AXA Claim No: C0259268

13/02/2013

YEE WAI KEONG
Block 270 Toh Guan Road
#12-105

Singapore 600270

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJA 6778B & SHC 5406U ON 08/01/2013

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
(AXA) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or
your authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 23/02/2013, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Accordingly your No Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) may not be preserved.
However, if you are making a claim against third party and successful with 80% in your
favor, our principal will re-instate your NCD.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Y

Zayer

Case Handler

DID: 6749 9635

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: zayyer@lkkauto.com

c.c. AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



STATEMENT OF A WITNESS TO AN ACCIDENT
NAME OF WITNESS : s v T 194 ABene
NRIC/PASSPORT NO.: S ©/9? 39 :2.?%

ADDRESS : ALock 2 ‘/;? H# 0 - & #/
Jarols @Sy .2y Sjpﬁf? o023
TELEPHONENO. ///’/a : 6938272

E-MAIL ADDRESS

BRIEF FACTS : A motor accident has taken place on g{ / /20! % atabout /2 /7 g7

along/at junction /location of ._?{;_;(a’/eﬂ Losp OF ZLOCK 2L, 72 & 2 '
Terts Crann /RED
between vehicle 5.74 47 7f2and vehicle %€ £ %0641 am an eye-witness/passenger

in the taxi and I wish to recount its happening as follows :

A Z os e LeSeniy 7’ FPue Sye swofu

//arle///u.f 72 &'.,/aae;gﬂ e‘ffc-f- ¥Aep  ar A?/f/m

4 a/ ( E:’/ / /:.y/ z) & ,év'ﬂm.qr ,/rm/ BaZioeen
ek 26/2" & 259 @eotteer Car (S8 577p5)

Feeliiy ot W“ﬁ’ 4% Speed [eboca &0 Hop

Cohr € C’/‘Mﬂo; M’é "‘y’ 2 /a;Z Genel Y/ 7/‘{(:_'

%"{)‘é’n /’é’ﬂ/f.«

I affirmed the above statement true and correct,

Date : &?//%L?

g PEy 7avpmiens
P 3 $22/2



Thank You.

Best Regards,
Ai Chin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Tel : 6841 2132

Fax : 6741 4108

From: Belliana Lim ilto:belli li m.

Sent: Monday, 27 May, 2013 2:22 PM

To: Ai Chin
Subject: RE: Your ref: C0259268;0ur ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kef3

Hi Ai Chin

We maintain our offer at 50% unless TP’s witness agrees to sign SD then we will re-consider the matter.
Alternatively, since quantum is rather small, you can offer to TP based on global sum (around 60% liability maximum).

Thank you.

Belliana Lim

Executive — Motor Claims

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

8 Slhonlon Way, #27-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811

DID: (65) 6880 4269 Fax: (65) 6880 4838
Website: www.axa.com.sq

M redefining /insurance

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and
AXA. Any unauthorised disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message
please notify the sender immediately.

From 14 March 2011, AXA Insurance will be located at 8 Shenton Way, #27-01 Singapore 068811,
Our Customer Service Centre will be located at #81-01. All contact numbers remain unchanged.

b—,ﬁ Please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Ai Chin :chaiac@|

Sent: Thursday, May 16, 2013 4:42 PM

To: Belliana Lim

Subject: FW: Your ref: C0259268;0ur ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kef3

Dear Ms. Belliana Lim,

Before we seek instruction from you, we had sent out the letter to insured on 13 February 2013. However, no response
from insured up to date. Enclosed the letter to insured for your perusal.

Furthermore, TP repairer do not agreed to settle of equal liability due to got the witness statement and cost of repair
oniy $ 500,



Kindly let us have your instruction please.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Ai Chin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel : 6841 2132

Fax: 6741 4108

From: Belliana Lim [mailto:belliana.lim@axa.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 15 April, 2013 10:39 AM
To: Ai Chin

Subject: RE: Your ref: C0259268;0ur ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kef3

Without Prejudice

Hi Ai Chin
We refer to your below e-mail.
Please proceed to offer based on 50:50 and please write to Insured first before confirming any settlement with TP.

Thank you.

Belliana Lim

Executive — Motor Claims

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

8 Shenton \Way, #27-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811

DID: (65) 6680 4269 Fax: (85) 6880 4838
Website: www.axa.com.sg

M redefining /insurance

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a writton agreement between you and
AXA. Any unautherised disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not tha intended recipient of tha message,
piease notify the sender immediately.

From 14 March 2011, AXA Insurance will be located at 8 Shenton Way, #27-01 Singapore 068811.
Our Customer Service Centre will be located at #B1-01. All contact numbers remain unchanged.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Ai Chin [mailto:chaiac@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, April 12, 2013 7:43 PM

To: Belliana Lim

Subject: Your ref: C0259268;0ur ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kef3

3



Your ref: C0259268

Our ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kef3

Dear Ms. Belliana Lim,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJA 6778B AND SHC 5406U ON 08 JANUARY 2013.

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle at M/S TRANSCAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD. The estimate cost of repair is S$ 4,503.02.
TP reported that he was travelling straight at Carpark Driveway between BLK 269-267A Toh Guan Road. There are two
humps before the bend, so he slowed down and turn left. Suddenly vehicle B, SJA 6778B made a sharp turn from

opposite direction and cut into his lane and collided onto his taxi’s right front portion.

Ol reported that he was driving along the driveway and car B, SHC 5406U went over the bump without slowing down,
swerved into his lane and hit the right front portion of his car.

We called up to Ol verified the accident happened, he mentioned that TP swerved into his lane and resulted the
collision but no proof/evidence. Furthermore, he mentioned that he did not see any passenger in taxi.

However, we have received a copy of witness statement from TP workshop. See attachment. Based on BOLA 32, this
case should be 50/50% liability.

Kindly let us have your instruction regarding this matter.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Ai Chin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel : 6841 2132

Fax ;6741 4108



Ai Chin

From: Belliana Lim [belliana.lim@axa.com sg]

Sent: Friday, 4 October, 2013 1:48 PM

To: Ai Chin

Subjeet: RE: Your ref: C0259268;0ur ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kef3
Dear Ai Chin

Noted, please send us your survey report and invoice.

Thanks.

Belliana Lim

Exscutive — Motor Claims

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way, #27-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811

DID: (68) 5880 4269 Fax: (65) 6880 4838
Website: vwsy.axa.com.sq

E redefining /insurance

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and
AXA. Any unauthorised disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended reciplent of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From 14 March 2011, AXA Insurance will be located at 8 Shenton Wa y, #27-01 Singapore 068811.
Our Customer Service Centre will be located at #81-01. All contact numbers remain unchanged.

ﬁ Please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Ai Chin [mailto:chalac@Ilkkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, October 04, 2013 11:48 AM

To: Balliana Lim

Subject: RE: Your ref: C0259268;0ur ref: CC3/AXA13001447/Kef3

Your ref: C0259268

Dear Ms. Belliana Lim,

We refer to the below email.

Kindly be informed that TP repairer , M/s Trans-cab Auto Service Pte Ltd for, is not willing to accept our offer and
mentioned that will produce the witness statement in SD form.

However during our several round table meetings with them, they are still unable to produce the document.

In view of above, we intend to close the file temporary. If there are any new development in future, please inform us
and we will follow Jp if required.

For your approval please.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

45— 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Ref - CC3/AXA13001447/Keb3y
8 SHENTON WAY #27-01SINGAPORE 068811 e I“"l”l"lﬂl""lm || |||
ATTN: BELLIANA LIM Code: AXA2

1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJA 6778B Veh. Inspected SHC 5408U
Policy No. P1111186 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. C0259268 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 21/01/2013
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTACROWN c.C 2986
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2005
Chassis No. LXS120021359 Colour WHITE / RED
Odometer 920767 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |175/80R14 WEST LAKE 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |175/80R14 WEST LAKE 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |175/80R14 WEST LAKE 2mm
L/H Rear Tyre 175/80R14 WEST LAKE 2 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/01/2013 Inspection Date 21/01/2013
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTELTD
58 DEFU LANE 1
SINGAPORE 539498
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IEST]MATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 1 Working Days




|

ey

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 5406U

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page No.:1 of 2

il 2y . Estimate By | Our Adjusted
‘Description of Parts Condition R L e
o il ondition |\orkshop (§))|  (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER ASSEMBLY (CONSISTENT) BENT / CRACKED 417.40 417.40
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT/BEAM (CONSISTENT) [TO REPAIR SEE 269.35 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT SIDE LAMP RH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 170.60 170.60
1|FRONT HEADLAMP RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 411.54 .
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL ASSY (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 626.30 .
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER RH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 732.83 P
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -657.00 -147.00
1,971.02 441.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT BUMPER FASTENER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 12.00 12.00
(CONSISTENT)
12.00 12.00
LABOUR °
PANEL BEATING, KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 1,000.00 180.00
NECESSARY PORTION, REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS, ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME. INCLUSIVE
OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT BUMPER
REINFORCEMENT/BEAM, FRONT SUPPORT PANEL ASSY
AND FRONT FENDER RH.
TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. NOT NECESSARY 200.00 "
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED. 100.00 20.00
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED NOT NECESSARY 720.00 L
PORTION.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR FITTINGS, TRIMINGS, |NOT NECESSARY 250.00 z
GARNISH,
FITTINGS AND OTHER, TO ENABLE REPAIR.
TO TRANSFER OF FENDER FITTINGS, ATTACHMENTS  |[NOT NECESSARY 150.00
AND PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TOWING FEES. NOT NECESSARY 100.00
2,520.00 200.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,503.02 653.00

Report Ref No, CC3/AXA13001447/Keb3y
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Page No..2 of 2
500.00

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC3/AXA13001447/Keb3y

Az

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser




