Jet Ting (Admin-B)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:
Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Categories:

Dear Belliana,

Tan Tiong Beng [tantiong.beng@axa.com.sg]

Saturday, 26 January, 2013 1:34 PM

admin-b@lkkauto.com

Belliana Lim

Direct Settlement / Trans-Cab Auto / C0259268 / OD SJA6778B / TP SHC5406U /
08.01.13/ EST $4503.02 / LB

Preliminary Advice.pdf; Estimated..pdf; SHC 5406U - - TP GIA REPORT..pdf; SJA6778B -
080113.pdf

Follow up
Flagged

Ol GIA.

Pls input VTP & affect the NCD in AS400. Thank you.

From: Jet Ting (Admin-B) [mailto:admin-b@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2013 2:42 PM
To: Winnie Ho Ping Ping; Tan Tiong Beng; Kitty Teo Poh Guek

Cc: 'Jesslyn Soh'

Subject: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl SJA 6778B (OI) & SHC 5406U (TP) ON 08/01/2013 (LKK Ref :

CC3/AXA13001447/Kv1f3)

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 5406U AT M/s Trans-Cab Auto Service.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP’s GIA report, estimated cost of repair and preliminary advise for your perusal.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jesslyn and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051

Thanks & Regards,
Jet Ting

LKK Auto Consultants PL

DID: 6841 1972
FAX: 6741 4108



