Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July, 2019 2:37 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SDJ 901A ON 15.01.2018 / EQ GBD 991U
Attachments: 16072019143500.pdf

Dear Vic

Enclosed a copy of the Letter of Authority as requested by you.
Thank you.
Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 16 July, 2019 2:04 PM

To: Jenny Lim

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SDJ 901A ON 15.01.2018 / EQ GBD 991U

Without Prejudice
Dear Jenny,

Noted with thanks.

Kindly furnish us a copy of the duly signed Authorization Letter signed by the owner for us to close the matter.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer

in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge
Voucher (for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us

after we have made payment on the settlement sum.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

57424

" Save the Larth Print only whern recessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Jenny Lim [mailto:jenny.lim@Ilaihuat.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 16 July, 2019 1:51 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SDJ 901A ON 15.01.2018 / EQ GBD 991U

Dear Joy

We are agreeable to accept your offer as provided therein.
Please let us have the payment.

Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 2 April, 2019 4:20 PM

To: Jenny Lim

Cc: Admin A

Subject: SDJ 901A ON 15.01.2018 / EQ GBD 991U

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jenny,
We refer to the subject.

On without prejudice basis and without admission of liability, we offer global sum $9,200.00 (all-in).

Kindly confirm acceptance within seven (7) days from the date of this offer.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.



