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y L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AdE ma ™ 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
- Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
S SIS 57 gt Aflated fo Federation Internalionale Des Exparts En Automoble . 17
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD "~ Ref :  CS/ASM18007023M1qp
A ORERSINGAFORE 6t ooe: oo | [T
Code: ASM
fumt oL SiEL e Policy Particulars - OWN DAMAGE
Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected SLP 43668
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. $8M00728 Excess ($) 700.00
Assign From  SMART CLAIM (YVONNE ANG) [Assign Date 17/01/2018
p i " Vehicle Particulars & Condition -+ e
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3.0 S A ... - _.Conditions of Tyres o
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
Ainos oS M oo eesiDescription of Damages o
5.0 . oL Fy .. - General information Lt e
Accident Date  11/01/2018 inspection Date 17/01/2018
Survey held at EM SOLUTION PTE LTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #03-18/19
SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
ba: e e e e i Remarks e
A)THE MARKET VALUE IS §$-———-—(EST. AVERAGE)
BN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHOR!SED REPAIRS,




117/2018 Claim Portal

KK AUTO CONSUTANTZ PTE YD OD) - Mernu

Service Request Details
Claim
S8M00728

Reference

None &

Loss Date
January 11, 2018

Request Date
January 17, 2018

Due Date
January 24, 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

Type of Loss
Incident Only

Services
Accelerated workshop survey
Actions

Next Step
Agree to perform service

Decline Work: Accepl Work

Vehicle information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SLP43665

Make
HONDA

hitps:/ivp.smariclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/html/index-vendor-service-requests. himl#/service-requests/?serviceRequestNumber=25865 1/2



11712018 Claim Portal

%

Mernu

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured
YiXIU CHEN
BLK 461 CHOA CHU KANG AVENUE 4, #03-81, 680461, Singapore, Singapore

97596619
BLUEMOON_YX@HOTMAIL.COM

Claim Handler

Default Owner

Additional Instructions
EXCESS $700 PENDING DRIVING LICENSE

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes

e Messago

https:h‘vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg.’claim~portallhtmI/index-vendor-service—requests.html#lservice-requestsl?serviceRequestNumber=25865 212



‘Ma C.F (LKKAuto) | L

From; EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 March, 2018 11:53 AM

To: Ma C.F (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION SLP 43665

Mr. Ma,

Ok Agreed.

Thanks & regards,

Bernard

HP: 81018302

From: Ma C.F (LKKAuto) [mailto:MaCF@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 19 January, 2018 5:36 PM ,

To: EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg> '
Subject: FINALIZATION SLP 43665 T

Dear Bernard,

SLP 43665 P/P REPAIR $4168.52 (BEFORE EXCESS) 4 W/DAYS

Warmest Regards,

Ma Chin Fook

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
HP : 84028474

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: macf@l_kkauto.com



LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD} ~ Menu

© Question

Message

Dear Yvonne, we have received supplementary of $316.16 from repairer. Qur surveyor had since checked
and verified the supplementary parts and is of the view that the supplementary parts are consistent to the
nature of the accident and is economical to repair. - Shiau Chan

Reply




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 January 2018 3:04 PM
To: ‘emautosolution@singnet.com.sg’

Cc: SUR

Subject: VEHICLE SLP 4366S (DOA: 11/01/2018)

Dear Bernard,
As spoken with you.
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLP 43665 (Excess $700/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Shiau Chan {(LKKAuto)

#

From: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 18 January 2018 3:00 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto})

Subject: RE: VEHICLE SLP 4366S (YOUR REF: 58M00728)

Piease proceed to authorize repair

Yvonne Ang
Assistant Manager
Motor (Property) Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg
DID; 1800 880 4888

redefining /insurance

AMAs Values at Work:

Customer Inte
o= @ 0%

Please consider the environment before printing this email
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

ONE
. AXA

From: Shiau Chan {LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 18, 2018 2:43 PM

To: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>

Subject: VEHICLE SLP 4366S (YOUR REF: S8M00728)

Dear Yvonne,

Kindly advise on authorisation as the driver’s driving license copy uploaded.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

----- Disclaimer--—-
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have

i 1



| [ 74 7

- W Consulfants
i BA W Pte Lid

31 UBI AVE 1, #01.25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: S8M00728 Date: 17™ January 2018

Our Ref: CS/ASM18001023/M1gb

The Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Singapore Pte L td

Attn: Yvonne Ang
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.__ SLP 43665

We thank you for the instruction on 17/01/2018 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 17/01/2018 (1.41pm) at the premises of M/s EM SOLUTION and have
the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$ 9.998.60
Revised Estimate Amount : S$ 3.852.36
“Check” Items Amount . S$ 380.32
Total :S§ 4,232.68
Market Value :S§ 95,000.00
LTA Reimbursement Value : S$ 54.413.00
Nett Value : 5% 40,587.00
Description of Damage: nmarside

The vehicle sustained damages at the —
front portion. ‘

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.

Repair cost economical,

Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 working days.
We have NOT authorised the repairs.

Yours faithfully

MA CF.

Automobile Assessor



111712018

PARF/CGE Rebate Enqguiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner |D: 4621A
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SLP4366S
- Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended De-registrati-on Date: 17 Jan 2018
Vehicle Make: HONDA
Vehicle Model: VEZEL HYBRID 1.5X AUTO
Primary Colour: Blue “ -
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No.: LEB5945266
Chassis No.: RU31245249

Maximum Power Output:

112.0kW (150 bhp)

Open Market Value: $26,159.00

Original Registration Date: 05 Jun 2017

First Registration Date: 05 Jun 2017 |

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $5,000.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry [.)ate:r 04 Jun 2027-

PARF Rebate Amount: $3,750.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: - 04 Jun 2027

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp}

COE Period(Years): 10 |

QP Paid: $54,000.00

COE Rebate Amount: $50,663.00

Total Rebate Amount: $54,413.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Jan 2018

oK

https:llvrl.Ita.gov.sgfltalvrllactionlenquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTlON_I D=F0304009TT



MKKH18005702 / K Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd - HQ
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 11/01/2018 18:08
SUBMITTED BY: Wong Shu Man

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report comectly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to
repudiate policy ability.

4. The issue and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies,

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for Investigation.

B. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of
Singapore(GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 11/01/2018 18:08

Date Of Accident 11/01/2018 13:25

Exact Location Of Accident SLIP ROAD OF QUEENSWAY AND ALEXANDRA ROAD
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number

Name Of Registered 70wner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No

i Rt

Manufacturer
Model

kit

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

CHEN YIXIU
58124621A
BLUEMOON_YX@HOTMAIL.COM
(LOCAL) +65-97596619
OFFICE-97596619

VEZEL-1.5 (A)

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy YES

for repair to your vehicle?

i No, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category
Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver :

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Cf Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

PRIVATE CAR

COMPREHENSIVE
NO
GAZ168017

TAN CHUAN MUAN
50136746C

27/11/1952

INDOOR

22/10/1970

47 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +B5-98177822

NOEMAIL

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

Page 1 of 15



Address BLK 461 CHOA CHU KANG AVE 4 #03-81
Postcode 680461

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured PARENT

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

s

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR

Weather Conditions RAINING
Road Surface WET

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles involved in the accident
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance? NO

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
1 have been approached by unknown person(s)

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance. NO
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 2
Passenger 1 NAME: . EDWARD HAN

GENDER: : MALE

G\Ias the accident reported to the police?
If Yes,Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?
Circumsta \ |
PLEASE REFER TO SKETCH PLAN.

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

e

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Was there any audio recorded? NO
Name EDWARD HAN
Phone Number 96706453

Email Address

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number SLR1438C
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour SUZUKI VITARA
Details Cf Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Name of Driver LiM SEW HUI
NRIC/Passport Number S751278%H
Contact Number 97888708
Address

Page 2 of 15



Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 3 of 15



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process,

2. This Form must be co

3. information provided must be as truthful and aceurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withhelding of material
facts may allow insurance eomganies to repudiate policy liability.

4. The Issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy fability on the part of the hsurance
companies.

5. Any falze reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General insurance
Assaciation of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that coples of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested partles.

7. Bythe lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aforesaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA}
t understand, acknowiedge, agree and consent that:

(a] My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Assaciation of Singapore ["GIA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/ar process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other personal infarmation
provided by me or possessed by my Insurer (collectively the "Personal Information®) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to afl insurer{s) who have insured vehicle{s] involved in this accident (alf insurer{s) who have insured
vehiclels) lnvolved in this accldent shall be collectively referred to as the “insurers™), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Autharity of Singapare and anry relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purposeis}
of:

{i} processing, bandling snd/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessaty
investigations relating to the daims;

{ii} investigating the accident and/or my claims;
{#1) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

{iv} administering my ciaims {including the mailing of correspendence, statemants, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could invoive disclosure of certaln personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

{v} compiying with applicabie law n administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with sy claims.{collectively the
“Purposes”)

{b} allinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle{s) involved in this accident and the tnsurers’ lawyersflaw firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Perscnal Infermation for one or more of the above Purposes; and

{c} my Personal Information may/can be disciosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to thair third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited cutside of Singapore, far one or more of the above Purposes.

{d] oy Personat Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all future claims.

(el the Information so collected under {d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(i} toall insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, contralling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcemeant and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

(if) for complying with requirements urder any regulaticns, laws or court orders,

\/i/f 8’ @

iV
e —
Por :c\:y{i&*&gnamre = Driver'ggignature Reporting Lentze Personnel's Signature
Date & Time: £ (i driver is not the policyhoider) Name:
N Y \

Dute & Tinﬁ: [ MRIC/FIN No :

FPage 4 of 15



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAN

- DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

A Sep 43658 wes traveiling heimadl SLR 1438C

Roodd aml Queensway . P 43668 olvwer he

Ascrtruned  dhar SLP M&a SHrtepd Mo Vivy, hen 2

foloned . Fowever | CuF g e S%n’ped Suddn iy
w2t A wal ne  car (a ke mg;i raudd omd

tre Lhippedd roed w2 gl pno Wlup e gien

Dve _to -ihe  gudden swp by StR wndgc

Clerivees J SLP43B4C ,tii\ao,n “hnomi'u maving

o Slowy ;pﬂu‘ ueuuo{ ot S.-‘-uf tn g -

o ot rawﬁzzzi \5\ e peadkiad

L &{m@ A ollon W e s

DECLARATION
Ifwe dﬁi&re the foregoing particu%ars are uein every respect,
\ wyee
e A% L/ i
Pol!c‘ﬁhﬁ?der‘&inature <7 D[_g!gysngnamre Rep%rtmg Centrg: Personnel's Signature
Date & Time: {If driver is not the poficyolider} Name:
Company Ch \g {if applicable) Date 8 Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 6 of 15
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E M SOLUTION PTE LTD

160, Sin Ming Drive, #03-18/19, Sin Ming Autocity, Singapore 575722

Tel: 64560226 Fax: 64584500
Registration No: 201016308K
12.01.2018
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd
8, Shenton Way, #24-01
AXA Tower
Singapore 068811
ATTENTION: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT
REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR HONDA VEZEL - SLP 4366 S
1 pc. front bumper —1,127.50 Ak
2pecs  front bumper side retainers <ltg 86.00 N& =N\G o< v
1 pc front bumper tow hood cover ©28.50 N
1 pc front bumper lower grille 24220 2~V
2 pcs front bumper fog lamps 427.70 85540~ Q&
2 pcs front bumper fog lamp grilles 65.00 130.00 ¢ =u
1 pc front bumper lower diffuser 451.00,, v
1 pc front bumper reinforcement 421.20 ’? IV
2pcs  headlamps ~ WQ cva, @i‘m‘*@ 3,090.80
2pcs  headlamp lower brackets x54.20 X108.40 V<
1pc  frontgrille ——350.00 ==X &,
1pc front grille emblem — 43.30 AN
1pc bonnet ¥1,120.30
2pcs  bonnet hinges 62.30 ¥ 124.60 >
1pc  LH front fender 7680.00 Qv?\/
1pc LH front fender inner shield ¥161.20 <~&
1pc LH front fender arch garnish K183.30
1pc front support panel top garnish ¥163.30
10,267.00
Less 20% 2,053.40
8,213.60 8,213.60
1 set front bumper clips W~<+"35.00 SN
1) Check electrical wirings and headlamp focus <5000 &
2)  Repair damages and renew parts. —850700 L 0>
3)  Spray paint on affected portions 850.00 & O
9,998.60
Q&\l o—\/%‘\ —
f @ E L'« Auto Congultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:

%

m\cwm

\'?r\\\lm9
*?\

o d

w?gen%

» To resurvey beloniafier spray painting

» To dispiay damaged paei(s) during resurvey

» Pants prices are subject to confirmation

» Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis
o No illegal modification(s) is afiowed

« Suppiementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
i subject to final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Dole:

e



E M SOLUTION PTE LTD

160, Sin Ming Drive, #03-18/19, Sin Ming Autocity, Singapore 575722
Tel: 64560226 Fax: 54584500 '
Registration No: 201016308K

12.01.2018
AXA Insurance Pte Lid
8, Shenton Way, #24-01
AXA Tower
Singapore 068811
ATTENTION: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT
REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR HONDA VEZEL - SLP 4366 S
1pc.  front bumper L 112750 4 &
2pes  front bumper side retainers TS A43.000 B86.00 tL& G o Tag
1pc front bumper tow hood cover F28.50 “Sov
1pc front bumper lower grille 242,20 <2~ <
2 pcs front bumper fog lamps 427.70 85540~ < v
2pcs front bumper foq lamp grilles 65.00 13000 < -
tpe front bumper iower diffuser 451.00.,
1 pc front bumper reinforcement o 421207
2pcs  headlamps WG ove D T 1,995 40 3,890.80
2pcs  headlamp lower brackets TTB420 % 108.40 .
1pe front grille 35000 <7 5,
1pe front grilie emblem - 43.30 A )
ipc  bonnet 1,120.30 Ll
2pcs  bonnet hinges 62.30 7 124.60 * -y
1pc LH front fender #680.00 af\"m’
1 pc LH front fender inner shield *7161.20 -t
1pc LH front fender arch garnish 4 183.30 T T
1 pc front support panel top garnish ¥163.30 7"
- 10.267.00
Less 20% 2,053.40
8.213.60 8.213.60
1 set front bumper clps b 35.00 8N
1) Check electrical wirings and headlamp focus S5O000
2)  Repar damages and renew parts. S BSO0UT L
3)  Spray paint on affected portions 850.00 - 177
l "5 958.60
Ceen . T tiig Corsyltants hence notfy
VTR R Covl e Seaiver of e toiiowing:

o Tooes, o wrtore’sfer spegy peshing
T : sart! 8} Gy LY
o CaeeTegion
WA Presudng’ bess
L 3 wed

Aokrodasons b Repares
Sgnature

Cate: l \\)&\g




E M SOLUTION PTE LTD

160, Sin Ming Drive, #03-18/19, Sin Ming Autocity, Singapore 575722
Tel: 64560226 Fax: 64584500
Registration No: 201016308K

14.01.2018
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

8, Shenton Way, #24-01
AXA Tower
Singapore 068811

ATTENTION: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

SUPPLYMENTARY REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR HONDA VEZEL - SLP 4366 S

pc. front grille top gamlsh VO — 385.20
Less 20% 79.04

Dlég T 316.16 316 16
\ 9 | L -



E M SOLUTION PTE LTD

160, Sin Ming Drive, #03-18/19, Sin Ming Autocity, Singapore 575722
Tel: 64560226 Fax: 64584500
GST Reg. No: 201016308K

28.03.2018
Final Invoice: TI05042
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd
8, Shenton Way, #24-01,
AXA Tower
Singapore 068811

FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR HONDA VEZEL - SLP 4366 S

1 pc front bumper 1,127.50
1pc  n/s front bumper side retainer 43.00
1 pc n/s headlamp 1,995.40
1pc frontgrille 350.00
1pc front grille emblem 43.30
1pc front grille garnish 395.20

3,854.40

Less 20% 790.88
3,163.52 3,163.52

1 set front bumper clips 35.00 SN
1) Check electrical wirings & headlamp focus. 30.00
2) Repair accident damages and renew above parts 400.00
3) Spray paint on affected portions 540.00
4,168.52
Less Excess 700.00
3,468.52
GST 7% 242.80

$ 3,711.32




To: AXA Insurance Pte 1td
8. Shenton Way, #24-01
AXA Tower
Singapore 068811

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

A IR/ AINASEY 7 o o

L/we are the registered owner of vehicle SLP4366S _ which was damaged in the
accidenton _11.01.2018 .

My/our vehicle had been completed to my/our satisfaction and I/we had collected
the vehicle on _ 22 - O 1- 398

Please accept the repair bill from my repairer M/s. EM Solution Pte Ltd and the
payment by your company to my repairer M/s. EM Solution Pte Ltd will be in full
and final settlement of my/our claim for losses sustained as a result of the above
accident.

The above is correct and agreed by:

4

Name: Chen“Yixiu
NRIC: $8124621S
Date: 72.2.0l.30\8



