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1182018 PARFICCE Rebate Snsquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

The information contained herein s correct as 3t 16 Jan 2018

Vehicle Owner Particulars
" Owner |0 Type: o ForeignCompary o R
Dwner 10: 1182L
__Vuhir.lebetalls
Vehicle No: GRE7AZ1B
Vhicle to be Exported: No
Intended De-registration Date: 24 Jan 2018
Vebide o NissAN |
| Vehicle Modet CABSTAR 30 SM/T ABS 2DR 2WD EURO'S T
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2016
A . e SRR LA . -
Engine No ZD3000FEBEN
ChassisNo. . - INISCIF2470858307 )t )
| Open Market Value: $24,867.00 |
i = |
Criginad Reglstration Bate: 26 Mar 2014 I
First Registration Date: 26 Mar 2016 |
Trarsfer Count: 0 P‘!n _!
Actual ARF Paid: $1,244.00
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls - - .
PARF Eliglbllity: No
 PARFEfgbikty Expiry Date:. ==
! PARF Rebate Amount: - 000 |
M COr e e =N . S
COE Expiry Date: 25 Mar 2026
COECatesory: ‘ C - Goods Vehicte & Bus : |
COE Period(Vears): 10 = |
QP Paid: £45,036.00
COE Rebate Amount: $26,900.00
Totol Rebate Amaunt: ' $36,90000




11620t Singapore Used Car Listings - sgCarMan

sGCARMART.COM
THE ONLY PLACE FOR SMARY CAR DUYERS
Nissan Cabstar Used Vehicle List (5 vehicles)

Car Model Price Depreciation  Reg Date EngCap  Mileage Company Avallability
Nissan Cahstar (Diiel} $66,900 8,080 fyr' W-Apr2016  2.953cc - Net Link Partners Pte Lid Available

Cheapest EURD Cabstar tn Town! Gest Savings! Milsage Only Dana B,000km | Owner's Loss Your Gain! Undar Agent Warranty! Brand New Sailing AL
B4, 900! Afmcst 20%) Savings! Coms With Rear Canopy & Fuli Ch,,,

Oiffice N, - 67531661
Siteh Shilford - 96648460 | Soon - 83228009

Nissan Cabstar (Dwsel] $65,800 7,840 fyr 07-un-2016 2853t S0,000km  Car (S) Pte Lid Available

Very Low Mileage Of S0k Kin And New Checherad Plate And Canopy, Not To Be Missed. See To Believe.

Office No. - -
Dennis - 88583322 | Winson - 83802211 | Joe! - 96558262 | Fey - 91918363

fissan Cabstar (Diesal) £66,888 §7,600 fyr I7-SEp2016° 2953 - Net Link Pastrars Pa (1d  Availabie.

0 Dirivie Away! Irmmediate Handover] Mo Waiting Time: 100% Lisan Avadatia) Compehitive Interest Ratel Fast, Exsy Approve And Hassle Frea Loan
Frocedure, Immeadiats Insyrance Quaotation! Highest Trade In F.

Office No. - 67531661
Soan - 83228009 | Sitoh - 96648460

Nissan Cabstar (Ciesel) £81,988 $9.420 yr 30-5ep-2016 2953cc B0 km ASWIN Bus Pte Lid Avallable

£ yagre | 40,000km Warranty, Loan Up 100% Essy Abproval With Loivest Interest Rate, Ready Stock! Free 3 Monits-Warrantyl Trade-In Welcome And Tl
Far Appolntment

Office No, - (63339404 _

Ong - BES12231 | Keegan - 98578091 | Joe - 94353897

Nissan Cabstar (Diessl) £78,900  $8,910 fyr 24-Now-2016 2953cc - ABWIN Bus Pt Lid Avallable

Frea 3 Months Wamanty! Nissan Calistay For Sale. Immediately Stock, 5 Years Warmanty, 3 Tithes Frae Serices, Provide Maximum Up To 106% Loah, Trade
In Wislegmss, Call Nopw!

‘Cffecae. Ny, = B93394(H

Eugene Ng - 53270298 | Nicholas - 96793310

spCarthant & tive matibes one car Cassiflo for paraikel import car, Tdyota, Honda, Nessan, Misstishl & BMIY. Thete are plafity of cansfir sale, e for COF cam, UFT
s, v, trucks, fybrid cars, Sparts cirs bf statonwagans. You Gar also buy from & car aucton, ok up i Ioirs, low milsage cars, car brands, caank rates B Gar
imEuTAnEE. We have Tiew <3¢ dealitrs compiising paraliel Importirs, dithiarsed car deslrs, st Lsed car deshiss on ouf site. Find new ot price Iists, new car lunches
anmrprmmmemmmlnwmﬁmlammmwmmemhﬁmmhshgnpmjab-.. real estzte
propertes for ek, ﬂw,armfﬁmmpﬂnwﬂﬂuﬂm!ﬂm#ﬂm.mﬂhﬂhhhﬂqlﬂm

EF 2004-2018 spCarMat, Al rights reserved.

hityy/fwww.sacarmart com/used_cars/ssarch_resull_pricelist_print php?SA=EMOD=Nissan%20Cabstar&RPG=208VEH=04RGD=20168AVL=24.
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Celine Fong (LKKAuto) '

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 January 2018 4.09 PM

To: ‘Darren Lee'

Ce: LKK Valuation; Frank Neo; Vanessa Ngoi

Subject: RE: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOPR VALUATION JAN 2018
Dear Darren,

The Valuation of vehicles as below:
GBE 78218 MV SE0K FS: 550K
SIK 3648K MV: 519K FS: 517K

As at January 2018

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: elinefonp@ lkkauto.com | fax: G256-4315
Bl 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenoe 1, #n2-25 | S(4o8933)

From: Darren Lee [mailto:Darren.Lee@hlbank.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 Janueary 2018 5:25 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; Frank Neo <Frank.Neo@hlbank.com.sg>; Vanessa Ngoi
<\anessa.Ngoi@hlbank.com.sg>

Subject: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION JAN 2018

Dear Celine,
We would like to have a desktop Valuation for the above vehicles.
Attached with log card

Thank you

Best Regards

Darren Lee
PFS Credit Approval & Caollections
HL Bank Singapore



From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 13 November, 2017 11:19 AM

To: Darren Lee

Cc: LKK Valuation; Frank Neo; Vanessa Ngal

Subject: RE: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION

[Dear Darren,
The Valuation of vehicle as below:
GBE B11L MV: S55K FS: S45K

As at November 2017

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phione; 62563561 | email: celinefong@kkauto som | fax: 62564315
Blk 51, Pavs Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Slan8933)

From: Darren Lee [mallto:Darren. Lee@hlbank.com.s

sent: Thursday, @ November, 2017 4:21 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <gelinefo kkauto.com>

Ce: LKK Valuation <valuation®|kkauto.com>; Frank Neo <Frank Nea@hlbank.com.sg>; Vanessa Ngoi
<Vanessa,Ngoi@hlhank.com.sg>

Subject: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION

Dear Celine,
We would Jike to have a desktop Valuation for GBEB11L

Attached with log card

Thank you

Best Ragards

Darren Lee

PFS Credit Approval & Collections
HL Bank Singapore

Visit our website: http://www hibank.com.sg

This e-mail and any attachments may contain confidential and
2



privileged information, If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail, delete this e-mail and
destroy any copies. Any dissemination or use of this information by a
person other than the intended recipient is unauthorized and may be
illegal,

Visit our website: http://www hlbank.com.sg

This e-mail and any attachments may contain confidential and
privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sendar immediately by return e-mail, delete this e-mail and
destroy any copies, Any dissemination or use of this information by a
person other than the intended recipient is unauthorized and may be
illegal.



