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Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 29 March 2018 11:04 AM
To: GW
Subject: RE: Accident involving SBW 666J and SLV 336Z on 13/01/2018 at 0330hrs

Dear Ms Gwen, 
 
We refer to the below email. 
 
Please be informed that we have tried to negotiate with third party for cost of repair and the final and adjusted amount 
of repair cost is $4,627.45 (all-in), loss of use with 6 working days for repair and we here proceed to settle and close the 
matter at our end in order to avoid the further escalation. 
 
Kindly take note that the settlements are on a without prejudice basis and there is no admission of liability and any 
settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this 
particular accident. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be 
deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: GW [mailto:wee.gwendolyn@gmail.com]  
Sent: Saturday, 17 March 2018 11:51 AM 
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident involving SBW 666J and SLV 336Z on 13/01/2018 at 0330hrs 
 
Hi Thin Thin, 
 
May I know what the the other party is claiming for? 
 
Thanks and regards, 
Gwen 
 
Sent from my iPhone 
 
On 15 Mar 2018, at 4:52 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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Dear Ms Gwen, 
  
We thank you for your email below. 
  
Please be inform that we are in the midst of negotiation with TP repairer for the final settlement. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
  
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
  
  
  
From: Gwendolyn Wee [mailto:wee.gwendolyn@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 15 March 2018 4:35 PM 
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident involving SBW 666J and SLV 336Z on 13/01/2018 at 0330hrs 
  
Hi Thin Thin 
  
Apologies for the late response. My dad was out of town, couldn't get his signature. 
  
May i know how much is the other party claiming for? 
  
Thank you and regards, 
Gwen 
  
On Tue, Mar 6, 2018 at 4:45 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Ms Gwen, 

  

We refer to our tele-conversation. 

  

Please duly sign the document enclosed and return to us for our necessary action. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  


