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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubil Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 189507198R GST Reg No 19-9607198-R

Afflliated Lo Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHARTIS BUILDING
SINGAFORE 079120

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD

78 SHENTON WAY #08-16

Ref | CC4/AIG18000986/R 1yb3

Date : 18-01-2018

[NHARIAT

Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, GBG 6246H Veh. Inspected FBM 2418Z
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No, Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 16/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  0B/D1/2018 |Inspection Date 17/01/2018
Survey held at SG 858 MOTOR FTE LTD
BLK 4001 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 1
#01-21 SINGAPORE 589622
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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SG 98 MOTOR PTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio industrial Pare 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 5604822

Date: 26 January 2018

To = LKK
Attn  Rasul
Te! : 90010068
CHnwWwem
VEHICLE NO * FBEM 24182

ACCIDENT DATE 8 January 2018

Descnption

=

2 Bearing Rear - ABS Wheel
Bearing Rear -Non ABS Whes|

(]

Nett items

-

Towing fee

2 Labour charges
3 Licence plate - stainless steel boll

NE This sstirnate was miste Foem @ v

INSPECTIon Only, any OMes demage parts. o
NEDCRIT PO W) MROE COSTETHN0ES, Wi
willl BvieE S NG BUEITTIL BHETE TRy

Aerm by eooitlegly.

Kindiy revart upon complation
Thank you

5G 98 MOTOR PTELTD

Bracket - License Plate Assy -

Tei: G452 4308 Fax: §452 4088
Email: sg_motor_enterpriseffilyanas,com.ug

By Fax 6256-4315

51 Bob Lid FXD BB103-ABS

Qty Quotation $
1 Sou
1 180.00 ¥ ¥°°
1 125.00 ¥/ fvt
Sub-Total 995 .00 Zf:”
Less 10% 99.50 lo
Sub-Total 895 50 bTu
—
-~
lzt}ﬂ{i‘p("' J 247
r giﬂj - — ¢
M Yo
Sub-Total 780.00
Nett Total 1,675.50
Hr Gao (oo (¥ ’ 'T"”
—_—
{ia‘,/] 790
0],
fq(g:{lt'e Lto 432

Hs



~ Cecilia Chnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 3:33 PM

To: 5g Motor

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto);, Admin A

Subject: RE: FEM 24187 - ATTACHED LOD AND INVOICE
Your Ref: FBM 24181 Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/AIG180007846/R 1wb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 62456H(AIG) & FBM 24187 ON 08/01/2018

We refer to the above matter.

We agreed setflement at a global sum of $680.00{all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sale Intention of resolving the

matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cetilin Chang | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email; CecilinChong@kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ECES o
IXK = Save the Earth FPrint only when necessary

From: 5g motor enterprise Giam <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 2 April 2019 12:31 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>
Subject: FBM 24182 - ATTACHED LOD AND INVOICE

Hi Hsiao tong,

Attached is the letter of demand and invoice for
FBM 2418Z.

pls proceed immediately as AIG is chasing for this
claim.

Your attention on this matter is much appreciated.



thark you
rose



SG 98 VOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 568622
Tal: 8452 4808 Fax: 8452 4868
Emall; sg_molor_snterpriss@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 2 April 2019 Invoice No: SG98-PD-18-024
AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LETTER OF DEMAND
78 Shenton Way
#07-16
SINGAFORE 079120
Your Insured: GBG 6246H
Date of Accident: 8-Jan-18
Location: TIL Junction of Ang Mo Kio Ave 9/ Ang Mo Kio Ave 8
FINAL REPAIR COSTS

VEHICLE NO. FBM 2418Z (Street Bob Limited FXDBE103 ABS)

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No.: FBM 24182 (lump sum) $650.00
Loss of Use: 1 day x $30 $30.00
Total; $680.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: SIX HUNDRED EIGHTY ONLY
Mols

1. All chogue paymant should be “Crossed” and mads payablo ta 58G 28 MOTOR PTE LTD
2. All chegue should have our Trvoice No® witten on the reverse sde of the chegque
3. For furthar enguirias on this invoios, please leel Troo 1o contact ua

|

V-

SG 98 Motor Ple Ltd
1G




S0 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC4/AIGI8000986/R1mb3

14 MARCH 2018

EMARCO ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
48 TOH GUAN RD EAST

#02-122 ENTERPRISE HUB
SINGAPORE 608586

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 6246H AND FBM 2418T ON 08/01/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed 10 negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Bevan Lim

Case Handler
DID: 6749 4274
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: bevanlim@Ikkauto.com

ce.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



]

AUTHORIZATION TO ACT * .

1, Tude Emmanue! Tan Chovm K¢ uthe third party claimant)

of Blb 715 Pacir Ris 72 A08-2( Sprve 0TS (address),

owner of F8m 24482 ° (vehicle no.) hereby authorize :
Sq T8 Moter Phc L=l

(“ths workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for

[

repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use ("claim") for iny

vehicle no, [BM J¢§ 2 that was damaged pursuant to the

accident which cccurred on ?{'J 2008 {date) along .
1L Junchinn &) Argo kio Ave 9 ng Mo bis Kokison)
U T

involving vehlcle no/s 654 £2¢4¢ H

{(*the accldent").

1 further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned
glaim in a manner that they deem. f£it and the workshop is further
authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim
with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach

on my behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of
liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the

other wvehlcle/s ls concerned,

Dated this 94 day of Jaruc (wonth) 20 L& (yeaz)
™
b

U
signed by "the third party claimant” §ignpd by “the workshop”




RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

"We/l, SG 98 MOTOR PTE LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
sgreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte [4d LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyar) with respect to the amount claimed for S8680.00
(Global Sum) for vehicle no, FBM 24187 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on 08/01/2018 (datc) along T/L JUNCTION OF AMK AVE 9 & AMK AVE 6 involving vehicle

no/s GBG 6246H.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 17/01/2018 (date) at “the workshaop”.

We/l confinm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner JUDE EMMANUEL TAN CHOON
KEONG (“the third party claimant™) of vehicle no. FBM 24187 make the claim as set out in the
above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that
we/l deem fit, We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to FBM
2418Z(vehicle no.) as a result of the accident,

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispule arising out of the same.

Dated this “ +l~ (day) of j%ﬂt (month) 20 f § (year)

[ .s? d.r;l
___mms AS Y
Signed by appointed-sarveyor Signed by “the workshop® (with chap)




SG 98 MOTORPTELTD

4001, Anp Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 ¥01-21 BINGAPORE 568622
Tal: G452 4888 Fax: G452 4868

Emall: sg_motor_anterprisef@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 2 April 20189 Invaice No: SG98-FD-19-024
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd PD - Direct Settlement
78 Shenton Way
#0716
SINGAPORE 079120
Your Insured: GBG 6246H
Date of Accident:  8-Jan-18
Location: T Junction of Ang Mo Kio Ave 8 / Ang Mo Kio Ave &
FINAL REPAIR COSTS

VEHICLE NO. FBM 24187 (Street Bob Limited FXDBB103 ABS)

Cosl of Repalr for Vehicle No.: FBM 2418Z (lump sum) $650.00
Total: $650.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: SIX HUNDRED FIFTY ONLY
Hokes:

1. All chaque payment sholld ba "Croased” and mada payable lo 8G 58 MOTOR PTE LTD
2. Al cheque should have our "invalce Mo wiitten on the reverse side of iha chegus
3, Fot lurther anquiries on this invoico, plasse foal free lo contact us

SG 98 Motor Pte Lid
i6
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane
CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING -
l:'.lﬂ_ Motified Est Submitted ‘-ﬂlﬁl‘:ﬂ!ﬁl!ﬂl . :Ifnﬂ]_ﬁpt Adtj Sutsmitted Ins Auth'ed SIMuUS
ey |09 20 2018 163018 |sess0.00 $$650.00 e
it Log smagne | | Bt Estimates | | view npt Cancet Case | |

Main Reference
TR et T — -
Insured: | Emarco Enterprise Ple Ltd, Co. Reg. No.. 1999030230
El:l?ml: JUDE EMMANUEL TAN CHOON KEONG. 10: S6801355C

Vehichs Reg. . |DB/OL/201B 18:00 - (59
No.: FBM2418Z Date of Lous: | gy B 8 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yri]

Cialm Type: |TP / 958853050456 :'1:":&“" 11700052044 (Comprehensive)

|
Poliey No. |
GHGE246H (Claimant): ]-SIH?\I'IIIJH

o R Excrss: |
Sg 98 Motor Pie Ltd (HQ) ALK 4001 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 1 #01-21, 569622 Ang Mo Kio - Tel: 64524698

Handling AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (Express) - Tel: §5-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Tan, Bannle-WZ - 5419 1718] Bennle-
Insurer W TanGaig.com

Claimant's

i Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: (65) 6221 8611

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3551 ... [Handled by MOMD RASUL] ... [Final Rpt due 25/01/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED Wiew Al I Composs Case Mail |
'« AIG_SG [17/01/1018): TP request for TP GIA Report

View All | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | Complete ||
Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 20/6/2019
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Claim Documents

*FBEM2418Z (95885305045G)
[GBG6246H]
™
JUDE EMMANUEL TAN CHOON KEONG
Jan B 2018 6:30PM
[Emarco Enterprise Pte Ltd]
Sg 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Uptcad Documents | Usioad Photos | Compose New Letter |  Upisad video | Upload Audie | View [View i Browss [ -]
Letters/Correspandences tperpoge v & |
Mo | Finslized On | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1| (Dram) Third Party Express Seftiement - Payment Breakdown 0 =
Assessment Reparts Tpu-w +| &
[Na_[Finalized On | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG} Thumimnall | Print
.-: !r 17/01718 13:28 imﬁ*l- Mo GRGEFMEH, Chaimant: EMARLT ENTERPRISE FTELTD n ket HTH L I_T
Photas/Images 3 per ~] &
o | Relabel/Reorder | LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) ~ Thumbnail| Print
1 110619 17:55 General View O | s | 4
2 11/06/1517:55 | General View O | wows | &2
3 10619 17:55 | General View D | io=awc | 4
;__Enmmn 17:55 | General View D | loadic | A
'S 11/06/18 1755 General View 0 | eecws | @
6 10B/1917:55 | General View © | waws | & |
7 |11/06/19 17:55 | General View 0 | e | B
8 |11/0B/15 17:55 | General View 0O | tcadins | B
S |11/06/15 17:35 | General View © | cscrs | A
10 [11/06/19 17:55 | General View D s | H
11 [11/06/18 17:55 | General View D | icedwc | B4
12 |11/06/19 17:55 | General View D | cedwc | A
13 | 1406/1% 1755 | General View D | tosdws |
14 |11/06/19 17:55 General View ﬁ toad G | B
15 140615 17:55 | General View D | oadwc | A
18 [11/06/19 17:55 | General View D | leadwsc | A
17 |1406/1% 17:55 | General View D | adwc | A
18 (11/06/15 17:55 | General View D | osaes | A
19 [11/06/15 17:55 | General View D | leadivc | A
20 [11/06/19 17:55 | Genersl View 0D | sdes | 4
21 [11/06/19 17:55 | General View 0| oads | A
22 [11/06/18 17:55 | General View O v | &
23 |11/06/18 17:55 | General View D | oadws | A
4 (11/06/19 17:55 | Genersl View D | oadirc | A
25 | 11/06/1% 17455 General View B | Losdws | [
26 [11/06/19 17:55 General View D | oadirc | 4
27 |11006/19 17355 Goneral View 0 | wadws | [A |
28 [11/06/19 17:55 | Genersl View O | oadwrs | & |
29 |11/08/18 17:55 | General View © | waws | 2|
30 [11/06/19 17.55 | General View 0O | oG |

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 20/6/2019
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Letters / Correspondences In:rm B M
No_|Finabized On LXK Auto Cansultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Prink
31 (110619 17:55 | General View 0 | wrs | &
37 10619 17:55 | Geners] View 0 edwc | B
33 [11/06/19 17:55 | General View 0| waawc | &
34 11/06/19 17:55 | General View 0 | teadec | A
35 [11/06/19 17:55 | Ganeral View 0| v | &
36 13/06/19 17:55 | General View O  ioeaws | F
;r_lnuw19 17155 | General View 0 | adiec | A |
(38 11/06/19 1755 | General View 0| waare | A |
35 11/06/1917:55 | General View 0 | Leaws | A
40 1/06/1917:55 | General View 0 | oaws | A
41 (11/06/1917:55 | Genersl View O | dws &
DR ligerpage  [v] &
No | Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print |
{1 16/01/1817:13 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 16012018 €) | LoadPOF |
160118 17:13 | WKSP NOTICE 3 Load POF |
|3 18/01/18 18:14 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF |
4 |15/03/1816:23  |LETTER TD O1 €© | Load PoF |
5 |30/06/1308:31 | WORKSHOP INVOICE © | Losdror
£ JOO0A/19 08:31 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
7 |20/D6/19 08:31 Release Voucher 0 | LoedroF |

Documents Checklist

l-nocuum CHECKLIST
| Thete are no document checkilsts configured.

Checkl - LKK Consultants Lid (HOQ)

Show Remarks To: L] Handiing Insurer
bipim R@mara §re prevals e ViU Ahow D Sthee parties

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 20/6/2019
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: GBGE246H (Insd veh) Model: HARLEY-DAVIDSON FXDB
FEM2418Z (TP veh) 1.7 DYNA STREET BOB
| Date of Accident: |08/01/2018
Giobal Sum Settlement | : | [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate -] 1,675.50
Final Repair Cosl % £80.00
Loss of Usa ' § 1.00 days at $30.00 per day
Rental (if any) - days
LTA / GIA Search Fee :5
Others: 'S
:5
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) -] 680.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] ND (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Reqistered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario Na:
B) For GIA Registored Workshop: - ¢ e e

BOLA Liability (%) Assessed Liahbility (*): (%)
* Assessed Liabilily to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) SG 08 Motor Pta Lid 1 B880.00
2) .1
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 20 Jun
2019
LKK Auto Consullants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Rapert/ Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoaeg ne 1esearisar

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: surf@lkkaulo com assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur Flle No: CC4/AIG1B000986/R1GB302

Date: 20/08/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd.  Policy No 1700052044
Clalmant Vehicle £gy41a7 Insured Vehicle No : GBGB246H
Date of Loss: 08/01/2018 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: 958853050456
DE IPTIOMN & | IFICATI |
Reg No- FBM2418Z
Make & Model: HARLEY-DAVIDSON FXDB, 1.7 Dyna Street Bob  Engine No: VCMF306804
Reg. Date; 31/08/2017 (Man. Year: 2014) Chassis No: SHD1VCMCOFC3I06804
Colour: Mulli-colour Odomeler 2391 km
Engine Capacity 1680 cc
Marke! Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S5) Market Value/Mew Car Price
| | AT T M
Genaral Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake [Serviceable) ¥Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 100/80 B18 Rear Tyre Size 160/70 B17
Front Left Side: Michelin 4 mm Rear Lafi Side; Michelin 4 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above values represent the remaming (e resds dephh
COSTOFCLAMS - Repairer's Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %)
Parts 885.50 450.00 445 50 49.75
Miscellaneous items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 780,00 340.00 440.00 56.41
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 1,675.50 790.00 B85.50 52.85
Approved Total (Overridden) (5§) 650.00
Nett Amount (S§) 1,675.50 650.00 1.025.50 61.21
+ Loss of Use (1.0 x $530.00/day) (S$) 30.00
Nett Liability (S$) 680.00
Global Sum Settlemant (S§) 680.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 16/01/2018
Date Inspecied: 17/01/2018 Inspecied Al: Sg 98 Motor Pte Lid (HQ)
BLK 4001 ANG MO KID INDUSTRIAL
PARK 1 #01-21
Singapora 5689822
Estimated Period of Repair. 1.0 days
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Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: Jasmine Khing Phoo Wai

NOTE: Thiz mpart represanis our fingings ar e iime and place of mapechion sited haren. Such inspection his been camod oul o e bes! of our
knowhedge and ability but sny ather labiity undsr any ather circumaiances is hersby axprassly sxciuded
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Adjuster Report
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
1 1 *BRACKET -LICENSE PLATE ASSY Necessary 690.00FL *500.00 FL
2 1 ‘BEARING REAR -ABS WHEEL Serviceable 180.00 FL *-FL
3 1 *BEARING REAR -NON ABS WHEEL Serviceable 125.00 FL =
FaFmnchsa part L=LethemDisc
Sub Total (S3) 995.00 500.00
- List tem Discount on L ltams 10.00/10.00% (S5} 99.50 50,00
Total Parts (S3) B95.50 450.00
Report was unsubmitied during this print-oul |
20/6/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TOWING FEE New 120.00 0.00

2 LABOUR CHARGES Mew 600.00 300.00

3 LICENCE PLATE -STAINLESS STEEL BOLT MNew 80.00 40.00
Gross Labour Cost [S§) 780.00 340.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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