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' Vd V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

;_.f; ;; - 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
-"',’. TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 5286 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg:No. 19-9607188-R
Affiliated to Federation Intemnationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref - CS/FCI18000911/R1vd3
ey HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 B ORISR M"mmlmlﬁm
Code: FCI2
, ¥ Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 7494B Veh. Inspected SLG 78280
Paolicy No. Coverage (8) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From  TEO SWEE KEONG Assign Date 15/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
2 General Information
Accident Date  11/01/2018 Inspection Date 18/01/2018
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTELTD
6 BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 629927
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A“WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFAIRS.
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gyt Cansuftants
el Wa = P Lid Company Registration No. 19960719ER

51 UBEAVE 1. #02-28 PAY A UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SN APOIE 408933 TEL @ (065} 62563561 FAX : (065} 2504315

Your ref: PLEASE ADVISED
Our Ref: CS/FCI1800091 1/R1vd3 Date : 23/1/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SLG T828D
We thank you for your instruction on 15/1/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
18/1/2018 at the premises of M/s PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 551.206.00
Revised Estimate Amount - 551,036.00
"Check” ltems Amount : 5%
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value 055
Nett Value ;8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
n/s front and n/s rear portion.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor
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{2] System - _
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(3) Workshop Estimate/Assignment Form
N ALL Parts condition
C Market Value for UD cases
C Estimate Repair Cost for PRI {'HSI TM™I, MSIG)
C Davs of repair
C Fmahsed Amount
¢ Re-inspection Cases Cases to Finalize within 5 Days
[4} Systern {Viewsj’Merimen]

¢ TResurvey photo Uploaded
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@misfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 15 January 20718 6:14 PM

To: ‘assignments@lkkauto.com’

Cc: Aini Binte Md Min

Subject: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - TPD 3 - OUR REF: SHC74948B DOA 11/01/2018
Attachments: img-180115111608.pdf, MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT.pdf

Importance: High

Dear Sirs

New survey request for your handling.

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Motor Claims Dept

M5 First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3B48 | Fax Mo. : 6507 2849 |

Amember of JURTEAME INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Flease refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.se for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Motice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by
retum e-mail,

From: Caroline Cabrera

Sent: Monday, January 15, 2018 11:21 AM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg=

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 11.01.2018 INVOLVING 5LG7828D & SHC7494B
Importance; High

Dear SK,

Far survey

Thanks & Regards
cavelive Cabrern
Motor Claims

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Amember of BERTEANE INSURANCE GROUP

36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House| Singapore 063877 | Reg. No. 195000106C
D: 6507 3848 | F: 6507 3849
email: www first-insurance.com.sg



Persomal Data Proteciion dot X2 ¢"PDRA"):
Uil the PDPA. there are varous requireiments that regulate the processing of your personal dats.
Floase refer to www fiest-ansurance. cosn g for detalis of POPA Peesonal Data Collection Statennent.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidensial. Jt mav alse be legally privifeged

I von are ned the addressee or o wham it s aterded, vou may not copy. forward, disclaze or e anye pavr of it
I vian fave recenved (s message i ereor, please delete e miessage and all copies from vour sysiem

and mowfi the sender immediarely by return e-muail

From: Chrissy [mailto:chrissy@primeautoclaims.com]

Sent: Monday, January 15, 2018 9:23 AM

To: Motor_Claims <Motor_Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;

Cc: aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com; peiyee@primeautoclaims.com

Subject: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 11.01.2018 INVOLVING SLG7828D & SHC74948B
Importance: High

Hi,

The above referred.

Our client’s GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI.
**Please inform surveyor to avoid 11.45am -12.45pm lunch hour.
We select: LKK Auto Consultants Pte. Ltd.

Thank you.

Important Note: Our campany will be migrating to Prime Auto Claims Services Pte. Ltd. with effective on 01.07.2017. Section
Automotive Services will afficially terminate on 31.12,.2017.
Important Note: Our workshop is now located ot No. & Benof Place, Singapore 629927

Best regards,

Chyissy

Prime Auto Claims Service Pre. Lid.
3 Benoi Place

Smgapore G29026

Tel: 68G1 0908

Fax: 6515 2948

NOTICE: This mail {including all avachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for
e identilied recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If vou are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and deleie
this message [rom your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its content to any persoi,



Wirus-free. www.avast com



First Capital Insurance Limited 5T hog. o, M32001are

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date ’g/{ /{'g Our Ref No. SHf: 7%"{'@

Accident Date I K‘; (!g Claim Type ng Pn}
Third Party Vehicle S [ (7 ]

52.8’0

Insured Vehicle

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax invaice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {based
on NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

Encl. Accident Reports & est

Cc : Workshop Pr.'mg_ ﬂu‘lu CI aams SCNEQJ Pilc, H’J Attention C }'lrfs.??f
Officer In charge Qmj %n m‘.n

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

Main Office: & Ratfies Quay #21-00 Singapore D48530 Tel: 65-6222 2311 Fax 85-6222 2547 Web-sitahitp:/www first-insurance.com 2g
Clalms Departments: 36 Robinson Road #16.01 City House Singapere DESETT Tel: E5-8507 3848 Fax: 85-8507 3a4g




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 January 2018 10:35 AM

To: ‘Teo Swee Keong'

ol ‘Aini Binte Md Min'; SUR

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - TPD 3 - OUR REF: SHC7494B DOA 11/01/2018
(TP VEHICLE SLG 7828D)

Attachments: SLG 7828D PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Swee Keong,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLG 7828D
Date of survey: 18/1/2018
Number of days: 4 days

Best Regards,

veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 9:24 AM

To: 'Teo Swee Keong' <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Ce: 'Aini Binte Md Min' <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - TPD 3 - OUR REF: SHC7494B DOA 11/01/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080933)

From: Teo Swee Keong ]ﬁii|'[0'.TE‘{JSWEEKEGI'IE@msfirﬁtcani[al.CDm.ﬂﬂ]

sent: Monday, 15 January 2018 6:14 PM

To: 'assignments@Ilkkauto.com' <a ssipnments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Aini Binte Md Min <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - TPD 3 - OUR REF: SHC74548 DOA 11/01/2018
Importance: High

Dear Sirs



New survey request for your handling,

Thanks and Regards,

5K Teo
Motor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinsen Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID ; 6507 3848 | Fax Mo, : 6507 3849 |

A member of INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 (TPDPA™):
Under the POPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of POPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by
return e-mail.

From: Caroline Cabrera
sent: Monday, January 15, 2018 11:21 AM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 11.01.2018 INVOLVING 5LG7828D & 5HC74948

Importance: High
Dear SK,

For survey

Thanks & Regards
cavollne Cabrerd
Motor Claims

First Capital Insurance Ltd

A member of INSURANCE GROUP

16 Robinson Road #16-01 City House| Singapore 068877 | Reg. No. 195000106C
D: 6507 3848 | F: 6507 3849

email: www.first-insurance.com.sg
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From: Chrissy [ma ilto:chrissy@primeautoclaims.com)

sent: Monday, January 15, 2018 9:23 AM

To: Motar_Claims <Motor Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Motor Claims eMotarClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>,
Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
CWS Motor Claims ccwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Aini Binte Md Min <pini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

cc: aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com; peiyee@primeautoclaims.com

2



Subject: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 11.01.2018 INVOLVING SLG7828D & SHC7494B
Importance: High

Hi,

The above referred.

Our client’s GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI.
**Please inform surveyor to avoid 11.45am -12.45pm lunch hour.
We select: LKK Auto Consultants Pte. Ltd.

Thank you.

Automotive Services will officially terminate on 31.12.2017.
Important Note: Our workshop is now located at No. & Benoi Place, Singapore 629827

Best regards,

L‘I’L-i-’[lz!nﬂjf'

Prime Auto Clams Service Ple. Lid.
5 Benoi Place

Singapore GZ9926

Tel: GRG1 0908

Fax: 6515 2948

Emal: chgssy @ pomeautoclaiims.comm

NOTICE: This mail (including all atachments) contans confidential mlormation which may be privileged. It 1s mtended solely for
the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. I you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete
tliis message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its content (o any person.

Virus-free, www. avast.com




16.01-18.11:26 From: To: 62659941

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No : 201606560M

5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926

Tel* 6861 D908 Fax: 6515 2948

PRIME GROUP

Date: 18.01.2018

First Capital Insurance Ltd
36 Rabinson Road #16-01
City House

sSingapore 068877

Attn: Motar Claims Dept
RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SLG7828D HONDA VEZEL [2016)

To Supply

1) 1pc  Left front fender garnish
2) 1pc Left rear fender garnish

sub total Parts $
Less: 20% discount _$

L/charges
1) Totuff kote

2] Toremove & replace left front fender garnish & left rear fender
garnish. To repair front bumper & knock left rear door.

3) To putty respray painting front bumper, left front fender & left
rear door. To polish,

#
s 160.00 ) S
$ 160.00% ol —
320.00
54.00
$ 256.00
$ ;&ﬁbﬁ:?d
S M 2€o
$ 45040 $o0

sub total L/charges $
gstimate total S

the Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey belora/afier spray painting

& Fars pnces ana Bubsadt 10 rTrRRten

® Third party survey is or |
* ho ilegsl modification(s) is al

= Supplamentary Hem(s) aved and
Is subject to final approval from Insuran 1 Cair

Acknowledged by Repainer
Signature:
Date:

950.00
1,206.00
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 January 2018 10:05 AM
To: ‘Alice Leong’; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: FINALISE TO SLG7828D

Dear Alice,

Confirmed finalize at $1,036 and 4 days

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 24 January 2018 9:43 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cec: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FINALISE TO 5LG7828D

Importance: High

Hi Rasul

We enclosed our after repair photos & our calculation sheet for your retention. Shall we finalize at part by
part $1,036 and 4 days

Please let us have your confirmation within three days from our e-mail.

Thank you.

Ms: Alice Leong:

Prime Aute Claims Service Pre Ltd

Office: No. 3 Benoi Place Singapore 629 D26
Workshop: No.6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927



Tel: 6861 0908  Fax: 6515 2948
HP: 8781 9005

Disclaimer
h may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified

This e-mail (including all attachment) contains confidential information whic
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply 1o us immediately and delete this message from your system.
Y¥ou may nol copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents 1o any persan.
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Date:; 18.01.2018

,From;

Prime Auto Claims Se
GST Reg. Mo 701606560M

5 Benoi Place Singapare 629926

o 6861 0908 Fax: 65152948

First Capital Insurance Lrd
36 Robinson Road #16-01
City Houst

Singapore 068877

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEMIC

ToSupply

1) 1pc

2)

1pc

L/charees

1)

)

3)

To tuff kote

To remove & replace left front fender garnish

garnish. To repair front bumper & knock left rear door.

To putty respray painting front bumper,

Laft front fender garnish
Left rear fender garnish

rear door. To polish.

Signatury:

LEK Auto Consultants

the Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey belore/aher spemy painting

» To display damaged pan(s) during resurvey

w Pars prices ar subject o confirmation

» Third party survey is on a “Without Prajudics’ basis
» No Begal modfications) i slowed

» Supplemantary
s subct 1o final

Acinowiedged by Rspaint

hence notfy

term{s) must be resurveyed and
approval from Insurance Compary

180 4 ¥@:91 BIBS "Wl B1

§ o 6 Tl et T

rvice Pte Ltd

LE SLG78280 HONDA VEZEL (2018)

s 160,00 %S4 fl..l-,
5 160.005 . —— | Aot
sub total Parts _$ 320.00 i
Less; 20% discount £ B4.00
5 256.00

& left rear fender

|eft front fender & left

sub total L/charges s
Estimate total

‘0 Xed

s _5e0b 50
s 45040 30
$ d;uao'ffu-u

S 720800 _%mu
fgm
Hy 4ol by
't day
il
[%lﬁ!,ﬁge <SS
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 31561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607158-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI18000911/R1vd3n2
s nomnson o wseoreosssrr 2 oo | [N
Code . FCI2
s Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 74948 Veh. Inspected SLG 78280
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim MNo. SHC 7494B (DOA:11/1/2018})  |Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From TEQ SWEE KEONG Assign Date 15/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL 1.5X CVT c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. RU11113068 Colour WHITE
Odometer 90563 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Moedification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60R18 GOODRIDE B mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GOODRIDE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre 215/60 R16 GOODRIDE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 GOODRIDE 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT AND N/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  11/01/2018 Inspection Date 18/01/2018
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD
& BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 629927
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




I V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE mE 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
fr_. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 19%607198R GST Reg. No. 19-86071938-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 7828D

i Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qi Description of Parts Condition
ty pti Workshop ()| ($)

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LEFT FRONT FENDER GARNISH SCRATCHED 160.00 160.00
1|LEFT REAR FENDER GARNISH SCRATCHED 160.00 160.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT 64,00 -64.00
256.00 256.00

LABOUR

TO TUFF KOTE 50.00 30.00
TO REMOVE & REPLACE LEFT FRONT FENDER 450.00 350.00

GARNISH & LEFT REAR FENDER GARNISH.TO REPAIR
FRONT BUMPER & KNOCK LEFT REAR DOOR.

TO PUTTY RESPRAY PAINTING FRONT BUMPER, LEFT 450.00 400.00
FROMT FENDER & LEFT REAR DOOR.TO POLISH

950.00 780.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,206.00 1,036.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 1,036.00]
Report Ref No. CS/FCI18000911/R1vd3n2
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng.AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

BISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY T THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made salsly for the use and benefit of the Client namead on the front page of this Report.
hility of responsibility whatsoeser, in cemact of tod erted e ary third party who may regly on ihe Report wholly or in part. Any third party acting of rplying on this




