Shagilah (LKK Auto)

From: Shagqilah (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 12 February 2018 5:25 PM

To: charandeep.singh@directasia.com

Subject: Total Loss Report & Invoice of Vehicle SKA 6207X
Attachments: LKKInvoice1[1].pdf

Dear Charan,
Please see attach invoice.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shagilah | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933

From: Shaqilah (LKK Auto) [mailto:report@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 12 February 2018 9:54 AM

To: charandeep.singh@directasia.com

Cc: 'sur@lkkauto.com'; report@Ilkkauto.com

Subject: Total Loss Report & Invoice of Vehicle SKA 6207X

Dear Sir / Madam,

Enclose Total Loss Report of SKA 6207X.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shagilah | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933




