Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Mandy <mandy@Itm.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 24 February 2018 9:35 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); JUNE; venus@Itm.sg; richard

Subject: RE: Our Ref LTP012018/001(SJV5667J ) against AIG SIM7557C DOA 08.01.2018 (
CC4/A1G18000793/Kks3 )

Attachments: 0485_001.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Zaini,

Your offer is accepted.

Enclosed please find the endorsed, signed and completed DV for your Mandate early payment.

Thank you and regards,
Manol Y Ll
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg
+65 6452 0893 (Office)

+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)

Like us in Facebook!!
www.facebook.com/LTMsg
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore
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MAIN OFFICE / WORKSHOP BRAMNCH

BLK 176 SIN MING DRIVE BLK 9 SECTOR C #01-38/40/42

SIN MING AUTOCARE #03-09/10/06 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE

SINGAPORE 575721 SINGAPORE 575044

TEL: +65 6452 0833 FAX: +65 6458 9127 TEL: #65 6452 2135 FAX: +65 6452 2159

EMAIL: SALES@LTM.5G ¥ _ -

Operating Hours: Mon — Fri Sam — 6 pm Sat 9am — Spm ?Ei.- f.’ ;rﬁg';g}:ﬁm d S.‘j}.;‘gﬁ !HW;
24hrs Helpline: +65 64520893 WWW.LTM.SG

IMPORTANT NOTICE

This emall, including all attachments may contain confidential or legally privileged information.
The sending of this email to any person ather than the intended recipient is not a waiver of confidentiality or privilege of the information. If you are

not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.
Please note that any views or options presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) [mailto:Zaini@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, February 23,2018 10:58 AM

To: Mandy <mandy@Itm.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref LTP012018/001(SJV5667) ) against AlG SIM7557C DOA 08.01.2018 ( CC4/AIG18000793/Kks3 )
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: LTP012018/001 (SJV 5667 J)
Our Ref: CC4/AIG18000793/Kks3

Dear Mandy,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM 7557C & SJV 5667) ON 08/01/2018
We refer to the above matter.

We confirmed settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $4,119.50
2. Loss of Use(4days x $50.00) S 200.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 7.45

TOTAL $4,326.95

Kindly refer to the attached DV above and forward your signed DV for our necessary action.



