Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

e S —— S R T PSS-S
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>
Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 12:42 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAUto)
Cc: MT_Claim_5G
Subject: RE: [MANDATE RWEQUEST] RE: Direct Settlernent - Accident Involving SKC15858 (O

LPC - TBA) AND GBB4614T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC18000788/Aes3) on 09/01/2018

Dear Asher,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Asher Sng {LKKAuUto) [mailto: AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 8 June, 2018 4:08 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; ONG LI LI

Subject: [MANDATE RWEQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKC1585B (01 : LPC - TBA) AND GBB4614T
(TP : LKK REF - CC&/LPC18000788/Aes3) on 09/01/2018

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 15/01/2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the 2nd vehicle.
In accordance to the MCF guideline for chain collision, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability

Summary to offer to repairer MG SOLUTION PTE LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) 5 18,652.78 56,741.00
2. Loss of Use (6days x 5100) 5  600.00 S 480.00 (6days x $80)
3. LTA search Fee - 7.45 S 745
Total $ 19,260.23 $7,228.45

**4 days recommendation for repair.

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.



The above is for your approval please.

Thank You.,

Rest Regards
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

phone: 8841-4051 | email; gshersng@ikkauta.com | fox 6741-4108

Bk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March 2018 11:37 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com®>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac com:>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKC15858B (Ol : LPC - TBA) AND GBB4614T (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/LPC18000788/Aes3) on 09/01/2018

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

Enclosed the correct copy of the preliminary advice for your perusal.
The correct workshop should be MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Cose Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: d641-6051 | email; gshersng@lkkauto.com | tox: 4741-4108

Blk 51, Payo Ubi industrial Fark, Ubi avenue 1, £02-25 | 5{408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 7 March 2018 2:35 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKC15858 {01 : LPC - TBA) AND GBB4614T (TP : LKK REF -
CCo/LPC18000788/Aes3) on 09/01/2018

Our Ref : 17/18/18/vP05/020329

Dear Asher,



The insurers of SIN2447P is alleging that GBB4614T cut into our insured’s lane
resulting in the chain collision.

Our insured stated that his vehicle was stationary at that point in time.

As such, kindly view the damages to GBB4614T and let us know if 1t is consistent
with the allegation made by the insurers of SIN2447P.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Autg) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 15 January, 2018 10:42 AM

To: 'mt_claim@lonpac.com'; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: 'ericwoo@lonpac.com’; 'llong@lonpac.com'; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKC1585B (OI : LPC - TBA) AND GBB4614T (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/LPC18000788/Aes3) on 09/01/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case,
We have inspected TP vehicle GBE 4614T at M/s MG Solution Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP's GIA report
We will revert preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, Kindly assist to verify validity of our insured’s policy, and let us have a copy of insured's accident
report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.
To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: G366-005% | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415833

Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 201427944N)

Date s 09/04/2018

Your Ref : CC6/LPC18000788/Aes3 (SKC1585B)

To . LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
Attn : Motor Claims Departinent
Dear Sir/Mdm,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE GBB4614T & SKCI1585B ON 09/01/2018 AT
ALONG NEW LUPPER CHANGI ROAD TOWARDS CHANGI ROAD BESIDE
BLOCK 58.

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for your kind perusal:

1) Proforma Bill No.188089 (@ $$6.741.00 (Inclusive Of 7% GST)
2) Loss of Use (@ 85600.00 (6 Days x S5100)

3)  LTA Search @ S$7.45

4) Authorisation to Act

5) GIA Report

Hope the above is in order and kindly let us have your confirmation soon.
Tax invoice will be issue upon amount finalized.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

i

\SHaron Chia

HP: 9188 6931
E-mail: mg3solution@gmail.com



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

REY PANG TRADIR

Name
Address : Sl BUKIT CATee CTREET L3
.h*-'l.," {j'r 4‘|'|J_|_|!’_| FL-H'E r‘]-ﬁ#”{fu’ R.t("l.lxl‘--‘t'l II'|

Contact No
TO:

LbnPAC (NSURANCE BHP
Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INvOLVING _ P B AL 14T anp SKCISREB oy offoifonid
AT/ ALoNG. NEW UpPeR (HANG| RUAD ToWAEDS CHANLI ReAD BESIDE

bLOCE 5§

e, RO PARG TEADIN G
Gelbabi4T

, am/are the registered owner of

motor car no.

Please note that | have assigned zll compensations monies due to me/us in the above said accident
to M/S MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

|/We, hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the above-mentioned
accident to M/S MG SOLUTION PTELTD and forward your settlemeantcheque to M/S MG SOLUTION
PTE LTD whom | had authorized to collect the said compensation maonies.

Thank you

F e 4

Signature of Claimant Witness By



" LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 17/18/18/VPO5/020329
DATE : 28 JUNE 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/We., ROY PANG TRADING confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner SKC 1585B the sum of Singapore Dollars
SEVEN THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED TWENTY EIGHT AND CENTS FORTY
FIVE ONLY. ($7,228.45) in full and final satisfaction. liquidation and discharge of all
property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
in respect of all property losses sustained by mefus whether now or hereafter to
become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving,
GBB 2614T on 09/01/2018 along/at NEW UPPER CHANGI RD TWDS CHANGI
RD BESIDE BL.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (STEVEN CHENG HING
LEONG /LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/fs MG
SOLUTION PTE LTD.

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

- 3 o — 1 I I
ReY PANG TeAPVG | xlr(yors

Mame of vehicle owner/Date



Bill To:
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
NO.100 BEACH ROAD
#18-00 SHAW TOWER

SINGAPORE 188702

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 20-1427944-N)

TAX IN

] B ":I' -‘.I_'L\_.I‘ _.I_,_'_'al .

eV H UE 8
‘-".'; S Ml Yl

T

INVOICE No: TI 189176

PB No : 188089

Date : 13-July-2018

Vehicle Number : GBEB 4614T

QTyY DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation 5 6,300.00
(Lump Sum)
BEFORE GST 6,300.00
7% GST 441.00
TOTAL | § 6,741.00

Cheque 5huyld be made payable to MG Solution Pte Ltd

Co's stamp

& Authorised Signature




1nozos Receipt

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drrive

Singagore 575701

G5T Registration Mo, | M4-D00E529-2
Print Data/Time :
Feceipt DataTime ;

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipl Mo, | ITNET-D0000-180110-000172
Previpus Receipl Mo,

SN Mtem Description/ Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before
No. GST (8%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SKC15858

As at 00 Jan 2018/17:20:00

Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

1 Insurance Enguiry - 3KC15858
Enguiry Fea T.00
201201100B5642072439

Sub-Total 7.00
Total Befors Rounding T.00
- Reunding Differance

Total Amount Payabie

10 Jan 2018 / 08:57:53

10 Jan 2018/ 085753
GST Amount
Amount  After GST
i835) (5%)

0.49 T49

045 T49

48 49

0.04

T45

Paid By
20480110085 70086 ﬁ:;ga;;::?a Doty
Tatal
Cash Change
Tendered Amount
Excess Refundable Amount

THANE YOU AND HAVE & NICE DAY!

TA45

745
o000
745
0.00

Please ensura that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwige, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late foe

may apply.

https:ifvr. ta.gov.sgiitaivrlaction/completePayment ?FUNCTION_ID=F1301001TT

111



1102018 Vehicle Insurance Particulars Enquiry

Vehicle Insurance Particulars Result

Vehicle No, Incident Date/Time Insurance Company Name
SKC15858 09 Jan 2018 7 17:20:00 LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Print OK Save as PDF

mtpsiivrlita.gov.sgitairiactioninsEnquiryPaymentAck? FUNCTION _ID=FOTO5006ET &biz TrnNum=ITNET-00000-180110-000172

11



