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¥y 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

B BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
ECICS LTD Ref : CS/ICS18000785/Ktd3
1531 SATER TONER IR
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER ONE Date: 12-01-2018
SINGAPORE 038587 &nbsp; &nbsp;
Code: ICS
1l Policy Particulars :- OWN DAMAGE
Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected SKJ 9680U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 750.00
Assign From  JANICE GOH Assign Date 12/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mrm
4. - Description of Damages
5. ; General Information
Accident Date  12/01/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD
BLK 176 SIN MING DRIVE
#03-09 SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAPORE 575721
5a. Remarks
AJTHE MARKET VALUE IS 88— ——(EST. AVERAGE)
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REFAIRS.
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51 UBIAVE 1, #0125 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (k65) 62564315

Your Ref : TO BE ADVISE Date: 16/01/2018

Our Ref: CSICS18000785/K1td3

The Motor Claims Department
QBE Insurance International Ltd

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SKJ 9680U

We thank you for the instruction on __12/01/2018 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 15/1/2018 _ at the premises of M/s LIM TAN MOTOR__and have the
following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount 'S8 4.193.80
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 3.467.00
“Check” ltems Amount : 5% 280.50
Market Value :S$  64.000.00
LTA Reimbursement Value ©S$§  46.197.00
MNett Value 1 5% 17.803.00

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained at the front n/s.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damage consistent
Repair cost economical

We have not authorized repairs.

Yours faithfully
Kenneth
Automotive Assessor



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

#

From: motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 12 January 2018 3:57 PM

To: richard; assignments

Cc: mandy@Itm.sg; ECICS Claims; motorsurvey
Subject: RE: OD Survey - 5KJ9680U

Attachments: ESTIMATE.PDF; GIA.PDF

Dear Richard

Thank you for your email.
We will appoint LKK for the OD survey

Aside to LKK

Please assist to arrange OD survey.
Policy excess $750.00

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +65 6303 0182
FAX: +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.sq
directly.

**please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. **

From: richard [mailto:richard@Itm.sg]
Sent: Friday, 12 January, 2018 12:40 PM
To: ECICS Claims; motorsurvey

Cc: mandy@ltm.sg

Subject: OD Survey - SKJ9680U
Importance: High

Good Afternoon to all,
We now enclosed the following documents for Own Damage survey request to the above mentioned vehicle.

= Repair Estimate
¢ GIA Report

The vehicle is currently at our workshop premises,

Please arrange for survey soonest and we shall appreciate if you could advised us the excess amount so as for us to
inform the client accordingly,



Thank you and regards,

Richard Ang

Claims Executive
Lim Tan Motor Pte Lid

www. LTM.sg

+65 6452 0893 (Office)
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)
+65 8484 5418 (Mobile)

Like us in Facebook!!
www.facebook.com/LTMsg

www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore

i
&

F
LIM TAN MOTOR

LIM TAN MOTOR PTELTD #RISZIZFAAFIELE

COMPANY REGISTRATION NO: 1333072770 G5T REGISTRATION NO: M2-0119086-0

MAIN OFFICE / WORKSHOP BRAMNCH

BLE 176 SIN MING DRIVE BLK 9 SECTOR C #01-38/40/42

SIN MING AUTOCARE #03-09/10/06 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
SINGAPORE 575721 SINGAPDORE 575644

TEL: +65 6452 DEI3 FAX: +65 6458 3127 TEL: #65 6452 2135 FAX: +65 6452 2153

EMAIL: SALES@LTM.S6 . =

L (:.'_ o S P oo '
Operating Hours: Mon - FriSam—G6pm  5at 3am - 5pm é‘p_/ C_NTRPRINUR stﬂ 6!‘%;
24hrs Helpline: +65 64520893 WWW.LTM. 56

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Thic email, including all attachments may contain confidential or legally provileged information.

The sending of this email o any persan other than the Intended recipient is not a waiver of confidentiality or privilege of the information. If you are
not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents,

Please note that any views or options presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

follow us on[, 4] follow us on visit our website H
facebook T twitter E ecics.com.sg Ec’mc,‘,sﬂ

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee
or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions
contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee
indicated in his message (or responsible for dellvery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case,
you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do
not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.



Denise Ta: (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 11:37 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'motorsurvey’; assignments; 'Goh, Siew Geok Janice’
Cc: 'ECICS Claims'; SUR

Subject: RE: OD Survey - SKJ9680U

Attachments: PREL! ADVISED SKJ 9680U.pdf

Dear Janice,

Kindly ignore the previous email

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKJ 9680U
We have not authorise repair

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall; denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 11:31 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=; ‘motorsurvey’ <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@Ilkkauto.com=; 'Goh, Siew Geok Janice' <janice.goh@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: 'ECICS Claims' <claims@ecics.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD Survey - SKI9680U

Dear lanice,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle 5KJ 9680U

We have not authorise repair

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Monday, 15 January 2018 11:14 AM

To: 'motorsurvey' <motorsurvey@ecics.COMm.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'ECICS Claims' <claims@ecics.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD Survey - SKI9680U

Dear Janice,



Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 January 2018 8:54 AM
To: richard@/tm.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: SKJ 96800 AUTHORIZATION

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKJ 9680U (Excess 5750/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)



Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: motarsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 3:46 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Ce: ECICS Claims: motorsurvey; SUR

Subject: RE: OD Survey - SKJ9680U  ;  Our ref DMCP1800008H/LC
Dear Denise

Thank you for your email below
Please proceed to repair if damage is consistent.
Our case handler is Lionel Chua.

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +85 6303 0182
FAX: +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTIO RVEY, please email to motorsyrvey@ecics com.sq
directly.

*%please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding.**

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 11:31 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); motorsurvey; assignments; 'Goh, Siew Geok Janice'
Cc: ECICS Claims; SUR

Subject: RE: OD Survey - SKJ9680U

Dear Janice,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle 5KJ 9680U
We have not authorise repair

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkayto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 15 January 2018 11:14 AM
To: 'motorsurvey’ <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

1



11.’12|'2:‘.I‘! ] PARFICOE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Ve hicle Owner Particulars

Owrer 1D Type: Singapore NRIC

bwner 1D: | 2639E |

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: 5KJ9680U

Véh'lcle to be Exported: Yes

Intended De-registration Date: 12 Jan 2018

WVehicle Make: MAZDA

Vehicle Model: 3SP 1.6L A/T ABS D/AB 2WD 5DR HID 4EAT
Primary Colour: Grey

Manufacturing Year: 2012

Engine No.: Z6ABA4128

Chassis No.: JM6BL10Z2D0360984

Maximum Power Output:

77.0kW (103 bhp)

Open Market Value: $15,094.00
Original Registration Date: 30 May 2013
First Registration Date: 30May 2013
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: £15,094.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 29 May 2023
PARF Rebate Amount: $11,320.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 29 May 2023

COE Category:

A - Car (1400cc & below)

hitps:ivrllagov.sgitaivilaclion/e nguireRebateByPublicBefore Deregln put? FUNCTION_ID=F0304008TT

172



MLTHM1A00GE35 { Lim Tan Motor Pie Lid - HG
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 12/01/2018 10:23
SUBMITTED BY: Ang Wi Guang, Richan

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Pizase report correclly the dotais of the aceident (o spead up he claims OCESS.
2 This Form must be complated by the Policyhalder andio the Authorised Driver.

3. Infarmation provided must ba as truthful and accurate as possibie. Any wiful misrepresentation o wilholding of material facts may allow iNSUANCE COMpANES 10

repudiate policy abality.

A The issue and aceeptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liabily on the pan of the nsurance COMpANes

5. Any false reporting may be referr

ed to the Police for investigation.

&. This raport will be forwarded by thi insurers of 1
Singapore{GIA] for archiving and that copies of this
7. By the Iedgement of s repol o the insurers, you

aforasaid

Date Of Reporl
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

\ehicle Reqistration Mumber
Insured/Policyholder
NMame Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone Mo

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

he Insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Aszsociation of
roport will for a fee be made availabie upon application by interested parties.
hereby consent to tha archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made avaiable

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
12/01/2018 10:23
12/01/2018 08:10
SLIP RD FROM LOR 2 TOA PAYOH TOWARDS PIE {CHANGI)
SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SKJesaou

SIM HONG

ST832639E
SIMHONG_SG@YAHOO.COM.SG
(LOCAL) +65-96904905
OTHERS-96904905

MAZDA,
3-1.6 SP (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy YES

for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number
Driver

MName of Driver

MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Ocoupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Mumber

Contact Mumkber

EMail Address

PRIVATE CAR

ECICS LIMITED
COMPREHENSIVE
NO
MPC17B00029700

SlM HONG

S5T832630E

10/10/1978

INDOOR

25/09/2001

16 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-96904805

OTHERS-96904905
SIMHONG SG@YAHOO.COM.SG

Page 1of 23



Address

Posteode
\Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Acciden!

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Mumber of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any hody injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospilal by
ambulance?

Was any other maternial or proparty damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

NMumber of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported lo the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Proseculion given?
If Yos,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

| WAS DRIVING MY VEHICLE A ALONG LOR 2 TOA PAYOH TOWARDS PIE
ROAD, VEHICLE B WAS TRAVELLING IN FRONT OF MY VEHICLE. | WAS CHECKING ON THE

BLK 1658 PUNGGOL CENTRAL
#11-169

822165
NO
OWNER

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
RAINING
WET

NO

NO
MO
YES

MO

NO

NO

(CHANGI). UPON APPROACHING THE SLIP
MAJOR ROAD ON-COMING

TRAFFIC AND DID NOT REALISED THAT VEHICLE B HAD ACTUALLY STOPPED. THIS RESULTED MY VEHICLE WAS
UNABLE TO STOP IN TIME AND COLLIDED ONTO THE REAR OF VEHICLE B. NO INJURIES WERE INVOLVED. THAT'S

ALL.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for altachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

as there any audio recorded?

YES
NO
MO

W
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category

Mame of Driver
MRIC/Passport Number
Conlact Number

Address

Poslcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

SDSE110R
TOYOTA HARRIER { WHITE

PRIVATE CAR
LEONARD

93683761

Page 2 of 23



Sketch Plan
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T Li# TAN

ESTI faur (250635
VEHICLE NO  :SKJ 9680 U ISURVEYORNAME: .
MAKE i MAZDA |DATE OF SURVEY : P SAN LU
MODEL : 3 8P 1.6L A/T D/AB 2WD 50R HID 4tAT  |[TIME OF SURVEY :
YEAR 12013
CHASSIS NO : JMBBL10Z22D0360984 DATE : 12 January 2018
DATE OF ACCIDENT : 12 January 2018
POLICY NO : MPC17B0D029700
INSURANCE CO : ECICS LIMITED
T TEMASEK BOULEVARD
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER 1
SINGAPORE 038887
Qty ____Parts Description/ Labour | Type |Unit Price| Nett item Amt |  Amount |
1 pc Front Bumper m‘x $ 33000 | =
1pe Front Bumper Reinforcement A § 18000 -
2 pcs Front Bumper Retainer $ 13.00 sl 26.00 | <
1pe Front Bumper Sponge To’d|s v so000|7
1 pc Front Bumper Lower Grille $ 2+ 115,00 |—
1 pe Front Bumper Emblem $ ¥ 18.00 | —
10 pcs Front Bumper Clips $ 200 $7% 2000 |—
1 pe Front Support Panel $E/4 180.00 | —
1pe N/S Headlamp D] g 780,00 | e—
1pe N/S Headlamp Lower Brackel $ 77 8.00|—
1 pe N/S Front Fender % 140.00 b——
1pe Bonnet $ P 32000 [—
2 pos Bonnet Top Rubber Side Svt|$ 3000 X AT | g 60.00 | &
1pe Bonnet Top Rubber Centre W 5 “ 25.00 | 7
1pc Bonnet Insulator 3 90.00 | ¥
8 pos Bonnet Insulator Clips $ 200 & ‘&‘P{ 16.00 | ~—
5 2,358.00
Cost Plus 10% % 23580
3 2,993.80
1pc Front Number Flale 5. Nefl $ fn 4000 | X
d"cp:,-r,
To putty and spray painl, 3 B0OO.00
To remove and refit air-con condenser, 5 BO.0D |~
vacuum and refill gas.
2y
To check front wire and [ocus headlamp. 5 30.00
Seler
Labour Charges \ts Hence notify 5 650,00
TG/- RA - - il $ 4 ,9§_§u_
5“1".'1 Ro-
|
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ESTIMATE TO REPAIR fei R
VEHICLE NO 1 SKJ 9660 U |SURVEYOR NAME :
MAKE : MAZDA {DATE OF SURVEY : -0 JANZ813 ’"‘il
MODEL $3 5P 1.6L AT DIAB 2WD SDR HID 4EAT [ TIME OF SURVEY : N
Y EAR 2012
CHASSIS NO  : JMGBL10Z200360984 DATE : 12 January 2018
DATE OF ACCIDENT : 12 January 2018
POLICY NO : MPC1 7800022700
INGURANCE CO  ECICS LIMITED
T TEMASEK BOULEVARD
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER 1
= SINGAPORE 038087
Qi Parts Description/ Labour Type | Unit Price| Nettltem Amt | Amount
" ipc. | |Fronl Bumper A ECu NS 330.00
1pe .7 |Fronl Bumper Reinforcement o $ Vv 180.00
2pes_ . |Front Bumper Relainer 144 $ 13.00 tdet | o 96-00
1pc o~ |Front Bumper Sponge s ./ 5000
1pe . 7 |Fronl Bumper Lower Grilla 5 115.00
Tpe o b |Fronl Bumper Emblem $ "% 18.00
10 pes .~ [Front Bumper Clips $ 200 $7% 20,00
1pe o ¢ |Front Support Panel $S% 180.00
ipev " |N/S Headlamp P ety § 780.00
1 po 7 0 |NFS Headlamp Lower Bracket $ 27 800
1pe - |N/S Fronl Fender $ 7 140.00
1 poy Bonnet ¥ ey 320.00
2pes~  |Bennet-Tep-Rubber-Side—— $—30.00 | ——Al4a g 0.0
1pe = — |Bonnel-Top Rubber Centre. - —f - o -5 —25:00
1pc o Bonnel Insulator = e 89000 -
8 pcs « Bonnet Insulalor Clips § —2.00 e E——"iﬂ%-ﬂﬁn-
'$  2,358,00 |
Cost Plus 10% B 23580
$ 259380 |
1pc Front Number Plale -- 5. Nefl th*l% & 1S~ 00 -ﬂa-'-f“-—ﬂﬂ,;? &
To putly and spray paint %""ﬁ) &?;ﬂ; 00 B BQD.U;}‘.V
To remove and refit air-con condenser, 0% B2 4O 3 80.00 |—
vacuum and refill gas, %ﬂhﬁ% !4.('.'}
Woour | §1300. 09 Z2¢
T check ront wire and Tocus headlamp, EE S'TG_E, Lo k3 0.0
e __———pfl o,
Labiour Charges. LEK Autg Consultanis Hence notify Jfll l 5 GL0.00
the Repd rer ofthe Ialrm-rmg_: _
S e R D e
* Pars are subject lo donfirmation
24 J&u wn :m“" 'mﬂl’fﬁﬂdw basis
Mi/ = Sup niary itemis) mus be reserecyed angd
(SR A S SREERR o K in fina] goproval lom isaance Company 8 o -,
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S_L}_PPLEMENTARY TO REPAIR

o

&
#
T LIM TAN METOR

VEHICLENO  :SKJ 9680 U SURVEYOR NAME : T
NAKE : MAZDA DATE OF SURVEY :
MODEL 5 5P 1.6 AT DIAB 2WD 50R HID 4EAT  [TIME OF SURVEY : T
TEAR ;2013
CHASSIS NO . JMEBL‘IGZEDDE&GQEA DATE + 18 January 2018
DATE OF ACCIDENT : 12 January 2018
POLICY NO : MPC17B00029700
INSURANCE CO : ECICS LIMITED
7 TEMASEK BOULEVARD
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER 1
SINGAPORE 038987
- ity Parts Description/ Labour Type | Unit Price Meft Itein Amt Amount |
1 pec Front Bumper Grille - Lower “m & gl 90.00
Cost plus 10% $ 9.00
$ 99.00
TG-RA__|TOTAL- - $ 99.00 |

|

ik 478 Sin Wing D

Ty -G5S 20m05 Fax Bh-Gasda e’

T ey M FREEN

e b

; Tan Motor PMe Lid

it ednungEi Tha 5
GST feg R W20 EE0EG-O

ot FO-0 Sin Ming Autncin & Singapare ST

yriehsin | wew LT 50

Vhis document

(AL Mt T Peprodunea. N einole
ot ol |am Tan Mot e Ll

pan, or disclosed ko lhed prarty G parins ekl S paor vanien



1€

B % A4 AL A IR 3]
JAE AUTO PTE LTD

@ %

Blk 3018 UBI ROAD 1 #01-121 SINGAPORE 408710

TEL: 67453833 FAX: 67454442, 67450816 (Account)

WAREHOUSE:

484 SUNGE! IKADUT AVE SINGAPORE 729672

TEL: G365 1255 FAX: 6365 2580

Email: jaeauto@pacific.net.sg

GST REG. NO.: M2-0119201-3 CO. REG, NO.: 199307741M

LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD

WIMDECALEN LRSS
Depl Dirwet; BATT @01/ 6405

Dot Dhect: G417 T84

Aeraryps Oy

Dhivesi

7/

|

TOYOTA

GFER O

(Do Direcl §305 BOE0 Dol Direcr: 8305 54611

Dt Drmek BA17 G700

Diept Direel: 8417 9902

@

LERLES  aalaTiL

Eo IR ST > [—

et et G417 47065

Doyl thewscl; G40 P F703

Wipar hlade: WWE (Mippon Wipar Bade), Silipes [ Mado n Konga ),

Fareh { Madae in Germany |
Spark plug: Nippon Densa, MGE (Mado In Japan;

BLK 2 #01-38 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE

8(575644)

TEL ;64532397 FAX : 64589127

ATTN :
SEND 01-42

*fu/;ga:lchn
“RGV4-50-031 EBR |
/ 73 BL 2011-
/%;A-}—ﬁuﬂmﬁ 5
%3 BL 09-
/%fkm-m-ma E:,[

73 2011-
BHB6-50-1 T2A

73 2011- ;
(°235-51-731A s

T A-S0-HA] 2
-1. MODEL
BHB6-53-110

; M3 2011

[FHITAOL201E 9:49:33AM

]
DL FESUPPORT PANEL

DESCRIPTION

FBUMPER (SPORT) _
RETAINER.F BUMPER rlfli/
GRILLE.F BUMPER ff,-M

SPORTY
GRILLE.F BLMPIER{'L'LM'TEJI;S KT

MASCOT W/0 BASE. | 9]-11’6

(MZ3 2014 )

7. 2-06/3/ BM/6-15/MZ7 5--08

FBUMPER/GRILLE L,

TAXINVOICE  AR201801-09847

DATE
CUSTOMER 112 ¢
VEH REG. NO.
TERMS
PO NO.
PAGE NO,
CURR
SkLoe  QTY  UPRICE
PA 1 330,00
PLA-G1-04
A l [ 3.00
P1.3-11-10H
A 1 Q000
Pl.4«G1
PA ] 115.00
PL3-01-0a0
PA 1 18.00
PL3-HI-101]
A 10 2.00
PL3-H1-(OF
PA | 180.00

PL3-11-078B

i

CONTINUE NEXT PAGE

Cinods Sold are not relundable For Cash
[nterest Wate of 1.5% per month will be imposed on Owverlue Accountis).

CHLFGIMAL

[E]17/01/2018

17/01/2018
LIMOO2
SKJ9680U
30 days

Page 1 of 2
SGD

Fuauisl St

330.00
1 3.00

SO

115.00

1,00

20.00

1 80.00

S3L OUAM
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JAE AUTO PTE LTD

Bl 3018 UBI ROAD 1 #01-121 SINGAPORE 408710
TEL: 67453633 FAX: 67454442 67450616 (Account)

WAREHOUSE:
ABA SUNGE| KADUT AVE SINGAPORE 720672

TEL: 6365 1255 FAX: 6365 2580

[F]17012018 949.33AM
roods Sald are not reflundable for Cash.

Arranga By

WIRDALRE L4 GLARE
Dept Drnct: S417 $781 ¢ GT45 8018

© w Qﬂﬁﬂﬂﬁ

eyt [ewci: 5 8510

TOYOTA

Dep Dirsct: (004 W11

AR e o m |
Byl Brbrwct: G447 DTS Dopt Bract: 8417 3T98

[E] 17012018

Interest Rate af 1.5% per month will be imposed an OverDue Account(s).

TAE Auto Prae. Lid.
Sales Hxeculive: KHOON

I'liis is computer generated document,
Mo signature is requived.

BIRCTRTIRNEE

Drviver

Recaryed umt Good Ord
WLT;E
_.rf-- --|.

@

LB =an W L AR AR

Dopt Direck G417 8792

Diaiot Dlwain. G417 BTRL Dhpit ool 40T 5750

i . Wipor hiade: MW (Mo Wipa Blackd, Sthoor ¢ baca o Korea )
Email: |tmau1uliupa{:|f|c.nel.sg Pk § Mk i Cenmany |
GAT REG. NO.: M2-0119201-3 CO. REG. NO.: 190307741M Bpark plug: Migpon Do, MOK (o o
LIM TAN MOTOR PTE L'TD - CTAXINVOICE ~ AR201801-09847
BLEK 9#01-38 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTALE DATE 17/01/2018
§(575644) CUSTOMER 11D ¢ LIMOGO2
VEI REG. NO. SKIo6R0OUI
TERMS 30 days
TEL : 64532397 FAX : 64589127 PO NO,

ATTN : PAGE NO), Page 2 01 2
r.;!-.ﬁ ? ]("FJTJ - __ ._.“mm_.:_.]')F":r("i?.l]yl—]rPN B ﬁl‘k]aﬂ? - oTY LFPRICE  AMOUNT
" BDGE-51-041M Cf FHLAMPL PA 1 TEO.00 T8O.00

2 7.3 BL 09-- 1/ PL3-F1-100
“BEY8-5221 Y(BBYS) ||  EFENDER LH (STD) o | 14000 140,00

/23 BL (09- PL3FI-13B
BEY4-52-31 XC |7 FEBONNET A I 320.00 320,00

A3 BL 09-- : PL3-F1-038
SUB-TOTAL - 2,006.00
ADD GST 7.00 % 140,42
--------- 1«\;\'}! 'HHM ﬁMUUH E éi--J-ﬁ--------------.- 2 146. 4-2

D3 09A M

€T

Signature / Co Stamp / Date

ORIGIMAL
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JAE AUTO PTE LTD

Bk 3018 UBI ROAD 1 §01-121 SINGAPORE 408710
TEL: 67453833 FAX: 67454442, 67450616 (Account)

WAREHOUSE:
48A SUNGEI KADUT AVE SINGAPORE 729672
TEL: 6365 1256 FAX; 6365 2580

RE

® W

Email: jaeauto@pacific.nat,sg

GST REG. NO.: ME-GHEIZD!-&_ _C'D. REG. NO.: 199307 741M
LAM TAN MOTOR PTE 11D
BIK 9 #01-38 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTALFE
s(375044)

FEL 64532397 FAN - 64589127
ATTH
scnd 01-42

o

DESCRIPTION

4 FOAM. I BUMETiK

PR EINE RO AN I
..f"

=
S0 STOCKE LS
| BERG ﬁﬁlm

M3 BL O9-
2 BHREGSO-0TOL" _g'

MZ3 BL 09"

[P 1PH0T 2018 240 22PN

tiookls Sold are not relundable tor @ ash
intereat Rate of 1.5% per month will be imposed on Overl ue Account(s)

TET R

This is computer penerated document,
M signsbore is required.

JAE Auto Ple Lid

FHOU

Sales Executive

OHRTGIMN AL

R e 5
Dieql Mtisect: BEYP 47010 /B4 9600

(Dt D 1= B2E B0

A L=| S e on 22, (1)

Dt Direct: 8417 B7ek

QFERA O

Diap] Diewt: G308 0691

©
L e ppamiary
Dw'“"ﬂ-'ﬂﬂlm

TEI'I’E.‘TJL

PR

& em=m

Dot Dirot: G117 3705 Dol Dewc B4LT TSE Depl i 641 7 arga

Wipnr bitade: WWE (Mippan Winer bude), Sige { Made in Koeeg j,
Forch § kade in Germany
Spark plhig: Mippon Denso, NGK (Made e Japan)

TAX INVOICE . AR201801-10312
DATE 17/01/2018

CUSTOMER 1Y LIMNOO2
VEH REG. N, SKJO680L]
TERMS 30 davs
PO N, =
PAGE NO. Page 1 of |
CURR. S
Stkl.oe ory IVPRICE AMOUNT
1.1 I 500,000 50,00
SUPPLIER
LI | [ Wl CH [ B0 00
MA-ATOR
/
.c*’./f
SUB-TOTAL 2300l
ALY GST 7.00 % I 100
FEATAL AMOLUINT ST 246,10
[E] 1712018 23932176

£ d iy el e
k Rl LT

snebis B amaiiearl via
PR T Ly L abl

signature ! Clo Stamp £ Date
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JAE AUTO PTE LTD

Bik B0 8 LB ROAD 1 #01-121 SINGAPORE 408710
TEL: 67453833 FAX: 67454442, 67450616 (Account)
WAREHOUSE;

48M SUNGEI IKADUT AVE SINGAPORE 729672

TEL: G365 12565 FAX; 6365 2580

S

R

ety

Email: jpeauto@pacific.net. sg
GST REG. NO.: M2-0119201-3 CO. REG. NO.: 159307741M

LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD -
.9 #01-38 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
5{575644)

TEL : 64532397 I'AX © 64589127 &
ATTIN

SEND 01-42
S0Q STOCKID

1. BBM4-50-1610
M3 BL 08

DESCRIPTION
')

L& O

[P 17/01/2018 946 STAM

Goods Sold are nol refundable Loar Cash

Mapd Ciract: B41T 0701 / 6745 Qo)

Dt Direct: 1T BP0

BRACKET H/LAMP RH/AH .

-
GIERN &

Diajrl Dt G308 S 10

AlS Qe

WIMOBORILN Gonas [

mm Th 8]

LRSS DLy

Dot Ehrgnl: mﬂﬂ P ot Dot G 15 0700

A Jmurm ﬁ
rum A

Dapl Dires- GATF 0705 Dol Meexst: B4 17 906 D Dewel: 417 193

Whpser Baladhe: MY sappon Wiper bl Sillpeer | Macder in Kowep §,
HE Geermany |
e, MG (Made b Japang

Farchi Rade w o

Spadk plug: Mg D

TAX INVOICE . AR201801-09857

DATE 17/01/2018
CUSTOMER ID LIMOO2
VEH REG. NO, SKI9GEOLT

I'ERMS

J0 days

PO NO,
PAGE NO, Page 1 of 1
CURR, SGD
Stkloc QTY  UPRICE AMOUNT
il | 800 £.00

UILI-A2-Fg2

SLIE-TOTAL ®.00
AL YGST 7.00 % .56
TOTAL AMOUNT ~SGD 8.56

[E] 17/01/2018 9:46.27AM

Interest Rate of | 5% per month will be imposed on Overl Jue Account{s).

TAal Auto Pre. L,

Sales Lixecutive B3N " 807-098 57

This is computer generated docwment.
No signalure is reguired.

ORIGINAL

ATTVTER R

Lroods Recovad i Good Order

Stgnature / Co Stamp / Date



' V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

R

;_‘.- =‘. = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapora 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199507198R GST Reg. No. 19-B607198-R
Affiliated to Fedaration Internationale Des Exparts En Automebile
ECICS LTD Ref : CS/CS518000785/Ktd3n2
{1
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER ONE Date - 07-02-2018
SINGAPORE 038087
Code: ICS
13 Policy Particulars :- OWN DAMAGE
Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected SKJ 9B880U
Policy No. MPC17B00029700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DMCP1800008H/LC Excess ($) 750.00
Assign From JANICE GOH Assign Date 12/01/2018
b Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDA 3 (A) c.c 1588
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. JMEBL10Z2D0360984 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer B5166 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/45 ZR17 MICHELIN 7mm
L/H Front Tyre [215/45 ZR17 MICHELIN 7mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/45 ZR17 MICHELIN 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/45 ZR17 MICHELIN 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT NIS PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/01/2018 Inspection Date 15/01/2018
Survey held at LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD
ELK 176 SIN MING DRIVE
#03-09 SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAPORE 575721
5a. Remarks
AJTHE MARKET VALUE IS S$84,000.00 (EST. AVERAGE)
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REFAIRS.

Sh. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days
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Adi BE B

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKJ 9680U

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

59 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page Mo..1of2

i Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop '.;} {S{i
REPLACEMENT ART
1|FRONT BUMPER (WCP) BUCKLED 330.00 330.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT {WCFP) BENT 180.00 180.00
2|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER &@313.00 (WCF) N/S DISTORTED 26.00 13.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE (WCP) TORN 50.00 50.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE (WCP) DENTED 115.00 115.00
1|FRONT BUMPER EMBLEM (WCP) NECESSARY 18.00 16.00
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS @$2.00 (WCP) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL (WCP) CRACKED 180.00 180.00
1| /S HEADLAMP (WCP) MTG CRACKED T80.00 T80.00
1|N/S HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET (WCP) DISTORTED 8.00 8.00
1|M/S FRONT FENDER (WCP} BUCKLED 140.00 140.00
1|BONNET (WCP) BUCKLED 320.00 320.00
?|BONNET TOP RUBBER SIDE @$30.00 (WCP) SERVICEABLE 60.00 -
1|BONNET TOP RUBBER CENTRE (WCP) SERWVICEABLE 25.00 -
1|BONNET INSULATOR (WCP) SERVICEABLE 90.00 -
8|BONNET INSULATOR CLIPS @$2.00 (WCP) NOT NECESSARY 16.00
1|FRONT BUMPER GRILLE-LOWER (WCP){ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 90.00 90.00
COST PLUS 10% 244 80 224.40
2,692 80 2,468 .40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) SERVICEABLE 40.00
40.00
LABOUR
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT. 800.00 600.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT AIR-CON CONDENSER.VACUUM 80.00 80.00
AND REFILL GAS.
TO CHECK FRONT WIRE AND FOCUS HEADLAMP. 30,00 20.00
LABOUR CHARGES 650.00 &00.00
1,560.00 1,300.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,292 80 3,768.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 3,768.40
LESS EXCESS -750.00

Report Ref No. CS/ICS18000785/Ktd3n2
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Page No.:2 of 2
NETT LIABILITY | 3,018.40

Report Ref No. CS/ICS18000785/Ktd3n2

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser




