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B V7V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- - 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Ren. Np 199607198R GST Reg, No 19-89607138-R
Affiliated Lo Federation Internationals Des Experts En Automobile
INDILA INTERMNATIONAL INSURANCE PL Ref :  CC4/11118000764/Uus3
505.62 108 BULLBING SINGAPORE 048711 EEE S Hulﬂlmll""ll”l“ Iﬂ
Code : 112
, 12 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 80218 Veh. Inspected SJH 54044
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 12/01/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Modal c.c a
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Ndometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
l
5, General Information
Accident Date  23/12/2017 |Inspection Date 12/01/2018
Survey held at SOC LEON MOTOR WORKS
1 KAK| BUKIT AVEG BLKD
#01-91 AUTOBAY @ KAK| BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

'Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 10 Type:

Cwiner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.;

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date;
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.;

Chassis Na.:

Maximum Power Output:
Cipen Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Pald:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Company

6236MN

SIH54044

Mo

12 jan 2018

SUBARU

IMPREZA 5D 1.5R AWD AT
Black

2008

EL15D319875
JFIGH3KS58G011355
790 kW (105 bhp)
$13444.00

13 Aug 2008

13 Aug 2008

3

$13.444.00

Yes
12 Aug 2018
$6.722.00

12 Aug 2018

A - Car [1400cc & below)
10

$12,501.00

5729.00

$7.451.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Jan 2018

OK

Page 1ot 2

https://vrl.ha.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput ?FUNCTION _ID=F0304009... 12-Jan-18



, REPAIRING OF
MOTOR VEHICLES. . ~ I § R 3
- 74
PANEL BEATING 3$ E- }% 5 i = =% =
A & 7 A
weons s SOVC LEON MOTOR WORKS e S
A AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT 1 o5
CLAIMS | Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk D, #01-91, Singapore 4| 7883 ok o &
DEALING 1IN 2MD Tﬂi ﬁ?47 ?HSH. ﬁ?“-? B“-g Filf l‘ﬁ-ﬂ Dﬂl! # ﬁ ;:*- *_
E-mail: stmoi @ singnel.com.sg
HAND YEHICLE. Reg No. 206639/00K
M/S YONG LEE SENG MOTOR HOLDINGS PTE LTD DATE: 100172018
DOA : 231222017
ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO, SJH § P
Description List Price
1 pe Fromt fender (1h) D& {u{_ 5 290.00 —~—
| pe Fender innershield 3, 5 135.00—
10 pes Clips @SS$3.80 g b 38.00 e
1 pc Front bumper r_ 5 670,00 X
| pc Bumper side retainer (Ih) Rt $ 2500 —
10 pes Bumper clips @S$3.80 /lee- $ 3800 —
5 1,196.00
Less : 20% 5 (239.20)
$ 956.80
Special Nett Items
Labour charges for knocking & replacing parts. 5 350,00 2 -I?j
Spraypainting b 400.00 3 69
TOTAL : 3 1,706.80)
pr. o (ple

Tl 645356/
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34y

ng/
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Il <metorclaim@ii.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 12 January 2018 9:45 AM
To: simoi; 'sur@lkkauto.com’; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Zuhaidah Samsuri
Subject: RE: Accident involving SIH5404A & SHCBO021B on 23/12/2017
Attachments: IMG_20180110_0001 jpg; IMG_20180110_0002 jpg; IMG_20180110_0003 jpg; IMG_
20180110_0004 jpg

9-92am @ 1501 | 2018

Dear Sir/ Mdm, ' i
Person @J{}E’Lphv“i

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SJH54044 and let us have your report urgently. ""JE‘LGL[! ﬂ u} In

This claim will be handled by Ms Aida,
*rindly upload this survay request email lo merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street | #05 I0B Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: simoi [mailto:slmei@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: 12 January, 2018 9:39 AM

Te: Motor Claim - lll <motarclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SIH5404A & SHC80218B on 23/12/2017

Hi Gabriel,
We agreed to call LKK Auto Consultants to arrange our client’s vehicle.

Regards,

Irene Leong

SOC LEON MOTOR WORKS
Tel : 67477853

From: Motor Claim - lll [mailto:motorclaim @iii.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 11 January 2018 1:45 PM

To: simoi <slmai@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SIH5404A & SHC8021B on 23/12/2017

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email,

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:



* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
s \icom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.,

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

B4 Cecll Street | #05 108 Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel; 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: simai [mailto:simoi@singnet.com sg)
Sent: 11 January, 2018 11:04 AM

Te: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com,sg>
Subject: Accident involving SIH5404A & SHCB0218 on 23/12/2017

Hi,

Please find attached documents and arrange for survey at your earliest convenience.
Thanks & Regards,

Irene Leong

S0C LEON MOTOR WORKS
Tel: 67477858

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWWL EVE. COm

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed 1o us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore, This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information,

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

2



*of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
‘Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No, 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

[t may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses,

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



5/15/2018 Merimen e-Claims
Print Received Message

This mall |5 asaocialed with

*BJH5404A (MCT17120844)
[BHCB2YE)
1

YORG LEE SENG HOLDINGS PTE LTD
Dec 73 2017 7-00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD|
Sac Lean Molor Works

Fram Indis International Insurance Pre Lid [(HQ) (I0_SG), sam on 11052018 16:38 PM,
Ta LKK_HO
Subjeci  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S5880,00) - SJH54044 - Ciaim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri

Approved 980,00,

hllps:ﬁsingapnra,mriman.mnit:hlrrmﬁndax.dm?fusabc#ﬁ\'ﬁ:mﬂhﬁﬂaﬂhn=dspu%l&ﬂﬂﬂ=3mmrfﬂKEN=? 1b41bid2524960c-D92010D8-BFC1-



FESAIRMNG DF

MOTOR UEHIELES. . - . ﬂ'} ﬂiﬁi ‘f"l;_
BANEL BEATING, R ig e
B &
WEBLDING, SPRAYING.
SOC LEON MOTOR WORKS % i
1] ANCE AGENT, ¥
s AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT T
CLMNS | Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk D, #01-91, Singapore 417883 LA
DEALING IN 2ND Tel: 6747 7858, 6747 2343 Fax: 6742 0012 & B
E-mmil: chnoi @ singnet.com.sg
AN VEHIGALE Reg No. 206639/00K

17 January 2018

The Motor Claims Department

India lntemational Insurance Ple Lid
64 Cecil 5t #04-03

1OB Building

Singapore 04971 ]

Dear SirfMadam.

RE: ACCIDENT ON 23/12/2017 ALONG ORCHARD ROD INVOLVING YOUR INSURED'S
VEHICLE SHC 8021 B AND OUR CLIENT'S VEHICLE SJH 5404 A

AT BT
5402 e e 1

We are assisting our client, M/s Yong Lee Seng Holdings Pte Ltd, the owner of vehicle no. 5JH 5404
A in the above matter.

Please note that the above accident was caused by the driver of vehicle no, SHC 8021 B which was
insured with vou at the time of accident. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has suffered
damages and was put to loss and expenses as follows:

1) Repair cost 5§ B00.00
2) Loss of use for
3 days @S$70.00 8% 210.00

TOTAL $$1.010.00

We enclosed herewith all relevant documents for vour perusal

Hope to receive yvour reply soonest possible.
Yours faithfi

SOC LEON MGTOR WORKS

Encl.  Final repair bill/Letter of Authority
Motor Accident Report/Insurance Cert,



TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Accident on ~H/ RIF a C?.f‘r(/i;.&f ,'(ﬂ cadd
77

involviag ST L4084 4 SHE F0=2/ 4

~TWe, }é G Lee Jéfi- 2 T felnpr ST “3?“‘7‘/
3 — - z
NRIC No__ & 200 *ﬂhl?fﬁ N o =

— owner of Motor Vehicle
Registration No. i-\:frf'fﬁf.f::‘? insured by A THE Atee g

under Policy No_ LUENUL32be 47 do  herehy

('J:_.p‘- ‘T“‘t.‘ﬂ'q

authorise M/S. SOC LEON MOTOR WORKS, | Kaki Bukit Ave s Blk D 01-91, Singapore

417883 as mylour authorised Fepresentative to write, negotiate & settle claim

un
my/our behalf in mylour claim agsinst the owner/

or driver of Motor Vehicle
Registration No, SHC 803173 in respect of the abovementioned accident.

AWe also hereby authorise that the spreed settlement sum be made in favour of my/our

representative, M/S, SOC LEON MOTOR WORKS and that the said payment be
forwarded to them as full and final discharge of my/our claim.

' o &7
AWe hereby exonerate the e Y fotaith comet. / / A

and/or their insured andfor driver of

from any liability after payment of
any claim to my/our suthorised representative MJ/S. SOC LEON MOTOR WORKS.

Vehicle No. S&c Bed /5

\_,;J’z..zfp-—

D Tor. o/8
Dated: 4 -?_M - 5 Signature x

(Co's Stamp if necessary)



INDIA INTERMNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

.*" [voma
| Con M Mo IFTATOR | GST. fteg Mo M- TRIENAG-K
INTERNATIONAL 9 -
el | Ewut] Steeet | 004 | R0 | @002 | 1B Bweikling | Sngapore: 99711
INSUMNC[ L A W ] Hmanl  imsaresfin coinosg
R g Fis  TRS)OZINEETE  Website wwwiil o sg

Srrving the ragiten v |80

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

- Direct Settiement (PODS)

India Ref: MCT17120844
Claimant Ref | S JH54044

well, Soc Leon Molor Works {"the workshop”) hereby confirm that well have reached an agresment
wilh the appointed Surveyor of India Inlernational Insurance Ple Lid LKK Auto Consullants Ple Lid {name
of Surveyor) with respect to the amount daimed for 55 800.00 (repair cost), S%_180.00 {loss of
useieermr, S5 —  (search fee), vehicle no, SJHS404A a1 was damaged pursuant fo the accident which occurmed
on 230122017 (date) at ORCHARD ROAD (lacatian) involving vehicls no. SHCBOZ1B (nsured
wehicle). This s pursuant 1o fhe inspection conducted on _12M0172018  (date) a1 "ihe workshop”

Well confm that well are/am authorized by the owner  YONG LEE SENG HOLDINGS PTE LTD  ("the third party
claimanr’) of vehice nob. SJHE404A 10 make the claim a5 set oul i the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle
thia matter on hisfer behall in a manner thal wedl deem . We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third
party claimand”.

Wil further confirm thal we/l will indemnify India Intemational Inswrance Ple Lid for all damages, loss andlor expense that
they will or have aiready incurred in Ihe evenl thal “the thid party claimant” after the above said agreemenl lodges a
fuitheer claum againat the iormen W any juss and expenses sufiered pertaining to cost of repaire andlor rental and/or loss
of use pursyant to the damage 1o SJHS404A (vehicle no) as @ result of the accident.

Wil confirm that the agreement reached above (5 in full and final settement of all claims of "the third party claimant”
pursuant 1o Ing accident and thal further this seltiemant ks reached on a without prejudice and without admission of fiability
basis.

This agreement is- subject 10 the appllcation of Singapore law and the Singapore Courls have exclusive jurisdiction over any
digpute arising out of the same.

We/l suthorize you lopay thetotal amountof S8 980.00 1o SOC LEON MOTOR WORKS

iy .
Dated this /7. day of PO O

CLAIMANT: i R A o% WS, \j“* P J; C
_ 80C LEON MOTOR WORKS LGS

Siagedby e workshap (W ehen) | B Sigred by appoinied Surveyor
Name: e st H/ Name: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
NRIC. - NRIC 189607198R
Address: Address; Bk 21, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
Nationality: e —— Nationaiity e

Ocoupation: Oeccupation: =




— € R

INSURANCE AGENT,
AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
CLAIMS 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk D, #01-91, Singapore 417883
DEALING 1M 2D Tel: 6747 7458, 6747 2343 Fax: 6742 0012
Eemail: slmoi @ singnet.com.sg

HAND VEHIGLE Reg MNo. 206639/00K

M/S YONG LEE SENG HOLDINGS PTE LTD DATE: 17/01/2018

DOA: 23122017

INVOICE NO : 7988

REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJH 5404 A(SUBARU IMPREZA)

LUMP SUM AT COST OF REPAIRS 5 B00.00

_ \
o R oo
wUC LEON|MOTOR WORKS

Ad

Authioricad .5';,' ‘”uu_-

o hbemy PR B

Ew BERF

Bl mE-as i

o o Tt R



Merimen e-Claims

Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlament

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING _ R |

I Case Notified | Est Submitted | Ad) Assagned | Adj Aot Adj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed SEAtUs |
oy | 15 70 2018 ' iég:?n" s $$800.00 $$800,00 | Panding fov Survey

B | ma:g[ el Ady gt | Egie Estimates | | view Rot | l cancel ke |

Reference

Claim Details

.:Ecu:_l_uTh',r adjuster]

Note No.:

nsured: | COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 199303821F

e 4. | YONG LEE SENG HOLDINGS PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 200706236N

|Vehicie Reg. | 123/12/2017 19:00 - :59

if!n_'; e Date of Loss: 1313 Months and 10 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)] |
(Claim Type: | TP / MCT17120844 Poliey/Cover | \ucomnors

SHCBOZ18

Policy Ma.
{Claimant }:

Encess:

| 5068483255-03CLASSIC

Handling
Insurer:

India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ...

IHandim:l by Zuhaidah Bte Samsurl - 6347 6070]

Claimant's
Insures:

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd [HQ) - Tel:

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

| LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3361 ..

[Handled by MARCUS CHUA] ...

[Final Rpt due 23/01/2018] |

view All | Compose Case Mail |

[+ TI_SG | 11/05/2018): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved [ssnn.uu} - SIH5404A - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte...
- T_5G {23/01/2018): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$0.00) - SJH54044 - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte §... |
'« T_SG (17/01/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SJH54044 - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri |

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=

| DueDate Priority Type
| Mo results.

L o

Task Group

Subject

View All | Search Tasks |

Create New Task | Complete |

Handler

Assigned By

Completed On

Created On Done?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_.

24/5/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*SIHS5404A (MCT17120844)
[SHC8021B]
TP
YONG LEE SENG HOLDINGS PTE LTD
Dec 23 2017 7:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Soc Leon Motor Works
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico regno 15ss07128R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel B256-3581 Fax: B844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/1111B000784/UUAZO2
Date: 241052018
REFEREMNCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Ple Ltd ~ Policy No; MCOMOD15
Claimant Vehicle 5154048 Insured Vehicle No: SHCB021B
Date of Loss: 23na2romy Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT17120844
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJH5404A
Make & Model, SUBARU IMPREZA 5D, 1.5 R AWD (A) Engine No: EL15D319675
Reg. Date: 13/08/2008 (Man. Year; 2008) Chassis No: JF1GH3KS58G011355
Colour: Black Cdometer. 156655 km
Engine Capacity: 1488 cc
Market Value/New Car Prica: N/A
Sum Insured {S5):; Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITI F T
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabls): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/60 R15 Rear Tyre Size; 195/80 R15
Front Lefl Side: Crucero 6 mm Rear Left Side: Crucero & mm
Front Right Side: Crucero 6 mm Rear Right Side: Crucero 6 mm
The above values reprosent (e remaming lyre treads depth
COSTOFCLAMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference Diff %)
Pars 956.80 420.80 536.00 56.02
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 750.00 610.00 140.00 18.67
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 1,706.80 1,030.80 676.00 39.61
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 800.00
Nett Amount (55) 1,706.80 800.00 206.80 53.13
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x 5560.00/day) (55) 180.00
Nett Liability (S$) 980.00

INSPECTION
Date of Assignment:
Date Inspected:

Estimated Period of Repair.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_...

12/01/2018
12/01/2018 Inspected At

3.0 days

Soc Leon Motor Works (Kaki Bukit)

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6,#01-91, AutoBay@ Kaki
Bukit

Singapore 417883
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: THIN THIN HLAING

NOTE: This repart represents our findings af the lime and place of inspection sfated herein, Such inspection has been camed oul fo the bast of our
knowisdpe and abiity bul any ofher Sabiity Under sny cther circumsiances is hareby sxprassly axclided
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Lasl Synchronised: 03 May 2018)

Parts: 143 SUBARU IMPREZA 5D 1.5 R AWD (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominaled Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitied, no prini-code for SJH54044)

Validity:

Page 3 of 4

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: llemsivalues nol in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT FENDER (LH) Dented / Buckled 280.00FL *290.00 FL
2 1 *FENDER INNERSHIELD Tom 135.00 FL *135.00 FL
3 10 *CLIPS MNecessary 38.00FL “38.00FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER Repair 670.00FL *-FL
5 1 *BUMPER SIDE RETAINER (LH) Bent 26.00 FL *25.00FL
6 10 *BUMPER CLIPS MNecessary 38.00FL *38.00FL
FeFranchise part. L=Listhemiisc
Sub Total (S$) 1,196.00 526.00
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S3) 239.20 105.20
Total Parts (S$) 956.80 420.80
Report was unsubmitted :Eun'ilg_this print-out.
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Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous toms selected.
Recommended Labour
No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 LABOUR CHARGES FOR KNOCKING & REPLACING PARTS Mew 350.00 250.00
2 SPRAYPAINTING Mew 400,00 380.00

Gross Labour Cost (S5) 750,00 610.00

Repart was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES =
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