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VL LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
adm B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park_ Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315

Rog. No 188607108R GST Reg. No. 18-9607168-R

Affiflatad 1o Federation Internationaie Des Experts En Automobile

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD Ref CC3/AIG13000383/Kkal-1
78 SHENTON WAY #08-16 ”"HIIII“”“IIH"I
CHARTIS BUILDING Date 12-01-2018
SINGAPORE 079120
Code : AIG
1= Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SKG 35321 Veh. Inspected SHB 8882G
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 12/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.Cc D
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Makea Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Dlmgn
5. Gaeneral Information
Accident Date  31/08/2012 llnupuctlon Date 21112012

Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTELTD

58 DEFU LANE 1
SINGAPORE 5358488

5a. Remarks

AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BiIN ACCORDANGCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD A 7 Ao, Arte” KOEL

NO.58 DEFU LANE 1 SINGAPORE 539498
TEL NO.6287 6666 FAX NO.6281 1400

y
CO/GST REG NO.201019626G ,ZLL.),._@
SHB9882G - TOKIO L 795.20
Vehicle No.: SHB 9882G - ROEL
Chassis No.: LXS12-00018981"
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: CROWN TAXI
Date of Accident : 31.08.2012
Third Party Insurer : TOKIO
PART LIST
1 1 Front Fender RH $ 7 73283 4
2 1 Front Door RH $ A 985.17 /
3 Front Door Side Mirror $ J~ 47581 4
$ 2,193.81
25% $ 548.45
TOTAL § 1,645.36
Specical Nett
1 Front Door Sticker 'TRANS-CAB' $ 4 60.00 X
TOTAL $§ 60.00
TOTAL PARTS § 1,705.36
Panel Beating, Knocking And Straightening
The Necessary Portion, Remove And
Renewal Of Parts, Adjust And Realign The
Same $ 500.00 /det
To Rust-Proofing Of The Affected Areas. 8 A- 4+ 200.00 X
To Check Electrical Lighting Cancerned. $ 100.00 734
Putty And Spray Painting Of The Affected
Portion. $ 360.00 Zog

To Remove And Refit Interior Fittings,
Trimings, Garnish, Fittings And Other, To
Enable repair. $

v 250.00 X



TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD ROEL
NO .58 DEFU LANE 1 SINGAPORE 539498

TEL NO.6287 6666 FAX NO.6281 1400

CO/GST REG NO.201019626G

5HB9882G - TOKIO

TOTAL § 1,410.00

Over All Total § 3,115.36

Total Repair Days D2 Days
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Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Our Ref © AAD1209-008
Your Ref . SKG3532U

Date . 15.December 2017
CHARTIS

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB9882G AND SKG3532U ON 31-08-12 07:50 PM ALONG
Orchard Road

It appears that the above accident was caused by your insured's negligence. We, therefore
seeking compensation from you for our financial loss as itemized below :-

1 Cost of Repair (inclusive of 7% GST) 1 42265

z Loss of Rental for _4_days @ $.8/-22 per day $ 32528

3 Loss of Income for _¥__ days @ $.192 _ per day $ 400.00

4, LTA Search Fee % 6.00

5. Survey Fee 5 0.00
Total 5 115393

We enclose a copy of the following documents for your consideration :-

GIA report lodged by our driver Rental rate and mileage records

Certificate of Insurance Authorization To Act

Original final repair bill LTA Search Fee

Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 14 days, failing which we shall
proceed to hand over the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further
reference to you.

Yours Faithfully

Trans:Cab Services Pte Ltd
HlAS3

4 A% o/
-13' 3____",.‘
Jasmine Tan
General Manager

Tel No. : 6603 1250 (DID)
Note : Please email any further correspondence 1o claims@transcab.com.sg (6603 1259)



Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 24 March 2018 59 PM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto); "Ng Wal Yin', claims@transcab.comsg

Ce: Mel Kwan [LKKAuto), Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident involving SKG3532U & SHB9BB2G on
31.08.12 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG13000383/Kka3-1

Follow Up Flag: Fallow up

Flag Status: Flaoged

Without Prejudice
Dear Zaini

Please procesd to send us the OV

Thank you
Best Regards
lasmine Tan
TRA NS # TRANS-C AB SERVICES PTE LTD
2 No. 2 Ang Ma Kic Street 43 Singapore 569111
—~Cap & Malin Line :(65] 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6257 1330

Drect Line (465) 6603 1250
Website: www.tanscab.comasg

From: Zaini [LKK Auto) [mailto:Zaini@Ikkauto.com|

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 3:32 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <walyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; "Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>;
claims@transcab.com.sg

Ce: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto,.com>: Hsiao Tong {LKKAuto] <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident involving SKG3532U & SHB9882G on 31.08.12 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG13000383/Kka3-1

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: AAD1209-008
Our Ref: CC3/A1G13000383/Kka3-1

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 3532U & SHB 9882G ON 31/08/2012
We refer to the above matter

For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at 55340.00 (all in)



Kindly confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely an a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liabilityfdamages, either party is not bound, therealter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Bait Regords
Laoinl Kutoinl | Coss honcisr
LEK Aulo Comultants Fle Lid
$321-2132 | ot Zoinililkkento com | fox 6741-4108

o 31 Py auo Sl kicl Pabc Ukl Avediue | #0225 | SidB873)

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 9:16 AM

To: Ng Wal Yin <walin.ng@transcab.com sg>

Ce: Jasmine Tan' <lasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims @transcab.com,sg: Admin A <admin-a@kkauto com>; CS A
Team <c-a@ kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident involving 5KG3532U & SHB9882G on 31.08.12 *** LKK REF-
CC3/AIG13000383/Kka3-1

Dear Wai Yin,
We refer to the below screenshot.

Please send us the photo provided by MS Goldbell Car Rental Pte Ltd.



Transfer Fee Enquiry Page 1 of ]

Enquire Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details

Vehicia No SHBOAR2G
Vehicle Type H10 - Public Transpan Taxi (Motar Car)
Vehicls Attachmeni 1 Air-Con [Taxi)
Wehicke Scheme Tam (Company)
Vahicie Make TOYOTA
Vehicle Modael CROWN TAXI
Chasss No. LXS120018981
Propeiant Diesal

Engine No. SL5588121
Engine Capacity - 2086 cc
Maximum Laden

Weight.

Unladen Weight

Yeor Of Manulaclure 2005
Lifesgan Expiry Date 18 May 2013

COE Category A - Car (1600cc & below)
Quata Premium $14.4581 00
COE Expry Date : 18 May 2013

Foad Tax Expiry Dale © 18 May 2013

EJ:E:FEMEW 18 May 2013

Inspection Due Date 16 May 2013
m“rm 21 Nov 2012

Late renewal loa(s) will be imposed # road tax / lay up has expwed. Please use Engure Road Tax Pavablg for fee(s) payabie.

Road tas. Over P I {if @any), of & vehicle will lofiow the vehicle o the new ownar when s
i including EyTTHEn registored oanErEnp

Amount Payable
Amount Before GST G5T Amount Amount Aler GST
is8) I58) 58)
Transier Fes 11.00 - 11.00
Total Ju?unl 11.00
Message

Na turther renawal of COE s sliowed for inis vehice The vohicle must ba de-registered at the end of COE expiry
You may prni this page for reference

(oK | [ Print |

Land Transpor Rﬁulhuiw

Plaase read through the Prvecy Stalemen!. Conditions of Use and Disclaimer.
Flaass do not use tha Back or Forwerd butiong on browsar aa this may aher Ihe reulls of I ransachions.
wnl yowwane wieh oF d O and pbown BO0 ¥ GO0 iesolitan

Copynghi © 2008 LTA | Prusey Esismgnt | Consaony of Usg | Piasigunes

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/Ita/vri/action/enquire TransferFeeDetailsProxy?FU... 21/11/2012
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Roel AA6 1109-00§

From: Foo Zhl Rong [FooZhiRongfgber.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 1 February, 2013 10:08 AM

To: roel.c@transcabservices.com.sg

Ce: jasminetan@transcabsanvicas.com.sg; Foo Zhi Rong
Subject: Accident involving SHB9882G & SKG3532U on 31/0812

Dear Roel,
It was my pleasure talking to you earlier.

As spoken, there are several errors in the documentation which you sent to Tokio Marine.

1. SKG3532U is insured under Chartis.
2. Period of Insurance cover s inaccurate,
3. The detalls in the document Authorization to Act is inaccurate.

| noticed that the vehicle was only sent in for repairs on 20/11/12 @ 1450hrs even though
the accident happened on 31/08/12.

Attached are some photos which my customer took at the point of accident.

| will llke to propose to you that each party takes care of their own damage and other
miscellanous cost as this would likely be a 50-50 case.

Please feel free to contact me should there be any enquiries.

Thank you and regards,

Foo Zhi Rong

Operations Execulive

Goldbell Car Rental Pte Ltd

Tel: +65 6838 6300

DID: +65 6603 8398

Fax: +B5 6733 1063

Mobile: +65 9873 2027

Website: www.gbcr.com.sg

10,000 Leasing Clients Served. And Counting.

CONFIDENTIALITY HOTICE: The informallon contained bn this elecironic massage i and eanfideniial infarmation inlendied only for the
usa of tha indhvidual enlty or entiles named as reciplent of recipients. If the reader s nol the reciplent, be haraby nalified thal any
disseming! on, distribution or copy of this communication is sticily probibited. If you hove recaived this communicailon In etror, please notify mse
immedialaly by sleclanis mail ar by telephons snd penmaneniy delie (ks message kom your compuler syslem. Thank you.

1/2/2013



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 January, 2018 4:38 PM

To: Kesaval, Jaclyn-M

= CS A Team, Admin A

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident involving SKG3532U & SHB988.2G on

31.08.12 *** LKK REF: CC3/TMI13000383/Kyln - Our Ref. B00639247A

Categories: HMK

Dear Jaclyn,
We refer to the above matter.
We will check and revert to you in due course.

As spoken, kindly assist to check status for BIEIRIM

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiBwan@ lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408033)

From: Kesaval, Jaclyn-M [maiito:Jaclyn-M.Kesaval@aig.com]

Sent: Friday, 5 January, 2018 11:54 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: €S A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident involving SKG3532U & SHB9882G on 31.08.12 *** LKK REF:
CC3/TMI13000383/Kyln - Our Ref: BOD639247A

Hi Mei Kwan,
We refer to your emall below.
Please check if taxi has evidence, as both parties have conflicting reports.

Thank you.

Jaclyn M K

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacilic Insurance Ple. Lid
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapora{078120)

Tel +(65) 6418 1953 | Fax +|65) 6835 7416

Jaclyn-M. Kesaval@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE



Dear¥ian Chuan/ Bennie,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we received LOD from M/s Trans-cab and they would like to submit TP claim against
SKG35320L.

FYl, we had survey TP taxi on 21.11.2012 and submit our survey report to M/s Tokio Marine.
Please refer to the enclosed supporting documents.,

Kindly let us have your further instruction please.

Thank vou.

Best Hegards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@[kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Btk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenuoe 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Ng Wal Yin [mallto:waivin.ng@transcab.com.

Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 1:50 PM

To: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; C5 A
Team <cs-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1209-008—-Accident involving SKG3532U & SHB9882G on 31.08.12 *** LKK REF:
CC3/TMI13000383/Ky1n

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Mei Kwan

We enclosed the e-mail with tokio marine office for your attention and please refer to the attachment letter show
that SKG 3532U is insured under Chartis.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wal Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab com.sg

mA N rd TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
i! No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 43, Singapore 569111

/.-‘ca Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fox Line: [55) 6287 7764
Website: www _transcab.com sg
This messaga s confidential, It may alse be privileged or otherwise pratected by work product immunity or other legal rules. It

you have recerved it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail repily and dalete It from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose |ts contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-majls are not screened
for responsa deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Intermet.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikw lkkau
Sent: Tuesday, December 19, 2017 11:18 AM



IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the Intended recipient, you must

not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emall in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply” command and permanently delete the ariginal and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
respansibility Is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or

severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



Mei Kwan tLHKAutnz

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Friday, 5 January, 2018 4:40 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin; ‘Zhe Wei'

Cc ‘Jasmine Tan'; claims@transcab.com.sg; Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident involving SKG3532U & SHB9882G on
310812 *** LKK REF: CC3/TMI13000383/Kyln

Categories: HME

Dear Wal Yin,

As spoken, please provide us evidence to support your claim and update us status on Bl claim.

Thank you.

Best Regands,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | emall: MeiRwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | S(408933)

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 2:31 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg=>

Ce: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A
Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident invalving SKG3532U & SHB9882G on 31.08.12 *** LKK REF:
CC3/TMI13000383/Kyln

Dizar Wai Yin

We refer to your below email and the contents were duly noted.

We will gheck and revert 1o you

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Med Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.cam | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Pava Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin [mallto:waiyin.ng@transcab.co

Sant: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 1:50 PM

To: Mei Kwan [LEKAuto) <Melkwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; CS A

Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident involving 5KG3532U & SHB9882G on 31.08.12 *** LKK REF:

CC3/TMI13000383/Kyln

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



We are making a claim against the owner of SKG 35320,
Enclosed is our GIA report and LOD for your perusal and action.
Original hard copy will mailed to you by post.

Kindly let us know the status of our claim settlement.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*#* plagse be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
RAggg ﬁ No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Sireet 43, Singapore 569111
—— Main Line: |&5) 4287 &&46 Fax Line: [45) 4287 7744
i! Website: www fronscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product imimunity or other legal rules. [f
ol have received it by mistake, please jet us know by e=mail reply and delete |t from your system; you miay not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone, Pleass send us by fax any massage containing deadlines as incoming e-rmalls are not scresned
far response deadlines. The Integrity and security af this message cannot ba guaranteed on the [nternat,
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SLABEAVE |, #801-35 PAYA URDINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPUKRE 08033 TEL @ (065) BISRASH] FANX © (0635 07414108

Qur Rel: COI/AIGIINONIRI Kknd-1
12 FEBRUARY 218

GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL PTE LLTD
14 BENOI ROAD

SINGAPORE 629887

ATTN: HR ' MANAGEMEN

Dear Sir'Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 33321 AND SHB 9882G ON 31.08.2012

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or vour authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed 1o negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant,

IT you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.c. by 23/02/2018, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Zaini _r.'.fr.
ase Handler
T 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: Zaini@lkkauto.com

e AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Authorization To Act

We, Trans-cab Services Pte Ltd of Company Registration No. 200303878K hereby authorize
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd to act on behalf to claim for all losses incurred for the
accident involving SHB9882G and SKG3532U along Orchard Road on 31-08-12 07:50 PM.

In addition, we also hereby authorize the above payment to be made in favour of Trans-cab
Auto Services Pte Ltd upon settlement.

Dated this 15 (day) of December 2017

Yours Faithfully
Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd
=8,
i Al I.'
“rfj{;}
Jasmine Tan
General Manager



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Partv Claim)

“We/l, TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™i hercby confirm that we/l
have refched an agreement mlh the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurunce Pre Lid
RE ALTO CONSULTA® ) inume of survevor) with respect to the amount ¢laimed
for 88 242 .99 (Global Sum) for vehicle no, 228 FEE 2 that was damaged pursuant to the
uccident Which occurred on 3/ 0% 29 “(dite) glong _OLCHAKL FOAL

involving vehicle nofs SG 358201

This is pursuant 1 the inspection conducted on &0 11222 (date) ar “the workshap™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am outhorized by the owner TRANS-C VICES PTE LTD
("the third party claimant™) of vehicle no, SRSTE5 5T pape the claim as set out in the sbove
paragraph and we/l have full authomy to settle the mater on his/her behalf in o manner that we/l
deem 1it. We/l enclose herein the letter of suthority given by “the third party claimam™

W/l turther confirm that we/l will indeminify AIG Asia Pacific Insurunce Pre Lid for all dumages,
loss and/or expense thut they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimanmt™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for uny loss and
expenses sulfered pcrt..unlmz o costs of repairs and/or rental andfor loss of use pursuant to the
damuge to ZHE 1822 (yehicle no.i us a result of the sccident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any elaim of “the
thied party claimant™ pursuant 1o the secident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of Hability busis

Tis ngreement s subject 1o the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Counts have

exclusive jurisdicnion over any dispute ansing out of the same

Dated this ___ 21  (day) of _Viere tmonth) 20° % (veur)

’
R, S

Signed by appointed survevor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)



Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111

Tel: &257 666
Fax: 6287 7764
Co. Reg. No.: 201019626G
G5T Reg. No.:  201019626G

Tax Invoice / Debit Note

TO:

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD

INVOICE NO.  : [NV1712-010

78 Shenton Way DATE : 15 December 2017
#07-16 CHARTIS Building REFERENCE NO : AAD1209-008
079120 Singapare TERMS : Met 30 Days
DUE DATE ; 14 January 2018
ATTENTION PAGE B
NO. CODE DESCRIPTION QTY  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1 6050101 Repair Cost (Lump sum)SHB9882G DOA:31 0812 1 42285 427 65
Total S5GD Excl. GST : 395.00
7% GST 27 65
*=** FOUR HUNDRED TWENTY TWO AND SIXTY FIVE SGD ONLY *=** Total SGD Incl. GST : 422.65

1} All cheques should be crossed and made payable o™ Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Lid”

2} Please quaote air Involce Number during payment
31 We reserve the right 1o charge interest @ 1 5% per month on overdue invaice

4) Any dispute as to the accuracy, charges etc of this invoice must be communicated within 10 days from the date hereof failing which it shall be

deamed 1o have bean gnoonditionally accepted

THIS IS & COMPUTER GENERATED INVOICE WHICH REQUIRES NO SIGNATURE




TRANS & EAa AR B3]

~—C@) TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD P

21. November 2012

To Whom It May Concern

Dear Sir / Madam,
Accident on 31/08/12 07:50 PM at Orchard Road

1. We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Trans-Cab Services Pte Lid Is
the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration no. SHB9882G. The taxi was hired
to LEE KUM THONG a registered hirer-operator of Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd at the time of
occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $81,32 per day (inclusive of GST).

2. Please be advised that the Taxi is insured with First Capital Insurance Ltd on a third party basis
at the material time of the accident,

" 3. Please liaise with us directly far any settlemenl of claims in respect of the said accident.

Yours faithfully,

Jasmine Tan
General Manager

This is a computer generated print-out. No signature is required.

Mo. 58 Defu Lane 1, Singapore 538498
Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6281 1400
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Preview Page 1 of 1

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)

| Vehicle No: SKG3532U (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA CROWN 3.0 (M)
SHBY9B82G (TP veh)
[Date of Accident: |31/08/2012

Global Sum Settiement | | [X] Yes [ 1 1 Mo
Repair Estimate 3,333.44
Final Repair Cost 340.00
Loss of Use

Rental (if any)

LTA / GlA Search Fee
Others:

2.00 days at $50.00 per day
2 days

AL A AL AR A L

Final Settiement Sum (Global Sum) 340.00
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [ X] NO (Kindlyindicate

below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 50 {56)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: PP
BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability fo be filed only for chain callisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply
Remarks

Paymant Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Trans-cab Aulo Sarvices Pia Lid i1 340.00
2) 5
3) i
27 Mar
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill {if any)

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 27/3/2018



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg no 1essor1eer)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tell 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@ikkaulo.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC3/AIG13000383/KKA30Q2-1
Date: 2710372018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, Policy No: 09858986155
Fraimant Vehicle s1ipgssaG Insured Vehicle No:  SKG3532U
Dale of Loss 31/082012 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: 800630247
N&ID
Reg No: SHB9882G
Make & Model: TOYOTA CROWN, 3.0 (M) Engine No: 5L5588121
Reg. Date: 20/05/2005 (Man, Year: 2005) Chassis No: LXS120018981
Colour RedM\hite Odometer; 370223 km
Engine Capacity: 2986 cc
Marke! Value/New Car Price: NiA
Sum Insured [SS): Market Valus/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceabla): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Frant Tyre Size 175/80 R14 Rear Tyre Size: 175/80 R14
Front Left Side: Wes! Lake 1 mm Rear Left Side: West Lake 3 mm
Front Right Sida: Wesl Lake 1 mm Rear Right Side: West Lake 3 mm
Tha above valyes rpresent the rmaining hyre reads depih
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Paris 1,705.36 0.00 1,705.36 100.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,410.00 395.00 1,015.00 71.89
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S58) 3.115.36 385.00 2,720.36 87.32
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5) 218.08 27.65 180.43 a7.32
Nett Amount (S§) 3,333.44 42265 2,910.79 87.32
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x S550.00/day) (S$5) 100.00
+ Car Rental (2.0 x 5581.32/day) (S5) 16264
5%) B685.20
Liable Amount (50.00%) (5%) 342,65
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 340.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 21112012
Dale Inspected: 211172012  Inspected AL Trans-cab Auto Services Pie Lid
Mo 2 Ang Mo Kio Streel 63
Singapore 568111

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 27/3/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Period of Repair 1.0 days

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Zaini Bin Kusaini

NOTE This report represents our findings af the ime and place of inspection shaled herein Such inspecion has been camed out fo the best of our
knowiedpe and abitly but any oftvar dabilty under any ather circumstances s hereby expressly axchided

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 27/3/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT FENDER RH Repair 732 B3FL *.FL
2 1 *FRONT DOOR RH Repair 985 17FL *“FL
3 1 *FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR Seivbeable 47581 FL *-FL
4 1 *FRONT DOOR STICKER TRANS-CAB Not Necessary B0.00FS “FS
F=Franchise par. S=Spchett LeListhamDisc
Sub Total (S§) 2,253.81 0.00
- List ltem Discount on L Items 25.00/25.00% (S$) 548 45 0.00
Total Parts (S5) 1,705.36 0.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 27/3/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Items
1 PANEL BEATING ,KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE MNew S00.00 180.00

NECESSARY PORTION,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF

PARTS ,ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.
2 TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS New 200.00 0.00
3 TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED New 100.00 15.00
4 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTION New 360.00 200.00
5 TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR MNew 250,00 0.00

FITTINGS, TRIMINGS, GARNISH,FITTINGS AND OTHER ,TO

ENABLE REPAIR

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,410.00 395.00
[ Reporl was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >

hitps://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 27/3/2018



