Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 24 March 2018 6:59 PM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto); 'Ng Wai Yin'; claims@transcab.com.sg

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident involving SKG3532U & SHB9882G on

31.08.12 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG13000383/Kka3-1

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Without Prejudice
Dear Zaini

Please proceed to send us the DV.

Thank you
Best Regards
Jasmine Tan

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

ﬁcag Main Line :(65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6257 1330
Direct Line :(65) 6603 1250
Website: www.transcab.com.sg

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) [mailto:Zaini@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 3:32 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>;
claims@transcab.com.sg

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident involving SKG3532U & SHB9882G on 31.08.12 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AlG13000383/Kka3-1

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: AAD1209-008
Our Ref: CC3/A1G13000383/Kka3-1

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 3532U & SHB 9882G ON 31/08/2012
We refer to the above matter

For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at $$340.00 (all in)

1



Kindly confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 9:16 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; CS A
Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1209-008--Accident involving SKG3532U & SHB9882G on 31.08.12 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G13000383/Kka3-1

Dear Wai Yin,
We refer to the below screenshot.

Please send us the photo provided by MS Goldbell Car Rental Pte Ltd.



