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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 February, 2020 5:47 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Cc: Admin A; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Naz (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SHB 9981D Height Measurement Case - 6216126103SG - LKK REF 

CC3/AIG18000691/Kha3

Attachments: HEIGHT MEASUREMENT REPORT.PDF; RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJX 3357G ON 

07.01.2018 / SHB 9981D - LKK REF CC3/AIG18000691/Kha3

Dear Bennie, 

 

We refer further to our below email. 

 

Please be informed that till date, since January 20, we have not received any feedback from the Insured with regards 

to our email sent out to him. 

 

Kindly advise if we can proceed to do the settlement. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
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From: Vic (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 20 January, 2020 10:10 AM 

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Naz (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: SHB 9981D Height Measurement Case - 6216126103SG - LKK REF CC3/AIG18000691/Kha3 

 
Dear Bennie, 

 

We refer to the below email. 

 

Please find attached copy of the Height Measurement Report as requested. 

 

As also discussed on 17/01/2020, we will inform Insured of the outcome. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 30 December, 2019 9:32 AM 

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ; Naz (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team 

Subject: RE: SHB 9981D Height Measurement Case - 6216126103SG 

 
Dear Naz 
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Please provide your findings pertaining to the height measurement.  
 

Best Regards, 

Bryan Ang  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>  

Sent: Sunday, 29 December 2019 5:26 PM 

To: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) 

<bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SHB 9981D Height Measurement Case - 6216126103SG 

 
Hi All 

 

 

I am following up on this case. 

 

Any updates on the status / developments to this matter. 

 

 

Best Regards 

 
Bennie Tan 
AIG 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd  
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1718 

 

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg 

 

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ  

Sent: Saturday, November 30, 2019 6:20 PM 

To: Naz (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: SHB 9981D Height Measurement Case - 6216126103SG 

 
Hi All 

 

 

Any updates on this case. 

 

 

Best Regards 

 
Bennie Tan 
AIG 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd  
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1718 

 

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
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From: Naz (LKKAuto) [mailto:Naz@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, August 05, 2019 6:10 PM 
To: Tan, Bennie-WZ 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: SHB 9981D Height Measurement Case - 6216126103SG 

 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Mr Tan, 

 

I have completed the Height Measurement Report and forwarded it to my senior for 

review. I will email it to you once he has gone through it. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Naz| Technical Investigator 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 


