Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 April, 2019 9:11 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020327 Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - SGE2583L

[External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vivian,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Teu_r;_ES} 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

ey The all { Mew ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only,

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 5 April, 2019 3:36 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020327 RE: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - SGE2583L

Your ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020327
LKK ref : CC4/LPC18000686/Kwa3

Hi Lili,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 16 January 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a head-to-rear collision.. BOLA 27 Liability is 100%

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Amouni | Revised Amount

|. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $4922 56 ¥ 3,477.50
2. Loss of Income (§ 100.00 x 8days) $ 800.00 $ 800.00($100.00 x 8days ) (Tuition Car)
GlA SEACH $ 8.00 5 8.00

Total | $5,730.56 S 4,285.50




**(7 days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 10:50 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
<Joylrene @lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020327 RE: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - SGE2583L

Hi Mei Kwan
Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 8:50 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; ONG LI LI; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto): Admin A
Subject: RE: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - SGE2583L

Your ref: TBA
LKK ref: CC4/LPC18000686/Kwa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear 5ir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.



To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 oos5 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 January, 2018 1:16 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - SGE2583L

Dear Mr Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 10 January, 2018 10:32 AM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com
Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: FW: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - SGE2583L

Dear Catherine,
Kindly proceed to conduct a survey accordingly.

Our insured has yet to lodge a report and we are making enquiries.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June) [mailto:chmotor@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 10 January, 2018 10:25 AM

To: MT_Claim_5SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - SGE2583L

Dear Sir,



OUR CLIENT - SGE2583L
DOA - mailto:6/1/2018@ 12.03PM
YR INSURED : SJK4937U (HOW SIN CHEONG)

Kindly provide us of your surveyor listing for the selection on the survey.
Thank you.

Regards

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 1019 Yishun Ind Park A
01-374, Singapore 768761
Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719



(71 | CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD

\‘ E 1 / ’—?‘;i | Bk 1019, Yishun Industrial Park A, #01-374/382, Singapore 768761
) 4*___J Tel : 67556142 Fax : 67557719
Email: chmotor(@singnet.com.sg

Date:

Lonpac Insurance Berhad

C/0O LKK Auto Consultants

Afttn : THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
Dear Sir/ Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. SGE2583L & SJK4937U ON 09/01/2018
TAMPINES AVE 10.

We are authorized by SGE2583L for their above matter.

Record reveals that you are the insurer of SJK4937U. We therefore wish to seek
compensation from you as below:-

1. Cost of Repairs 58 3477.50
2. Loss of Income (Tuition car) S5 800.00
3. Hire of Vehicle S5 0.00
4. LTA Search Fee/GIA Reports S5 8.00

TOTAL S% 4285.50

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.
Thank you.

Yours faithfully

J g




Re:

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

SGE2583L

Motor Insurance Claim B

in respect of the traffic accident on 9/1/2018

at/along Tampines Ave 10

I/We, Amir Khan s/o Sher Khan

NRIC 51198474F of Blk 192 Pasir Ris Street 12 #02-02

Singapore 510192

owner of motor vehicle SGE2583L , insured by NTUC Income Insurance

Co-operative Ltd under policy no. 2048645231-06

hereby authorise M/s CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD on Blk 1019 Yishun
Industrial Park A #01-374 Singapore 768761, to act as my/our representative in

my/our claim against the owner /driver of motor vehicle SJK4937U in respect

of the above-mentioned accident.

I/We further authorise that any payment due to me/us from the aforesaid claim is to be

directed to my/our abovenamed representative.

And 1/We hereby indemnify my/our abovenamed representative against any claim

and/or damage which may arise from any action taken on my/our behalf.

[/We affirm all the above by my/our signature below.

Signed : | AmiR
Date : 9/1/2018




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

2

CLAIM NO : 17/18/18/VP0O5/020327
DATE : 15 April 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, AMIR KHAN 5/0 SHER KHAN confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of SIK 4937U the sum of Singapore Dollar Four
Thousand ~ Two  Hundred  Eighty- Five and Cemts  Fifty Only
(54.285.50 ) in full and final satisfaction. liquidation and discharge of all property
losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in
respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become
manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving SGE 2583L
& SJK 4937U on 09 January 2018 along Tampines Ave 10

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/HOW SIN CHEONG) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by
any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to CHENG HOE
MOTOR PTE LTD

[/'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

............................................

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

Amir Khan s/o
Sher Khan

Name of vehicle owner /Date

Viviawn



Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

BIk 100%, Yishun Industrial Park A #01-374/382, Singapore 768761

TEL: 67556142 (YIS) FAX: 67557719 (Y15} Email: chmotori@ singnet_com.sg

GET:201001158E  RCB NO:201001158E

TOYOTA VIOS 1.5E A

PAGE:|
Amount

53
S5 3,250.00

TAX INVOICE
M/S LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD
300 BEACH ROAD NO: CLE180831
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE Date: 01 Aug 2018
SINGAPORE 199555 Policy No: 504R8645231-06
TEL: 62507388 FAX: 62063767 Veh Reg No: SGE2583L
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model:
WS Ref: TP-LONPAC Job No: JC1597987
Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date:  09/01/2018
TP Veh Reg No: SJK4937U
Deseription | Quantity| List Price
53
To Supply all replaced parts, all necessary and agreed labour & | FC 5% 3,250.00
miscellancous charges.
(As recommended by your appointed surveyor)
Total

Add GST @ 7%
Total Amount payable

For Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

¥
4
|
-\.-|.I.
' F |
'\i"-- '..'-.Ifn /
3ATFAL_

E. && O.E, AUTHORISED SIGNATURE

5% 3,250.00
227.50
5% 3,477.50



[~ A.C.SYED & PARTNERS

ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS
COMMISSIONER FOR OATHS

101A UPPER CROSS STREET, #13.23 PEOPLE'S PARK CENTRE, SINGAPORE 058358

TEL : 6538 7411 & FAX : 6534 1011 Bosz/>018
TO : CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD BILL NO: -BOasr20te
YQUR REF:
[OUR REF : ACS.CH.LTA.2018 (JULY 2018) [DATE : 3/8/18

entrusted to us inclusive of 2l advica.

70 OUR PROFESSIONAL CHARGES for acting for you In the above matter including where necessary arusals,
|attendance preparation examination of documents relating thereta! correspondence, attandance, perusals, 1alephone
salls. saarenaz and all other incidental works nat specifically mentioned herein to enable s 1o ¢arry oul the work

Mz ACS & TNERS
ADVOCA LICITORS
SINGAPORE
We reserved the right to forward a subsequent bill for any
disbursements omitted herein.
E.&OE

HﬁHE‘T EQREHES FOR mﬁ EQHTH ;!I_.IEY ;01!-
SN0 TP NO. CHM DOA
1 21712018 SLV24B80B GBCROIR 30/6/2018
2 212018 WC6758U SKBS00SD 2712018
3 32018 STp5443U SGTEL68G 1/7/2018
4 5/7/2018 SKZ6272A SGT2238E 52018
5 6/7/2018 §1J4674H SLG3AT20G 5772018
& 672018 FBGA27T5K  GBB286TT 4/712018
7 7/7/2018 SIM7602E SLT3675K 7172018
8 9/7/2018 SLQ3458L SIY4796K 8/7/2018
g Br7/2018 SLN6BI3R SLV2410D TT2018
10 10/7/2018 SKVE64TE  SGT2713A 6712018
11 10/7/2018 PAB339B SLL4307) 572018
12 10/7/2018 5173340C SLBR16ZK 23/6/2018
13 11772018 SLF3626T SCZ1001T 14772018
14 11/7/2018 SKAS113P PC4270E 8772018
15 11/7/2028 XDE205G GZ93055 6/7/2018
16 11/7/2018 SKT92130M SLY265Y 11/7/2018
17 11/7/2018 SBRIIIIM SLP5483E 10/7/2018
13 11/7/2018 SLL7910Y  SGN6284B 872018
1% 14/7/2018 SLF783TE GEBE4435 13/7/2018
20 18/7/2018 XD4751) GBF9752 17/7/2018
21 19/7/2018 FUS9E6R SLGTB4S 18/8/2017
22 19/772018 GBF5606F  GBD3240X 811207
23 19/72018 GBC1638F  SKOQ9644M 18/7/2018
24 23/7/2018 EL1998T EL351P 221772018
25 23/7/2018 SLHE653D SLS5743P 177712018
26 26/7/2018 SLZAT25L SIX9961Y 251712018
27 27712018 XB3i212R SKF5193G 26/7/2018
28 31/7/2018 SJK4937U SGEZ583L 91208
29 31/7/2018 PASTET] SLUS73TX 17/5/2018
29 searches @$8.00 per search Total: $ 232.00

[SINGAPO! ARS: TWO HUNDRED & THIRTY-TWO ONLY]




