Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 January 2018 8:40 AM
To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM TOTAL LOSS - SJK7768X

Dear Gerald,

Total Loss report submitted in merimen.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 17 January 2018 2:15 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: OD CLAIM TOTAL LOSS - SIK7768X

Our Ref : 17/18/18/VP05/020325
Dear Veron,

The OD claim has been settled under Total Loss.

Kindly upload your survey bill in Merimem for our settlement.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



