Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Thomas <thomas_tan26@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 8 May 2018 3:23 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Claim Ref: SSMO06WF/24838
Attachments: SJU9188D Discharge Voucher.pdf

Dear Joy,

Attached signed DV's copy.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Thomas Tan

CP Motors Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive

Sin Ming Auto City #05-05
Singapore 575722

thomas_tan26@hotmail.com
HP: +65 8201 8103 Fax: +65 6459 5357

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, May 8, 2018 2:11 PM

To: Thomas

Subject: RE: Claim Ref: SSMO06WF/24838

Yes Please.
Thank you

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Thomas [mailto:thomas_tan26@hotmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 8 May 2018 1:09 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Claim Ref: SSM0O06WF/24838

Dear Joy,

Can email to you?



Best Regards

Thomas Tan

CP Motors Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive

Sin Ming Auto City #05-05
Singapore 575722

thomas tan26@hotmail.com
HP: +65 8201 8103 Fax: +65 6459 5357

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, May 8, 2018 12:08 PM

To: Thomas

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Claim Ref: SSM0O06WF/24838

Dear Thomas,
We will follow-up with M/s AXA.
Meanwhile, we request for the signed DV’s copy with your co. stamp/chop for audit purposes.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Thomas [mailto:thomas tan26@hotmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 8 May 2018 10:24 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Claim Ref: SSM0O06WF/24838

Dear Joy,
Kindly check. Have the payment send out already?

Best Regards

Thomas Tan

CP Motors Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive

Sin Ming Auto City #05-05
Singapore 575722

thomas tan26@hotmail.com




HP: +65 8201 8103 Fax: +65 6459 5357



