Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 6 March 2018 9:16 AM

To: sin hup lee

Cc: SUR; Admin A

Subject: RE: Road Traffic Accident on 02 January 2018 along Scotts Road involving vehicle
YP3000A / GY5165K. *LKK REF: CS/EGI18000619/T1vb

Attachments: GY5165K__Final Bill.pdf; GY5165K__rental2.jpg; GY5165K__rental1.jpg;

GY5165K__Invoice.jpg

Without Prejudice
Hi,
Kindly forward all the documents to ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD directly.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: sin hup lee [mailto:sinhuplee@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 11:18 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Road Traffic Accident on 02 January 2018 along Scotts Road involving vehicle YP3000A / GY5165K.

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Attached is the final bill for for Repair Vehicle No: GY5165K.

Please prepare cheque payable to m/s Sin Hup Lee Service Co

Thank you.

Regards,
Mr Wong
Sin Hup Lee Service Co.



