Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April 2018 4:15 PM

To: ‘tanselena@smrt.com.sg’

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident involving SHD6071P & SLJ6076Y on 7.1.2018 at New Market towards
Havelock Road (Our ref: TAX/01/18/2031/ST)  Our Ref: 1201800000568

Attachments: Ol SKETCH PLAN.PDF

Without Prejudice

Hi Selena,

We refer to the above matter.

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client make a right turn at
the control junction and collided into our insured vehicle which traveling straight.

The video footage is not conclusive. At the time of accident, the vehicles beside client have not started moving as well.
We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 March 2018 10:46 AM

To: 'tanselena@smrt.com.sg' <tanselena@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SHD6071P & SLI6076Y on 7.1.2018 at New Market towards Havelock Road (Our ref:
TAX/01/18/2031/ST) Our Ref: 1201800000568

Hi Selena,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

Our principle would like to request a copy of video footage to follow up the matter with insured driver.
1



Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Selena Tan Lee See (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) [mailto:TanSelena@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 6:54 PM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Cc: Belliana - SGUser

Subject: Accident involving SHD6071P & SLI6076Y on 7.1.2018 at New Market towards Havelock Road (Our ref:
TAX/01/18/2031/ST) Our Ref: 1201800000568

Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter.

Due to the negligence of your insured, we are now quantifying our claims as follow:

Cost of Repairs $$4,055.37
Loss of Rental S$ 1,166.30(S$116.63 x 10 days)
Loss of Income SS 600.00 (S$60.00 x 10 days)
LTA search fee SS 7.00

TOTAL $$5,828.67

We have also attached the following documents supporting our claim:

Repair Invoice

GIA report

Vehicle laid-up report
Rental agreement

LTA search fee

Letter of Authorization

Please let us hear from you soon.

Regards

Selona Jan

Claims and Insurance Agency

Direct line +65 6866 2653 | Direct fax +65 6368 7421
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4

Singapore 757705
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ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store
this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any attachments
at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been scanned for viruses
by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



