Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 October, 2019 3:19 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Lina Pang; Jenny Law

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 9214733100SG-003 || Accident Involving SGV4424K / PC5571E on

05/01/2018 - LKK REF CC6/AIG18000527/Uha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Vic,

We are pleased to accept your offer of global sum of $2,280.00 (all in) for my client’s vehicle property
claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Jason Tang

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445

jason @fastechauto.com.sg

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, October 8, 2019 2:16 PM

To: Jason <Jason @fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 9214733100SG-003 Il Accident Involving SGV4424K / PC5571E on 05/01/2018 -
LKK REF CC6/A1IG18000527/Uha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jason,

We refer further to the below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our

Insured’s part, our principal is prepared to increase and improve our offer to a global sum of $2,280.00 (all in) in full
and final settlement.



Kindly confirm acceptance. The above amount is to be made payable to KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and should
not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement should also
not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made
solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other
related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ETES e
SR RSR i Suve the Larth: Frint only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 1:11 PM

To: 'Jason'

Cec: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Tan, Bennie-WZ; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 9214733100SG-003 Il Accident Involving SGV4424K / PC5571E on 05/01/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Jason,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are looking into the matter and will get back to you for an update/offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ETES e
SR RSR wm Suve the Larth: Frint only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.
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From: Jason [mailto:Jason @ fastechauto.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 12:19 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cec: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Tan, Bennie-WZ; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 9214733100SG-003 Il Accident Involving SGV4424K / PC5571E on 05/01/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic,

We have yet to receive an reply from your good office.
We await your updates.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Jason Tang

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445

jason @fastechauto.com.sg

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant.

From: Jason Fastech Auto [mailto:jason @fastechauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2019 4:58 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cec: 'Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)' <olivialau @lkkauto.com>; 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)'

<AsherSng @lkkauto.com>; "Tan, Bennie-WZ' <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 9214733100SG-003 Il Accident Involving SGV4424K / PC5571E on 05/01/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We had forwarded the Letter of Demand to your office dated 22/01/2018.
We await your offer

Thank you.

Best Regards



Jason Tang

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445

jason @fastechauto.com.sg

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant.

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ [mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan @aig.com]

Sent: Saturday, March 30, 2019 6:45 PM

To: jason @fastechauto.com.sg

Cec: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau @lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Our Ref: 9214733100SG-003 Il Accident Involving SGV4424K / PC5571E on 05/01/2018

Dear Sir / Mdm

We are the insurer of SGV4424K at the material time of the Accident.

We note that you are acting for AIRKING TRANSPORT CONSTRUCTION & ENGINEERING PTE.
LTD., the owner of PC5571E, in their claim for Property Damages against the Auto Insurance Policy of our
Insured as a result of the above Accident.

The Claim has been outstanding for more than 12 months. If we do not hear from you in writing within the
next 10 working day from the date of this email, we shall proceed to close our file.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.




