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Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 22 February 2018 5:02 PM
To: 'vfix auto'
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Your Ref: VFIX-TP20180398_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 6014X & SLH 696H ON 

03/01/2018
Attachments: RV III SLH696H 03012018.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Irene, 
 
We refer to your email below. 
 
We confirmed the above settlement at $3,671.45.(all in). 
 
Kindly forward your signed DV with all the relevant documents in ORIGINAL HARDCOPY via post. (ie: final repair bill, 
authorisation to act, discharge voucher ) for our necessary action. 
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
From: vfix auto [mailto:vfixauto@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 22 February 2018 3:57 PM 
To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: VFIX-TP20180398_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 6014X & SLH 696H ON 03/01/2018 
 
Dear Zaini 
 
We unable to accept your offer at $3,580.00.  
 
We would like to counter proposal at $3,671.45. 
 
Thanks 
Irene 
 
 
 
 
 
Vfix Auto Services Pte Ltd 
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60 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Ark@KB Singapore 417892 | E: vfixauto@gmail.com | T: +65 64552957 | F: +65 64452368 
 
On Thu, Feb 22, 2018 at 3:04 PM, Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Your Ref: VFIX-TP20180398 

Our Ref: CC6/III18000515/Uks3 

  

Dear Sirs, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 6014X & SLH 696H ON 03/01/2018  
 
We refer to the above matter  
 
For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at S$3,580.00(all in)  
 
Kindly confirm acceptance. 

  

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

 


