
1

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 18 June 2021 10:40 AM

To: Cooma & Rai; Accounts (LKKAuto); Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our ref: MPR 185186/SS28 - Your ref: Pl advise - Request for Copies of the 

vehicle inspection reports of FT7544A & XD 3311C

Dear Mr Rai 
 
LKK only did the mechanical inspection. The VDR is done by Traffic Police themselves. 
 

Best Regards, 

Bryan Ang  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Cooma & Rai <coomarai@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 18 June 2021 10:26 AM 

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan 

(LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Our ref: MPR 185186/SS28 - Your ref: Pl advise - Request for Copies of the vehicle inspection reports of 

FT7544A & XD 3311C 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Mr Bryan Ang, 

 

Thanks for the swift reply. Please let us have the invoice following which we will make payment upon receipt. 

 

We would also appreciate receiving copies of the Vehicle Damage Reports of both the vehicles if they are available. 

 

Best Regards 

 

M P Rai  
Cooma & Rai | Advocates & Solicitors | Notary Public | Commissioner for Oaths  

T +65 6438 0783 | F +65 6438 0784 | coomarai@singnet.com.sg | 133 New Bridge Road, #08-02 Chinatown Point, 

Singapore 059413 | www.coomarai.com | 

Office Hours: Mondays – Fridays from 9 am to 5.30 pm. We are closed for lunch between 1 pm and 2 pm. We are 

also closed on weekends and on Public Holidays.  

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is 
addressed and is privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail, delete this message and you should not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained 

herein.          

 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 18 June 2021 9:43 am 

To: Cooma & Rai <coomarai@singnet.com.sg>; Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) 

<siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Our ref: MPR 185186/SS28 - Your ref: Pl advise - Request for Copies of the vehicle inspection reports of 

FT7544A & XD 3311C 
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Dear Mr Rai 
 
We will provide the requested reports. An administrative charge of $50/- per report will apply. Hard copy of 
reports will be despatched to your office. 
 
Dear Shiau Chan 
 
Please re-print report and create invoice  
 
Our refs: CI/TPD18000512/Zn           CI/TPD17018930/Nn 
 

Best Regards, 

Bryan Ang  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Cooma & Rai <coomarai@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 17 June 2021 6:14 PM 

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Our ref: MPR 185186/SS28 - Your ref: Pl advise - Request for Copies of the vehicle inspection reports of 

FT7544A & XD 3311C 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Mr Bryan Ang, 

 

HC/S 876/2020   

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FT7544A AND XD 3311C ON 14 SEPTEMBER 2017 AT THE JUNCTION OF JALAN BAHAR AND 

JURONG WEST AVENUE 2  

 

We act for Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd and their insured who is the owner of the vehicle No. XD 3311C 

(Prime Mover). The driver of the Prime Mover has been sued in HC/S 876/2020 by a victim who was involved in the 

above-mentioned road traffic accident on 14 September 2017 in which the rider of the motorcycle, Muhammad 

Hafiq Bin Juraimi, died (“deceased”).  

 

Our client requires the Vehicle mechanical inspection reports of the Prime Mover and the motorcycle (FT7544A). 

When we wrote to IO Vilton Hia of the Traffic Police, he informed us that the vehicle mechanical inspection reports 

were prepared by your company and to apply for them from your company. 

 

Hence, we would be obliged if you can let us have copies of the Vehicle mechanical inspection reports of both the 

Prime Mover and the motorcycle (FT7544A). If a charge is payable, please let us know the amount. 

 

As the matter is of great urgency for use in the High Court, your urgent reply would be appreciated. 

 

If you are not in charge of the matter, kindly direct this email to the correct person in your company. 

 

We thank you and look forward to hearing from you soon. 

 

Best Regards 

 

M P Rai  
Cooma & Rai | Advocates & Solicitors | Notary Public | Commissioner for Oaths  

T +65 6438 0783 | F +65 6438 0784 | coomarai@singnet.com.sg | 133 New Bridge Road, #08-02 Chinatown Point, 

Singapore 059413 | www.coomarai.com | 
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Office Hours: Mondays – Fridays from 9 am to 5.30 pm. We are closed for lunch between 1 pm and 2 pm. We are 

also closed on weekends and on Public Holidays.  

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is 
addressed and is privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail, delete this message and you should not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained 

herein.          

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


