Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 January, 2018 5:32 PM

To: 'Vimmala D/O Raja Singam'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Enquire on market value - SLK3846G

Dear Vimmala,

The MV of SLK 3846G is $12K-S14K(est) as at Dec’17.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vimmala D/O Raja Singam [mailto:vimmala_rajasingam@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Thursday, 4 January, 2018 2:54 PM

Subject: Enquire on market value - SLK3846G

Importance: High

Hi,

Please advise us urgently on the market value of SLK3846G.

Date of accident: 28/12/2017

Thank you.



Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Crwmer 10 Type: Lingagore NRIC
Cremar 102 SR04
Vehicle Details

Wehigla Mo SLMI844G
Vehiche to be Exported: No

Intended Da-regisoration Date: 04 Jan 2018
‘ghicle Make: HIOMDA
Wehicla Madel: CIVIC 1BL &
Primary Colour: Elack
Manufacturing Yesr: 2008

Engine Moz R1BA13D313TY
Chassis Mo JHMFD 143085214448
Maximum Power Output: 103.0 kW (138 bhp)
Cipen Market Value: £21,14100
Ciriginal Reglsuration Date: 11 Mar 2008
First Registration Date: 11 Mar 2008
Transfer Count i

Actuzl ARF Paid: 523,256.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

BARF Eligibdling: ez

BARF Eligibiliny Expiry Date: 10 Mar 2018
DARF Rsbate Amount: £11.628.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Dat: 10 Mar 2018

COE Categony: 8 -Car(1801cc & above)
COE Period{¥aarsk plt]

QP Paict E13,28%.00

COE Rebate Amgunt 524200

Total Rebate Amount: §$11.870.00

The information contaimed herein ls correct as at 04 Jan 2018

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE
This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any person
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other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



