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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199807198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-98071988-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

36 ROBINSON ROAD
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref : CS/IFCI18000485/Grd3

Date : 09-01-2018

LR

Code: FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 44780 Veh. Inspected GBG 46145
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From TEQ SWEE KEONG Assign Date 09/01/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model lee 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  04/01/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at THINK ONE AUTOCARE PTE LTD
NO.18 DEFU AVENUE 2
SINGAPORE 539522
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Eileen Lee <EileenLee@first-insurance.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, January 11, 2018 10:22 AM

To: Karen Tan

Cc: CWS Motor Claims; SUR; assignments

Subject: FW: YR REF: GBG46145 OUR REF: SHA4478D DOA 04/01/2018
Attachments: img-110191408-0001.tif img—llDlE'HﬂE—UGDE.tif

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Karen,

We note the attached witness statutory declaration.

in future, we urge that your good company submit such documents / evidences at the early stage when requesting for

pre-repair inspection.
This will save all our time in making changes at current stage.

We shall amend our survey to be on Direct Settlement basis.

However, please do not take this as a precedent.
in future, we shall not be making amendments on our survey arrangements.

Please share the above procedures with your follow colleagues.

Aside to CWS & LKK,

Please take note of the changes.

Thank You.

Regards,

Eileen Lee (Ms)

Motor Claims Dept.

First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | Tel No. : 6507 3848 (Ext 112)
| Fax No. : 6507 3848 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

E-mail : eileenlee @first-insurance.com.sg

Motor Claims E-mail : motor _claims@first-insurance.com.sg / motorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg

Website: ’nttp‘.,.",."www.msﬁrstcapital.cum.sg

amember of [[{ETAE] INSURANCE GROUP



Erom: Karen Tan [mailto:karentan@thinkone.com.sgl

Sent: Wednesday, January 10, 2018 5:17 PM

To: Eileen Lee <EileenLee@first-insurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YR REF: GBGA6145 OUR REF: SHA4478D DOA 04/01/2018
Importance: High

Hi Eileen,

As per attach is my client witness statement.

Yours Sincerely,

Karen Tan

Claim Advisor

Think One Autocare Pte Ltd
No.18 Defu Avenue 2
Singapore 539522

HP : 9128 8488

DID : 6844 3300 FAX ; 6842 4088

From: Eileen Lee Imaiitu:E‘|ieenLee@first-insurance.cnm.sgl

Sent: Wednesday, 10 January, 2018 4:43 PM

To: Karen Tan <karentan@thinkone.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YR REF: GBGA4614S OUR REF: SHA4478D DOA 04/01/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Liability is unclear.

\We are unable to commit on any liability (%) at this juncture.



Catherine Chung (LKK Auto)

From: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@first-insurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, & January, 2018 5:24 PM

To: ‘assignments@lkkauto.com’

Ce: Eileen Lee; Karen Tan

Subject: MNEW SURVEY ASSIGMMENT - TP VEH REF: GBG46145 OUR REF:
SHA44780 DOA 04/01/2018

Attachments: FW: GBGAA14S & SHAFF78D ACCIDENT DATED ON 04.01.2018 ALONG CHANGI

ROAD (16.4 KB); MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT.pdf

Importance: High

Dear Sirs

New survey request for your handling.

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Motor Claims Dept

36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3848 | Fax No. : 6307 1849 | Company Regn. Mo, 195000106C
email: MotorClaims@first-insurance.com.sg

From: Karen Tan [mailto:karentan@thinkone.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, January 08, 2018 3:17 PM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweekeong@first-insurance.com.sg>
Subject: RE: YR REF: GBG46145 QUR REF: 5HA4478D DOA 04/01/2018
Importance: High

Hi MR Teo,

Can we proceed with LKK Auto Consultant.

Yours Sincerely,

Karen Tan

Claim Advisor

Think One Autocare Pte Ltd
Mo.18 Defu Avenue 2
Singapore 539522

HP : 9128 8488

DID : 6844 3300 FAX : 6842 4988



From: Teo Swee Keong [mailto:TeoSweeKeong@first-insurance.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 8 January, 2018 2:29 PM

To: Karen Tan <karentan@thinkone.com.sg>

Cc: Eileen Lee <Eileenlee@first-insurance.com.sg>

Subject: YR REF: GBG406143 OUR REF: 5HA44780 DDA 04/01/2018
Importance: High

Dear Sirs,
We refer to your survey request dated 08,/01/2018.

Please find below our list of surveyors for your reference, Kindly select from our list below and inform us of
your choice within the next 2 days.

1. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
2. Vicom Ltd

Dncéyou inform us of your choice, the surveyor will be appointed within 2 working days of your email.

If you do not agree to any of the surveyors above, you may proceed to appoint your own surveyor. In this
instance, we will also appoint a surveyor from our list above to conduct the PRI. Upon completion of repairs,
please contact our appointed surveyor to conduct a physical re-inspection of the vehicle.

Thank you.

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Motor Claims Dept

36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID ; 6507 3848 | Fax Mo. : 6507 3849 | Company Reegn. No. 195000106C
email: MotorClaims@first-insurance,com.sg

From: Caroline Cabrera

Sent: Monday, January 08, 2018 9:50 AM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@first-insurance.com.sgs

Subject: FW: GBG46145 & SHAFF78D ACCIDENT DATED ON 04.01.2018 ALONG CHANGI ROAD
Impaortance: High

Dear SK,

For survey — SHA4478D

Thanks & Regards



Covolime Cabvera
Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd | A FAIRFAX Company

36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House| Singapore 068877 | Reg. No. 195000106C
D: 6507 3848 | F: 6507 3849

email: www.first-insurance.coim.sg

From: ILPROCESSCENTRE [mailto:ilprocesscentre@icicilombard.com]

Sent: Friday, January 5, 2018 5:57 PM

To: Motor_Claims <Motor_Claims@first-insurance.com.sg>

Subject: FW: GBG4614S & SHAFF78D ACCIDENT DATED ON 04.01.2018 ALONG CHANGI ROAD
Importance: High

From: Karen Tan [mailtg:karentan@thinkone.com.sq]

Sent: 05 January 2018 02:55 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'

Subject: RE: GBG46145 & SHAFF78D ACCIDENT DATED ON 04.01.2018 ALONG CHANGI ROAD
Importance: High

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Can arrange a surveyor for GBG46145 for the above mentioned.

Yours Sincerely,

Karen Tan

Claim Advisor

Think One Autocare Pte Ltd
No.18 Defu Avenue 2
Singapore 539522

HP: 9128 84388

DID : 6844 3300 FAX : 6842 4988

“Please note that this email, including any attachments, is intended solely for the individual (s) or entity
(ies) to whom they are addressed and may contain information that is private, confidential and privileged. In
case you are not the intended recipient, request you to notify the sender by reply mail and delete this email,
including any copies or attachments from your system. Any unauthorized dissemination, disclosure and/or
use of the contents of this communication to anyone is strictly prohibited and punishable by law.

Opinions, conclusions and statements of intent expressed in this c-mail are of the sender and ICICI Lombard
General Insurance Company Limited (Company) does not accept liability for the views expressed in this
3



email unless confirmed by an authorized representative of the Company independently of this
communication or for the consequences of any viruses that may be transmitted with this email.”
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Enquire Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No. ;

Vehicle Type :

Wehicle Attachment 1:
Viehicle Scheme :

Vehicle Make :

Viehicle Maodel :

Chassis No.:

Propeilant

Engine Mo.;

Engine Capacity ;
Maximum Power Qutput ;
Maximum Laden Weight :
Unladen Weight ;

Year Of Manufacture:

Original Registration Date

Lifespan Expiry Date ;

COE Category :

Transfer Fee Enquiry

GBG44145
850 - Goods (Closed) Van/Van Panel (Delivery)
Mo Attachment

Marmal

TOYOTA

LITEACE 1.5 GL AT 2WD LGV
S5402M0067175

Petrol

35ZDGES23%

14%5¢cc

2100 kg
1220 kg
2017

17 Aug 2017

16 Aug 2037

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus

Quata Premium ; $40,212.00

COE Expiry Date: 16 Aug 2027

Road Tax Expiry Date : 16 Aug 2018

Inspection Due Date : 16 Aug 2018

Intended Transfer Date ; 10 Jan 2018

CO2 Emission 184.00 (g/km)

CEV/VES Rebate Utilised -

Amount

CO Emission : -

HC Emission ; -

MOx Emission

FM Emission : -

Late renewal fee(s) will be imposed if road tax / lay up has expired. Please use Enguire Road Tax Pavable for fee(s) payable.
Road tax, including Over Payment (if any), of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registered owner when its ownership is being
transferred,

Amount Payable

hitpstifvrl.lta.gov.sgitafvrifaction/enquire TransferFeeDetalls Proxy PFUNCTION_ID=F0S01015ET



WTOATED02584 | Think One Aulocane Pte Lid - HG
ENTRY DATE & TIME: (5172006 1531
SUBMITTED BY: Tan Hul Kiarg Karen

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1. Please report comectly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be complated by the Policyhalder andlor the Autherised Driver.

4, Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facls may alkew insurance companies ]
repudiale policy ability,

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy labiity on the part of the insurance companias,

5. Any false reporting may be referred fo the Police for investigation.

B, This repart will be forwarded by the insurers of the insurers of the GlA Records Management Cenire establisned by the General Insurance Association of
Singapore{Gla) for archiving and that copies of this reporl will for a fee be made available upon application by interested parties

7. By the lodgement of this repert o the insurers, you hereby conzent to the archiving of this report at the cenfre and to copies of the report being made available
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 05/01/2018 15:31
Dale Of Accident 04/01/2018 15:10
Exact Location Of Accident ALONG CHANGI ROAD
Country/State of Loss SINGAFORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Mumber GBCG46145
Insured/Policyholder
MName Of Registered Owner PAWS CARE PTELTD
Co Reg No 201 722807TK
Email Address NOEMAIL
Mobile Phone Mo (LOCAL) +65-91800493
Alternative Phone Mo OFFICE-91800493
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer TOYOTA
Model LITEACE 1.5 GL AT 2WD LGV
E:ﬂ?:;«f:;mﬁ :ur which vehicle was being used al |\, ~ow g
Are you_claiming Lndler your own insurance palicy NO
far repair to your vehicle?
If Mo, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY
Vehicle Category GOODS VEHICLE
Insurance Company
Mame of Insurance Company NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Fleet Policy ND
Palicy Mumber 5093308550
Cover Mote Number
Driver
Mame af Driver TAN MEMNG XIN, TIA (CHEN MENGXIN)
NRIC No 582248698
Date OfF Birth (B/08/1982
Occupation CUTDOOR
Date Of Driving Pass 08/11/2002
Driving Experience 15 YEARS AND 1 MONTH
Gender FEMALE
Mobile Mumber (LOCAL) +65-91800493
Fax Number
Contact Mumber
EMail Address MNOEMAIL

Page 1 of 23



Address

Postcode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insurad

\ehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Gompany of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Mumber of vehicles invalved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accidenl reported to the police?
If Yes Please state which Palice Station
Faolice Station Mame

Police Station Address

Palice Station Contact

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

If Yes against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

PLEASE REFER TO THE POLICE REPORT
Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Was there any audio recorded?

Details of Witness 1

MName

Phone Mumber

Email Address

APT BLK 771 BEDOK RESERVOIR VIEW #17-157
470771

NO
OWNER

COLLISION - CHANGE/CROSS LANE
CLEAR

CRY

MO

YES
NO
YES

MO

YES

KAMPONG JAVA NEIGHEOURHOOD POLICE CENTRE

ROAD: 21 KAMPONG JAVA ROAD , POSTCODE: 228892 , COUNTRY:
SINGAPORE

TEL MO: 1800-2959988 - FAX NO: 63918499
MO

YES
NO
NO

HAMIS BIN AHMAD
90286940

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Mame of Driver
MRIC/Passpart Mumber
Contact Mumber

SHA447ED

VEHICLE B
PRIVATE CAR

Page 2 of 23



SKETCH PLAN

Rwﬁ%%l%‘é’" e
B-aHR44TR0
&
P ]
M

Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1

r1'|

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

Pe vdev 1. T OUG Ny

-

DECL&RATIGN

— |
Pn'm:,'hu'q:le'b 5 :rlgnatun:
Date & T“;ne b

artlr;l.Lars are frUe in every respect.

OB

Dalwer's Signature
{if driver is not the policyholder)
Date & Tima:

Think One Agtocare Pte Ltd

Reperting Centr Begsennal's Sigature
Name: Jar Tl 0N rev)

NRIC/FIN No.: Qe E’l/{.-ﬁ"

Page 5 of 23



OATHS AND DECLARATIONS ACT

(CHAPTER 211)
STATUTORY DECLARATION
AAALY BN AMMAD | .ﬁR.ICN&:-ﬁ_'.-g”.# 5‘515‘3‘4& £75
Ocecupation: PERSOYVAL qQWEﬁ.Address: BIK b9 UUB;[;L_I;IE;]}S'ET ’ :}:i_‘ B
04-Bn  SINGAPIRE 130167 |
do solemnly and sincerely declare: |
T was %ﬁﬁiﬂﬁ aF the Eo Stadion. T wAS —iﬁrlkérﬁ o MYy freed]

ol (0IANG ot ot fne road aud | saw the van on tne

W lane anol etk wal at 4l avdl  lovie. Sudaonly
the Ana dom Dol lave vy o cnavge n lane qud@
bub | neavd tae  vanm henk fo e 4pxi but fne fad
Wil o 4y b into. the . TThe sl gketcln

plan i¢ pn the Second PAge.

PTo

- And I make this solemn declaration by virtae of the provisions of the QOaths and
Declarations Act (Cap. 211), and subject to the penalties provided by that Act for the making
of false statements in statutory declarations, conscientiously believing the statements

contaihed in this declaration to be true in every particular.

Declared at Singapore )
this day of - .
(R_T.P./Signature of Declarant)
Before me, Interpreted by

_ Commissioner for Oaths, Singapore

5C - Wegitin 1



“DATHS AND DECLARATIONS ACT
(CHAPTER 211)

STATUTORY DECLARATION

L ArAMIs B AMMAD . RICNo:_ SWIe85>-A

Occupation: PER.WF DRIER Address; BV g, WCODLAHDS 3T.0
\ i \ }

ca-8%  Jukacorke Poleq

do solemnly and sincerely declare:

—

Sleriar Awe .

— e

I
@ "y £250 STATIN -

s -
gl !

!

Qhﬂmg

And T make this solemn declaration by virtae of the provisions of the Qaths and
Declarations Act (Cap. 211), and subject to the penalties provided by that Act for the making
of false statements in statutory declarations, conscientiously believing the statements
contained in this declaration to be true in every particular.

Declared at Singapor

this S daypf/ Jow 1@1\( ) )

(R.T.P./Signature of Declarant)

Interpreted by

Cominissi n;r_-fu’r’ C}_a_mths, Singapore

A€ - Vemitn |



Think One Autocare Pte Ltd
No.18 Defu Avenue 2
Singapore 539522
Tel: 6844 3300 Fax: 6842 4988
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Front bumper assy o Q,f;
Front bumper bracket </~ CM

Front bumper reinforcement )‘,‘ BT

Front gnlle assy X NN

Front bonnet assy X f"‘f

Front bonnet emblem .~ " ¢

Front left headlamp /

Front left door panel i f+pas¥ -

Front left door hinges

Front left door regulator linkage with motor X

Front left door outer handle X ~MA
Front left door checker linkage X
Front left door lock mechanism X
Front left wing mirror assy %
Front left blindspot mirror X
Front left lower arm X

Front left upperarm X

Front left knuckle arm %

Front left wheel hub bearing ¥
Front left inner floor panel X
Front left chassis member frame X
Front left inner cowling _» €&
Front stabilizer bar X

Front left stabilizer link X

Front power steering rack and pinion assy ¥ 114V
Front left tierod end X

Front left shock absorber X

(A U Gy ~ B . §Goe 00

Less 25%

Special Nett ltems

Front bumper clips 7 e .
Front grille clips X /N

Front left inner cowling clips / psC
Front left wheel rim /2

Front left tyre X F(,Z"NN
Front left door panel comphny sticker / ¢ -
Front no plate 7{ NN

Total Parts

355.00 ~

365.00
2,650.00

75.00 .~ 54|

137500 ~ 577, %

2,058.00
180.00
480.00
155.00
166.00
252.00
350.00
250.00

359.00
451.00
255.00
966.00
3.500.00
155.00
380.00
260,00
3,750.00
195.00
650.00

21.405.00
5351.25

5
5
$
5
$
$
S
$
S
b
$
S
$
S
$
§  389.00
S
$
5
$
5
5
5
5
$
b
$
$
S
$

16,053.75

50.00
30.00
30.00
450.00
250.00
30.00
80.00

wes W 7 &8 WY BB A

6920.00

$ 16,973.75

r

_):—

STy
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Think One Autocare Pte Ltd
No.18 Defu Avenue 2
Singapore 539522
Tel: 6844 3300 Fax: 6842 4088

GBG460145 Toyota Liteace

‘No

1

F =N

oo =] o thn

10

11
12

13

Description
Labour for panel beating, cut, weld, straighten front lefi affected area
and replace accident damaged parts.

To putty and spray painting front left portion.

To check wiring and focus front headlamp.

To apply anti rust proofing to front left affected area.

To transfer front left door lock mechanism.

To transfer front left door glass to new door.

To conduct wheel alignment.

To balance front left wheel.

To remove and install front left central locking for function.

To remove and install front left undercarriage parts.

To conduct chassis alignment.

To remove and install front power steering rack and pinion assy.

Towing service.

Total labour :

(‘Pvﬂ‘ig ' Total parts :
\, o oM ' Total l+ahnur -
I'otal repair cost :

Pfor Mrhf( f)hfl'o"p.
s Gi _grkdand v

S 1.200.00 (Lo

1,200.00

50.00
100.00

£0.00
80.00
80.00
50.00
80.00
300.00

350.00
250.00

100.00

5
5
$
5
$
S
$
b
S
5
S
$
$

3,920.00

$
S

16,973.75
3,920.00

$

20,893,75

o~
3
o

X XX X XX XXX gw\,-d
¢

e T ——— e e
=
<

o

b

2156843



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6258 3551 FAX: 6256 4315

Req Mo 189607 198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliatad to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Ref - CS/FCIMEO004B5/Grd3n2

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 ARG AR ” ”|W||||NWH|“N
Code ;. FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 44780 Veh. Inspected GBG 46145
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.0o0
Claim No. D18000374MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From TEQ SWEE KEONG Assign Date 08/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA LITEACE C.C 14595
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2017
Chassis No. S402MODET175 Colour WHITE
Odometer 15654 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |165R13 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre [165R13 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |1685R13 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [185R13 BRIDGESTONE 7 rmm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT NiS PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  04/01/2018 [Inspection Date 10/01/2018
Survey held at  THINK ONE AUTOCARE PTE LTD
NO.18 DEFU AVENLUE 2
SINGAPORE 539522
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDAMCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFAIRS.
Eh. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9507158-R Page No.:1of3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBG 46148
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rhshhp?:}} ':5!*
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER ASSY DEFORMED 1,286.00 850.00
2| FRONT BUMPER BRACKET CRACKED 98.00 23.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 355.00 355.00
1|FRONT GRILLE ASSY NOT NECESSARY 365.00 .
1|FRONT BONNET ASSY TO REPAIR SEE 2,650 00 :
LABOUR
1|FRONT BONNET EMBLEM NECESSARY 75.00 54.10
1|FRONT LEFT HEADLAMP CRACKED 1,375.00 899.40
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 2,058.00 =
LABOUR
2|FRONT LEFT DOOR HINGES NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR REGULATOR LINKAGE WITH MOTOR |NOT NECESSARY 480.00 ¥
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR OUTER HANDLE NOT NECESSARY 155.00 5
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR CHECKER LINKAGE NOT NECESSARY 166.00
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR LOCK MECHANISM NOT NECESSARY 252 00 -
1|FRONT LEFT WING MIRROR ASSY NOT NECESSARY 350.00 -
1|FRONT LEFT BLINDSPOT MIRROR NOT NECESSARY 250.00 5
1|FRONT LEFT LOWER ARM NOT NECESSARY 389.00
1|FRONT LEFT UPPER ARM NOT NECESSARY 350.00 .
1|FRONT LEFT KNUCKLE ARM NOT NECESSARY 451.00 :
1|FRONT LEFT WHEEL HUB BEARING NOT NECESSARY 255.00 )
1|FRONT LEFT INNER FLOOR PANEL NOT NECESSARY 966.00 =
1|FRONT LEFT CHASSIS MEMBER FRAME NOT NECESSARY 3,500.00 ]
1|FRONT LEFT INNER COWLING DEFORMED 155.00 65.50
1|FRONT STABILIZER BAR NOT NECESSARY 380.00 \
1|FRONT LEFT STABILIZER LINK NOT NECESSARY 260.00 .
1|FRONT POWER STEERING RACK AND PINION ASSY NOT NECESSARY 3,750.00
1|FRONT LEFT TIE ROD END NOT NECESSARY 195.00 )
1|FRONT LEFT SHOCK ABSORBER NOT NECESSARY 650,00 -
1|FRT LH FENDER BUCKLED 900.00 40000

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18000485/Grd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408033
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Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.2 of 3
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
P Workshop ()| (5)
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -5,576.25 68175
18,72B.75 1,965.25
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
2|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
B|FRONT GRILLE CLIPS (SN) MOT MECESSARY 30.00 -
6|FRONT LEFT INNER COWLING CLIPS (SN NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|FRONT LEFT WHEEL RIM (SN NOT NECESSARY 450.00 -
1|FRONT LEFT TYRE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 250,00 -
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR PANEL COMPANY STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 30.00 15.00
1|FRONT NO PLATE (SN) NOT MECESSARY B0.00 -
920.00 85.00
LABOUR
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING,CUT WELD STRAIGHTEN 1.200.00 400.00
FRONT LEFT AFFECTED AREA AND REPLACE ACCIDENT
DAMAGED PARTS INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FRONT BONNET ASSY AND FRONT LEFT DOOR PANEL.
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING FRONT LEFT 1,200.00 600.00
PORTION.
TO CHECK WIRING AND FOCUS FRONT HEADLAMP. 50.00 30.00
TO APPLY ANTI RUST PROOFING TO FRONT LEFT 100.00 50.00
AFFECTED AREA.
TO TRANSFER FRONT LEFT DOOR LOCK MECHANISM.  |NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
TO TRANSFER FRONT LEFT DOOR GLASS TO NEW NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
DOOR
TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
TO BALANCE FRONT LEFT WHEEL NOT NECESSARY 50.00
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL FRONT LEFT CENTRAL NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
LOCKING FOR FUNCTION
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL FRONT LEFT NOT NECESSARY 300.00 -
UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS.
TO CONDUCT CHASSIS ALIGNMENT, NOT NECESSARY 350.00 -
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL FRONT POWER STEERING  |NOT NECESSARY 250.00 .
RACK AND PINION ASSY.
TOWING SERVICE NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
3,920.00 1,080.00
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CMSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD FARTIES:- This Beport I8 mase solely for the use and banefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

Mo Hakiiy of responsibility whalsoeyver. in conact of Lol 1s
Repor, in whole or in part. does 50 at his or her cown rlsk

Page No.:3 of 3
[ GRAND TOTAL 21,568.75 3,170.25
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 3,170.25
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