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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 8 lanuary 2018 1:22 PM

To: ‘assignments’

Subject: FW: FW: SLCBT02Y Accident 31.12.2017 - 3rd party claim against EQ Insurance
insured GW3487E

Attachments: GW3487E.PDF; TP -5LCB702Y pdf

Our ref : GW34B7E

TP ref : sLcarozy

Policy No. : DMCPHQL7-0007 36

Dear All,

Please refer to the email below.
Kindly proceed to survey the third party vehicle.
We enclosed the following documents for your perusal:

* Insured, GW3487E — GlA report
* TP repair estimate, SLC8702Y — GlA report

Please acknowledge receipt. Thank you,

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
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EQ Insurance Company Limited
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From: OO0I, Ben [mailto:ben@allswellmotor.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, January 08, 2018 11:26 AM

To: Elaine Cheong

Cc: Edmund Ng; Mark Mark; account5 leasing

Subject: Re: FW: SLC8702Y Accident 31.12.2017 - 3rd party claim against EQ Insurance insured GW3487E

Dear Elaine,

Please get LKK to do the survey and we will do a direct settlement with EQ Insurance as soon as possible.

1



Thanks in advance...

Truly

00T, Ben

Allswell Motor Truders
25, Dofu Lanc 9
Singapore 539266
+65 AT | 146
65 9147 83435

Peniallawgilmotor corm 52

On Mon, Jan 8, 2018 at 11:05 AM, Elaine Cheong <glaine.cheong/@eginsurance.com.sg> wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ben,

We refer to your email of 06.01.2018.

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have

agreed to the appointment of any of the motar surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please specify one or more of
our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2) Automobile Inspection Services

Pte Ltd
Tel: 6255 0808

Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6849 9155

Fax: 6284 1538

Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd 4)  Priority Services
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Tel: 62934822

Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866 Fax: 62963283

Fax: 6281 8748 Contact Person: Hui Lian

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace




5} RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

Tel: 67486076

Fax: 67480361

Contact Person: Ricky Teng

6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561

Fax: 6741-4108

7)  Kelvin Automotive Appraising
Services

Tel: 81825263

Fax: 67461148

Contact Person: Kelvin

8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Services

Tel: 96623655

Fax: 67655662

Contact Person: Mr Chee

9} P Knights Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068

Fax: 63445328

Contact Person: Edna Lee

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors whom
you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you

return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
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EQ Insurance Company Limited
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From: Janet Tan

Sent; Monday, January 08, 2018 9:25 AM

To: Elaine Cheong

Cc: ben@allswelimotor.com.sg; Edmund Ng; Mark Mark; account5 leasing

Subject: FW: SLCB702Y Accident 31.12.2017 - 3rd party claim against EQ Insurance insured GW3487E

Elaine,
Fyna. Thank you.
Regards,

Janet Tan
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From: Q0I, Ben [mailto:ben@allswellmotor.com.sg]
Sent: Saturday, January 6, 2018 10:41 AM
To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>
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Cc: Edmund Ng <edmund@allswellmotor.com.sg>; Mark Mark <mark@allswellmotor.com.sg>; account5 leasing

<accountS@allswellmotor.com.sg>

Subject: SLC8702Y Accident 31.12.2017 - 3rd party claim against EQ Insurance insured GW3487E

Dear Janet ( Claims Department )

We are the owner of the vehicle SLC8702Y and your insured vehicle GW3487E came in contact with our vehicle at the material time.



Before we proceed to repair our damaged vehicle, please us know within 2 working days till 09.01.2018 whether you would like to
conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you, we will proceed repair without any more reference to
you,

Thank you in advance.

Truly

QO0I, Ben

Allswell Motor Traders
25, Defu Lane 9
Singapore 539266
Ciftce. 03 6073 1146
Wlabple: 4659147 R348

L] bepi@tallswellmotor. com.sg
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PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REPORT

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref. GSWEQNB000437 Whs2
5 MAXWELL ROAD #17-00 TOWER BLOCK MND  Date:  10-04-2018 III“M“’I"I""H]
COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- (THIRD PARTY CLAIM)
Insured Veh. GW 3487E Veh. Inspected SLC BT02Y
Policy No. DMCPHOA7-000726 Coverage ($) 0,00
Claim No. Excess () 0.00
Assign From  ELAINE CHEONG Assign Date DRID1/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAVASH c.C 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. JTDGGZ0W00J004263 Colour BLACK
Odometer 148292 KM Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GooD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |193/65R15 FIRENZA 4 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/85R15 FIREMZA 4 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 FIREMZA 4 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 FIRENZA 4 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION = _w".l —7i )
5. General Information
Accident Date 31122047 Inspect Date / Time 10/01/2018 {12233 PM )
Survey held at 25 DEFU LANE
Repairer ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS
5a. Remarks
A) THE INSPECTION WiAS CONDUCTED ON A "WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B) THE REPAIR ESTIMATE WAS NOT PRESENTED AT THE TIME OF INSPECTION
THE REPAIRER WAS TOLD TO PREPARE THE ESTIMATE.
C)j ENCLOSED PLEASE FIND DAMAGED VEHICLE PHOTOGRAPHS.
NTHE ESTIMATED REPAIR COST OF THE DAMAGED VEHICLE IS IN THE REGION OF %2 900-83,900

Eb. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days

Report Ref Mo, CS3/EQM 8000437 \Whs2

Inspected By
WILSOMN TEQ CHENG MING K.K.LAU CPT|RET)
Automotive Assessor BEng{Hons),B.Bus MBA PEng,PE, MinstAEA MASME MIRTE

REGD Auto Consultant-SAE, Licensed Appralser

CIECLAMMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIEES:- Thia Report i made wolely for the wee and banafit of the Client ramed on the Trend page of this Repori.

Ko Eability of esponsibilsy whatscever, in conisct cr lor, is sccepbed b any S parky
replyieg on this Repor, s whole o in pait, doss »o o kb or bee own mk.




