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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4215
Reg. No: 199507198R GST Reg Mo 18-8807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automohbile

DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PL

88 SOUTH BRIDGE ROAD
SINGAPORE 058718

Ref : CC&/DAIT18000431/Kph3
Code : DAl

1

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. FU 4383H Veh. Inspected SBY 1373X
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 08/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
 |chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
I./H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date = 03/01/2018 Inspection Date 05/01/2018
Survey held at T&T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
BLK 1680 SIN MING DRIVE
#08-14 SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#08-14 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861

//1/1_""57 r 'fl;, ??;‘l;' -y‘g""/ ESTIMP‘.TE
MARGARET MM}Y I}F)Rful /g & 320, DATE : 04/01/2018
BLK 316 JURONG EAST ST 32 p , VEHICLENO  : shy 1379 x
#02-279 /1 firve, 4 /ifL. xz:.,,,, MAKE/MODEL : Chevrolet Optra
SINGAPORE 600316 ACC DATE : 03/01/2018
Tty
I
PARTICULAR AMOUNT S8
LIST ITEMS:
1 BOOTLID 47 59540 —
2 BOOTLID LOGO 4040 —
3 BOOTLID EMBLEM - OPTRA T, 3520
4 BOOTLID EMBLEM - CHEVROLET Ar. 3200 —
5 BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP T 7440 X
6 REAR BUMPER ASSY € /7 81030 «—r
T REAR TAIL LAMP - RH Jert 24040 —
8 REAR END PANEL A 53050 =~
9 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Jw 5890 x
10 REAR FENDER INNER TRIM - RH . 24020 ¥
1 REAR MUDFLAP - RH A 4950 X
2,767.20
Less Discount: 10%% 276.72
2.400.48
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
| 10 REAR BUMPER CLIP e 5000 —
2 2 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIP A 1000 X
3 | REAR BUMPER STICKER - CNG AL, 2000 —
4 1 REAR REVERSE SENSOR ) Het 35000 Zewia
5 | REARREVERSE CAMERA [%e7 i 450.00 Z;‘_.;j_.m
880.00
LABOUR CHARGES:
1 TO CHECK WIRING 50.00 Z <
2 TO TUFF KOTE 250.00 Fey
3 TO REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR/CAMERA 100.00 e
4 TO REMOVE/REFIX UPHOLSTERY, CSUHION SEAT & ROOF LINING 150.00 £
5 TO PANEL BEATING, REMOVING & REPLACING OF NEW PARTS 1.00000 F .
6 TO SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREA 1,000.00 7,
2.550.00
GRAND TOTAL; 5.920.48

Singapore Dollars: Five Thousand Nine Hundred And Twenty .f-\nd:{' ents Forty Eighty Only!
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

#

From: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 2:44 PM

To: Shu Pei (LEKAuto)

Cec: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Our ref 74521 _Accident Invalving FU4393H (OI :DAI - TBA) AND SBY1373X (TP - LKK

REF -CCh/DAI18000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

Dear Shu Pai,

This is a chain collision accident and our insured is the middle vehicle.
Bola is applicable, insured is liable for the first vehicle.
Please proceed with direct settlement and advise on the repair estimate.

Regards
Charan Singh / Claims Specialist
Qirect: +65 6603 3617

DirectAsia Insurance
“ustomer Service: +65 GRS 55
Retail: B8 South Bridge Road, S{052716)

www directasia.com

006000

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, February 06, 2018 5:47 PM

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims @directasia.com>; Claim <claim@directasia.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com=; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [EXT] RE; Direct Settlement - Accident Involving FU4353H (Ol :DAI - TBA) AND SBY1379X (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/DAI1B000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE URGENT
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please kindly advice liability soonest,

Meanwhile, kindly provide us the claim reference for our necessary action.

1



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Peil Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: G741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 10:01 AM

Te: motorclaims@directasia.com; Claim <claim@directasia.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invelving FU4393H (Ol :DAI - TBA) AND SBY1379X (TP : LKK REF -
CCE/DAILE000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Cear 3ir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

Kindly advice liatility and whether we can proceed direct setflement as third party is chasing for oufcome,
Meanwhile, kindly provide us the claim reference for our necessary action.

Thank you,

Best Regards

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933]

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 17 January 2018 5:09 FM

To: matarclaims@directasia.com; Claim <claim@directasia.com:>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving FU4393H {0l :DAl - TBA] AND SBY1379X (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/DAILB000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the above matter.

Please kindly advice liability soonest.

Meanwhile, kindly provide us the claim reference for our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupe@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 January 2018 5:43 PM

To: motorclaims@directasia.com; Claim <claim@directasia.com:

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving FU4393H (Ol :DAI - TBA) AND SBY1379X (TP : LKK REF -
CCR/DAIL8000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We had inspected the vehicle SBY 1379X at M/s T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd and the repairer would like to do
direct settlement with Direct Asia Insurance (S) Pte Ltd,

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GlA report
- Estimated cost of repair
Please kindly advice liability soonest.
Meanwhile, kindly provide us the claim reference for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auta Consultants Pte Ltd

Phorie: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



IMPORTANT NOTICE: This message is intended only for the attention of the addressee and may contain
legally privileged and/or confidential information. Its unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not
permitted. If you are not the intended recipient, please permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and

inform the sender.



Hsiao TonE (LKKAuto)

From: T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd <tntautoservices@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 9 January 2018 9:52 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Accident Involving FU4393H / SBY1379X on 03/01/2018
Attachments: DOC080118.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to the above matter.

Attached herewith the respective documents of vehicle no: SBY1379X for your perusal.
Kindly revert as soon as possible.

Thank you.

Best Regards.

Vincent Tan

T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861
Hp: 9145 9776



Hsiao Tunﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 12 February 2018 9:29 AM

To: 'Charandeep Singh’

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: Qur ref 74521 _Accident Involving FU4393H (O1 :DAI - TBA) AND 5BY1379X (TP :
LKK REF -CCB/DAI18000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

Attachments: LKKInspection.pdf: LKKAdjustment1.pdf; LKK Survey Photos.pdf; LKK Resurvey

Photos 1.pdf; LKK Resurvey Photos 2 pdf; Rental Receipt.pdf; LTA pdf

without Prejudice
Hi Charan,
We refer to the above matter.

We sesk your approval to offer Third Party repairer, T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd at 54.031.45(all-in). The
breakdown is as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair{w/G5T) 3 3.424.00
2. Loss of Rental [6days x $100.00) 3 &00.00
3. LTA/GIA search fee $ 7.45

TOTAL 54,031.45

Enclosed herewith the supporting document for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Charandeep Singh [mailto:charandeep.singh@directasia.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 2:44 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) =chewht@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: Our ref 74521 _Accident Involving FU4393H (Ol :DAI - TBA) AND 5BY1379X (TP : LKK REF -
CChH/DAI18000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

Dear Shu Pei,

This is a chain collision accident and our insured is the middle vehicle.

Bola is applicable, insured is liable for the first vehicle.

Please proceed with direct settlement and advise on the repair estimate.
1



Hsiao TOHE {LKKA“tD} e —— — e

From: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 February 2018 4:49 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Qur ref 74521 _Accident Invalving FU4393H (01 :DAI - TBA) AND

SBY1379X (TP : LKK REF -CC6/DAI18000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Third party vehicle appears to be nearing the end of COE.
Please advise if vehicle is economical for repairs and what is the repair limit.

Regards
Charan Singh f Claims Specialist
Direct: +65 6603 3617

DirectAsia Insurance
[ wmer Service: +65 G665 5555
Sputh Bridge Road, S{058716

www . directasia.com

008000

From: Hsiaoc Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 12 February, 2018 9:29 AM

To: Charandeep Singh

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74521 _Accident Involving FU4393H (OI :DAI - TBA) AND SBY1379X (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/DAI18000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

Without Prejudice

Hi Charan,

We refer o the above matier.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer, T & T Auto Services Pte Lid af $4,031.45(all-in). The
breakdown is as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair[w/G5T) $3,42400
2. Loss of Rental {4days x $100.00) § 600.00
3. LTA/GIA search fee : 7.45

TOTAL 5$4,031.45

Enclosed herewith the supporting document for your perusal.



Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiac Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 February 2018 5:10 PM

To: ‘Charandeep Singh’

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74521 _Accident Involving FU4393H (Ol :DAIl - TBA) AND
SBY1379% (TP : LKK REF -CC6/DAI1B000431/Kpk3) on 03.01.20718

Attachments: PARF_COE REBATE.pdf

Hi Charan,

Details as follows: -

mMarket Value : § 2.000.00 [est]
LTA Rebate : $ 5,562.00 {est]

MNett Volue 1 53,438.00 (est)

For your further instruction please.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Plhone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charandeep Singh [mailto:charandeep.singh@directasia.com]

Sent: Thursday, 22 February 2018 4:49 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74521 _Accident Involving FU4393H {O1 :DAI - TBA) AND SBY1379X (TP : LKK REF -
CCR/DAILE000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Third party vehicle appears to be nearing the end of COE.
Please advise if vehicle is economical for repairs and what is the repair limit.

Regards
Charan Singh / Claims Specialist

Direct; +65 6603 3617

DirectAsia Insurance
ustormier Service: +65 6665 5555
tail: 88 South Bridge Road, 5{058718)

warw directasia.com

00HB00O0



From: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 948 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74521 _Accident involving FU4393H (OI :DAI - TBA) AND

SBY1379X (TP : LKK REF -CC6/DAI18000431/Kpb3) on 03.01.2018

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Repair cost is within the economical limit
Please proceed as per your breakdown of offer dated 12 February 2018 as follows:

1. Cost of Repair{w/G5T) $3,424.00
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $100.00) $ 40000
3. LTA/GIA search fee F 745

TOTAL 4.031.45

Regards
t Singh / Claims Specialist

ct; +65 5603 3617

DirectAsia Insurance
| Carvice: 465 BEES 5555
a Caulth Brir EE 108 SI0GR716)

wiww. directasia.com

008000

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 5:10 PM

To: Charandeep Singh

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74521 Accident Involving FU4393H (OI :DAI - TBA) AND SBY1379X (TP : LKK REF -
CCh/DAI18000431/Kpb3) on 03.01,2018

Hi Charan,

Details as follows: -

Market Value : £ .9.000.00 (est)

LTA Rebate 1 $ 5,562,00 [est)
Nett Value :$3,438.00 (est)

Far yvour further instruction please.,



Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 12:03 PM

To: 'T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd'

CC: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving FU4393H / SBY1379X on 03/01/2018 *LKK REF:
CCR/DAITB000431/Kpb3

Attachments: DV _SBY 1379X pdf

Without Prejudice
Hi Vincent,
We refer o the above mafter.

we propose settlement as follows: -

|. Cost of Repair(w/GST) $3,424.00
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $100,00) 3 60000
3. LTA/GIA search fee $ 745

TOTAL $54,031.45

If our offer is acceptable by your client, please duly sign the DV enclosed and return 1o us for our necessary
action.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-2107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ui Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 January 2018 4:37 PM

To:'T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd' <tntautoservices@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving FU4393H / SBY1379X on 03/01/2018 *LKK REF: CCH/DAI1B000431/Kphb3

Without Prejudice

Hi,



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) — ———

From: T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd <tntautoservices@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 12:15 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Accident Involving FU4393H / SBY1379X on 03/01/2018 *LKK REF:
CC6/DAI18000431/Kpb3

Attachments: DOC270218.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We hereby confirm acceptance your offer $4,031.45 for settlement of the said claim.
Attached herewith the Letter of Authority and the Discharge Voucher for your perusal.
Thank you.

Best regards.

Vincent Tan

T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861
Hp: 9145 9776

On 27 February 2018 at 12:03, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Hi Vincent,

We refer to the above matter,

We propose settlement as follows: -

|. Cost of Repair{w/G5T) 1 3.424.00

1



