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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 January, 2018 4:52 PM

To: TAN Kwee May

Cc: Admin A; Kalvin Ang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident involving SHD218Z(Trans-cab) and SHC1652B and 31.12.2017

Categories: HMK

Dear Kwee May, 

 

We refer to your below email and the contents were duly noted. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: TAN Kwee May [mailto:kweemay.tan@axa.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 8 January, 2018 4:50 PM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involving SHD218Z(Trans-cab) and SHC1652B and 31.12.2017 

 

Dear Mei Kwan 

 

The case was not assigned to LKK. Was informed by CDGE that they have engaged independent surveyor, hence you 

may invoice to them directly. 

 

Thanks & regards 

 

Kwee May TAN  

Assistant Manager 

Motor (Property) Claims 

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg 

Email: kweemay.tan@axa.com.sg 

DID: 1800 880 4888 

 
 

           

 
 
Please consider the environment before printing this message  

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of 

the message, please notify the sender immediately. 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, January 08, 2018 4:28 PM 

To: TAN Kwee May <kweemay.tan@axa.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Accident involving SHD218Z(Trans-cab) and SHC1652B and 31.12.2017 

 

Dear Kwee May, 

 

Please be informed that we had survey the TP vehicle on 05.01.2018. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: TAN Kwee May [mailto:kweemay.tan@axa.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 8 January, 2018 4:19 PM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involving SHD218Z(Trans-cab) and SHC1652B and 31.12.2017 

 

Hi Mei Kwan 

The case was not assigned to LKK.  

Since there was no survey conducted. Please close file. 

 

Thanks & regards 

 

Kwee May TAN  

Assistant Manager 

Motor (Property) Claims 

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg 

Email: kweemay.tan@axa.com.sg 

DID: 1800 880 4888 

 
 

           

 
 
Please consider the environment before printing this message  

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of 

the message, please notify the sender immediately. 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, January 08, 2018 3:18 PM 

To: TAN Kwee May <kweemay.tan@axa.com.sg> 

Subject: Accident involving SHD218Z(Trans-cab) and SHC1652B and 31.12.2017 

 

Dear Kwee May, 
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We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please be informed that CDGE was contact our surveyor to inspect their vehicle – SHC 1652B on 05.01.2018. 

 

According to them, the notification for PRS was exceed 48 hrs. 

 

Kindly let us have your further instruction please. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

-----Disclaimer----- 

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are 

not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have 

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this 

message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other 

entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  

-----Disclaimer----- 

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are 

not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have 

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this 

message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other 

entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  


