Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October, 2018 5:55 PM

To: Soo Leong Keat; ray@progauto.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); 'Peiwen PROGAUTOQO'

Subject: RE: SKM2959Y - TO FINALIZE LKK REF CC4/EQI18000427/Ahb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to our below email.
For your acceptance please.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

B 7 74

P

" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 July, 2018 2:22 PM
To: Soo Leong Keat

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKM2959Y - TO FINALIZE

Your Ref: TP 0118-4892 Without Prejudice
Dear Leong Keat,
We refer further to the below email and we confirmed in receipt of your LOD through our principal.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we offer settlement as below:



Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 1,693.81

Loss of Rental (5120 x 2 days) S 240.00
GIA Search Fee S 2.00
TOTAL S 1,935.81

Kindly confirm acceptance. Please note that NO DV is required.
Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge
Voucher (for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us
after we have made payment on the settlement sum.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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SERER W Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 February, 2018 12:24 PM

To: Ray Progressive; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SKM2959Y - TO FINALIZE

Without Prejudice

Dear Ray,

We take note of your below email.

We will check and will get back to you.

Thank you.

Hi Adrian,



For your further action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ESES e

RLERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Ray Progressive [mailto:ray@progauto.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 22 February, 2018 12:20 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SKM2959Y - TO FINALIZE

Dear Vic,
Can we finalize this case?

Regards,
Ray

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, January 19, 2018 1:23 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Ray Progressive; 'Wayne Lim'; bhlim@progauto.com.sg; msho@progauto.com.sg; peiwen@progauto.com.sg;
siewwei (siewwei@progauto.com.sg); SUR

Subject: FW: SKM2959Y - TO FINALIZE

Dear Vic,
FYNA-CC4/EQI18000427/Ahb3

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ray Progressive [mailto:ray@progauto.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 19 January 2018 12:12 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@I|kkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Wayne Lim' <wayne@progauto.com.sg>; bhlim@progauto.com.sg; msho@progauto.com.sg; 'Peiwen
3




PROGAUTO' <peiwen@progauto.com.sg>; siewwei@progauto.com.sg
Subject: SKM2959Y - TO FINALIZE

Hi Adrian/ Veron,

Please refer to finalize

Parts $1068.00

Lab $480.00

Total $1548.00
Thank you

Best regard,

Ray

Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6741-5336 Fax: 6741-7208



